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Introduction 

The study of early Islamic history, more perhaps than most 
historical fields, has been plagued by uncertainties about the 
reliability of its written sources. No branch of history is, of 
course, entirely free of such historiographical controversy; but 
the disagreement and debate over sources for early Islamic 
history and their reliability have hung like an ominous cloud 
over the field almost from the moment scholars began scien­
tifically to work it in the mid-nineteenth century, and show 
litde sign of dispersing even today. The persistence of this 
problem is doubtless in part due to the fact that the scientific 
study of early Islam is still a very young subject, scarcely a 
century old; it is also partly attributable to the relatively small 
number of scholars who, in any given generation, choose to 
dedicate themselves to this study. As a result of these factors, 
it is fair to say, the field as a whole remains poorly developed; 
vast areas have never been worked at all, or have only been 
touched on superficially, and much fundamental spadework 
remains to be done before the full outlines of early Islamic 
history will begin to emerge clearly. Under such circumstances 
it is hardly surprising that drastic reinterpretations both of 
early Islamic history itself, and of the role of various sources 
for it, should periodically arise. 

In this case, however, the historiographical debate is more 
than just a reflection of the efforts of a fairly young historical 
field to define itself; rather, it also derives in large measure 
from the nature of the sources themselves. For the great ma­
jority of the information about early Islamic history on which 
modern historians rely is derived not from contemporary doc-
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uments, but from literary compilations that only attained their 
present form a century or even two centuries or more after 
the events they purport to describe. The relatively late date of 
the sources does not necessarily make them fraudulent, of 
course, and it became generally accepted by modern historians 
that some of the information in these sources—perhaps most 
of it—is considerably older material that was preserved and 
transmitted until it found its way into the literary compila­
tions now available to us. But the lateness of the sources does, 
at least, mean that the existence of anachronistic and tenden­
tious accounts of a spurious character that might be woven in 
with more authentic older material cannot be dismissed out 
of hand. As a result, sharp disagreement has persisted among 
historians of Islam on what and how much material in the 
extant sources is older, as it has on the question of how old 
this "older" material actually is and what interests and atti­
tudes it reflects. Finally, it has been asked how—and even 
whether—scholars can discriminate between "authentic" older 
material and tendentious, fabricated, or anachronistic ac­
counts of more recent provenance. 

As already noted, this debate in modern scholarly circles 
goes back virtually to the beginnings of Western historio-
graphical studies. M. J. de Goeje, in his Memoire sur la con-
quete de la Syrie (first edition, Leiden, 1864), decided that 
many of the contradictory historical accounts about the con­
quest of Syria were unreliable, and concluded that only a cer­
tain fraction of them—he favored those purveyed by the his­
torian al-Waqidl—could be accepted as trustworthy. Similarly, 
Julius Wellhausen, in his Prolegomena zur dltesten Geschichte des 
Islams (Berlin, 1899), tried to demonstrate that the accounts 
about the conquests of Iraq transmitted by Sayf ibn cUmar 
were romanticized, filled with evidence of tribal chauvinism, 
chronologically absurd, and in other ways gave an appearance 
of unreliability. For a time such studies seemed to provide the 
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desired critical basis on which the historian could rely when 
evaluating the historical traditions with which he had to work 
in studying the early Islamic period; and for many years (and, 
to a certain extent, even today) "critical method" in working 
with these sources came to mean, for many, simply rejecting 
accounts derived from Sayf ibn tUmar5S collections and rely­
ing on other early authorities, such as al-Waqidl, instead. 

In the meantime, however, there appeared Ignaz Goldzi-
Iier1S classic Muhammedanische Studien (Halle, 1888-90), which 
first demonstrated that among the collections of hadiths (say­
ings) attributed to the prophet Muhammad—even in those 
collections that had been most carefully screened by Muslim 
scholars to sift out forgeries—there were many hadiths that 
careful analysis of content revealed certainly to be products of 
a later period and not authentic utterances of the prophet at 
all. Because the methods used by medieval Arab scholars to 
transmit and verify hadiths were in many respects similar to 
those they used to deal with historical accounts, Goldziher5S 

conclusions cast a shadow of doubt on the reliability of all 
historical accounts. Far more than the studies of de Goeje and 
Wellhausen, therefore, Goldziher5S critique was disturbing in 
its implications for historians of early Islam—or, at least, should 
have been; and ever since his day, scholarship in the field of 
early Islamic history has suffered from what might be called a 
collective schizophrenia, a profound division over the assump­
tions that should properly underlie efforts at historical recon­
struction. Some scholars have treated the Arabic sources as 
fully reliable, adopting only those criticisms that they could 
not in good conscience ignore (e.g., Wellhausen's rejection of 
Sayfs traditions) and picking their way through the remaining 
material according to their own (often not explicit) criteria 
for determining what was and what was not "authentic." Typ­
ical examples of this approach are W. Montgomery Watt's 
studies of the life of the prophet, Muhammad at Mecca and 
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Muhammad at Medina (Oxford, 1953 and 1956). Other scholars 
have adopted a much more skeptical attitude toward the sources 
in the light of Goldziher's conclusions, and have come to de­
nounce more and more of the received corpus of historical 
traditions as spurious or otherwise unreliable, sometimes es­
chewing the study of early Islamic history altogether for stud­
ies of Islamic law or other phenomena that took definitive 
form only in later centuries. We might see in the works of 
Joseph Schacht, Goldziher's main successor in the study of 
Islamic law, the first culmination of this trend. 

It proved much more difficult, however, to find a middle 
ground between these two extremes—a position that neither 
embraced the sources too credulously, nor adopted a sweep­
ing and (because unexamined) unwarranted skepticism to­
ward them. Leone Caetani, in his compendious Annali deWIslam 
(10 vols., Milan, 1905-1926), tried to examine early Islamic 
history with a critical eye to the sources. But many practicing 
historians who dealt with the early Islamic period in the years 
after World War I either saw no need to defend the sources, 
or seemed for one reason or another at a loss to do so, and 
hence chose to pass in silence over the issues at stake. One 
reason for such attitudes was probably the fact that it was 
simply easier to proceed on the assumption that the "stand­
ard" interpretation of early Islamic history was essentially sound 
than it was to undertake the arduous, and perhaps threaten­
ing, task of reconsidering the sources; for to do the latter 
might well require a radical revision of one's view of early 
Islamic history as well. 

There was, however, a reason why historians of early Islam 
could not mount a serious or coherent defense of their sources 
during the first half of the twentieth century, even had they 
wanted to do so. That reason was the generally poor grasp of 
the historiographical tradition itself and of how it had evolved; 
for in order to judge or to comment on the historicity of these 
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sources, one had first to understand clearly how, and why, 
they had come into existence in the first place. Yet at the be­
ginning of the century few detailed studies of important Arab 
historians or of the growth of the historiographical tradition 
had yet been undertaken. True, the latter nineteenth century 
had seen the appearance of Ferdinand Wiistenfeld's Die Ge-
schichtschreiber der Araber und ihre Werke (Gottingen, 1882), 
and at the turn of the century had appeared the first edition 
of Carl Brockelmann's monumental Gesehiehte der arabischen 
Litteratur (Weimar, 1898-1902), but both of these essentially 
provided merely a list of the main early Arab historians and 
their works, with no attempt to examine the interrelationship 
of various writers, the historicity of their work, or the growth 
of the historiographical tradition as a whole. More penetrat­
ing syntheses of Arabic historiography were simply not yet 
feasible in the absence of a full supply of detailed studies. Thus 
we find that even those general works from the early twentieth 
century that were explicitly devoted to Arabic historiography, 
such as David Margoliouth's Lectures on Arabic Historians 
(Calcutta, 1930), have only very vague and general things to 
say about how the historiographical tradition evolved, and 
represent very litde progress over Wiistenfeld's essay of fifty 
years earlier, which had been published before the appearance 
of most of the early critiques of the Arabic sources that had 
generated the historiographical debate in the first place. 

The first wave of historiographical critiques had not fallen 
entirely on deaf ears, however; there was a flurry of interest 
in historiographical research during the first quarter of the 
twentieth century, when such scholars as Josef Horovitz, C. H. 
Becker, and Johann Fiick attempted to unravel in a painstak­
ing and systematic way how particular aspects of the historio­
graphical tradition had developed, or tried to present a fuller 
picture of some of the early Arab historians and their relation 
to other writers before and after them. Into this category can 
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be placed such researches as Horovitz's essay on the use of 
isnads or chains of authorities, Becker's examination of the 
Slra (the standard biography of the prophet Muhammad) and 
its relation to the hadith and other material, and Fuck's mon­
ograph on Ibn Ishaq (Frankfurt, 1925). The motivating as­
sumption underlying this work was the idea that the general 
reliability of the Arabic historiographical tradition, in the face 
of the criticisms raised against it, could only be demonstrated 
by showing that the tradition itself was something that had 
evolved naturally, and was not merely a composite of spurious 
and tendentious fragments pasted together at a much later 
date. In order to show this, however, one had to understand 
the historiographical tradition much more fully, and the ob­
ject of these researches was to help meet this need. 

For reasons that are far from clear, the pace of such detailed 
historiographical research slowed in the period following World 
War I—perhaps because the war itself had left in a shambles 
the European academic establishment, particularly that of 
Germany, which had led the van in these historiographical 
studies. There were a few noteworthy exceptions, of course, 
notably some of the studies by Brockelmann, Horovitz, and 
Robert Brunschvig—but by and large the detailed study of 
historiographical issues seems to have fallen into neglect after 
about 1925, and few new names were to take up the challenge 
for some decades. Evidence of this attitude of neglect can even 
be found in the first edition of the Emydopaedia of Islam, which 
appeared in Leiden between 1913 and 1934. This massive 
reference work did feature biographies of a number of impor­
tant early Arab historians (e.g., Ibn Ishaq, al-Waqidl, Sayf ibn 
1Umar, al-Zuhri, al-Mada'inl, Abu Mikhnaf, TJrwa ibn al-
Zubayr, etc.), but some of these were rather spare first at­
tempts; and of the articles on fundamental historiographical 
topics, such as isnad, hadith, or ta'rikh (dating, history), many 
were very brief and displayed the general lack of sophistication 
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of this branch of Islamic studies. Readers had to await the 
appearance of the Supplement to the first edition, which ap­
peared in 1938, to read the pioneering article on "Ta'rikh" 
(History) by H.A.R. Gibb, one of the relatively few scholars 
to take up the question of historiography in earnest during 
the inter-war period. Among practicing historians dealing with 
the early Islamic period, the general attitude seems to have 
remained, for the most part, one of benign neglect of histo­
riography. Few took up Caetani's lead, and even as late as the 
1970s some authors still found it possible to construct novel 
interpretive histories of early Islam without any reference to 
historiographical issues or methods. M. A. Shaban's Islamic 
History, 600-750 A.D./132 α,Η.^Α New Interpretation (Cam­
bridge, 1971), can be cited as a case in point. 

It was only after World War II that the pace of research on 
early Arabic historiography again quickened and concern for 
the subject spread. Shortly after the war appeared two articles 
that focused attention anew on the relation between Arabic 
legal and historical texts: Brunschvig's "Ibn 'Abdalhakam et 
la conquete de TAfrique du Nord par Ies Arabes" (Faculte des 
Lettres de PUniversite d'Alger, Annates de I'Institut d'Etudes 
Orientales 6 [1942-1947], pp. 108-155), and J. Schacht's "A 
Revaluation of Islamic Traditions" (JRAS, 1949, pp. 143-154). 
But the main impetus to the accelerated pace of historiograph­
ical study was provided by the appearance of three books. The 
first was Franz Rosenthal's A History of Muslim Historiography 
(first edition, Leiden, 1952). Its purpose was not to address 
the debate over the historicity of the sources that most con­
cerned historians, an issue that Rosenthal deliberately and ex-
plicitly sidestepped: ". . . we are not concerned here with the 
value of historical works as source material for the writing of 
the history of a particular period" (p. 6). The author intended, 
rather, to examine the conception of history held by Muslim 
scholars and to trace the development of history as a branch 
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of Arabic literature and science. Nevertheless, Rosenthal's 
contribution provided a fuller treatment of the origins of Ar­
abic historiography than had Gibb's brief survey of the subject 
in the Encyclopaedia of Islam, and began the process of syn­
thesizing the rather large number of isolated studies of de­
tailed aspects of Arabic historiography that had accumulated 
over the preceding decades. A further step, and one of greater 
importance for practicing historians, was taken with the ap­
pearance of the second book, Nabia Abbott's splendid Studies 
in Arabic Literary Papyri, I. Historical Texts (Chicago, 1957). 
This work provided an even more detailed survey of the cru­
cial earliest phases of Arabic historiography, and did so in a 
manner that emphasized, on the basis of papyrological evi­
dence, the generally reliable character of the process by which 
historical accounts were transmitted. The book thus provided 
strong, if still somewhat general, support for the view that the 
Arabic accounts were as a whole reliable as historical sources, 
even if some distortions and spurious material may have crept 
in. 

The third work, however, really represented the culmina­
tion of the long series of diverse efforts to trace the evolution 
of early Arabic historiography in such a way as to be useful 
to the historian. It was 'Abd al-tAzIz al-Duri's The Rise of 
Historical Writing Among the Arabs (Bahth ft nash'at 'ilm al-
ta'rikh 'inda l-'Arab), which appeared in Beirut in 1960. Dim's 
book was, and remains, noteworthy for several reasons. First, 
it provided the most comprehensive overview of the growth 
of early Arabic historiography that had yet appeared. Drawing 
in part on the results of many scattered critical studies and 
monographs devoted to individual traditionists and historio-
graphical issues, the author was able to sketch out a much 
clearer and more highly nuanced picture than had previously 
existed of the rise of various schools of Arabic historical writ­
ing and of their methods. But Duri did not merely synthesize 
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the work of others; he also relied heavily on his own inde­
pendent researches into early Arabic historiography, efforts 
that became manifest not only in this book, but also in a num­
ber of studies of more restricted aspects of the subject that 
appeared over the years. Among them were his articles on 
"The Iraq School of History to the Ninth Century—A Sketch" 
(1962), and "Al-Zuhri: A Study of the Beginnings of History 
Writing in Islam" (1957), as well as his monograph Dirasafi 
strat al-nabi wa-mu 'allifiha Ibn Ishaq (Baghdad, 1965) on Ibn 
Ishaq and his biography of the prophet. 

The Rise if Historical Writing Among the Arabs is especially 
noteworthy because Duri is himself a practicing historian, with 
many fine publications on early Islamic history to his credit 
(see Bibliography). It was therefore natural that in approach­
ing the problem of historiography he should do so with the 
question that historians always want most to have answered 
uppermost in his mind—namely, how reliable are the sources 
under scrutiny as evidence for reconstructing "what actually 
happened"? This concern Duri wove together with his analy­
sis of the earliest historical accounts according to the genre to 
which they belonged (popular story, genealogical tradition, 
tribal "battle-day" narrative, etc.) and according to the meth­
ods used by the various local schools of historical writing that 
emerged in Medina, Iraq, and elsewhere. The result was not 
only a more detailed and sophisticated analysis of the rise of 
early Arabic historiography in general, but also the elabora­
tion for the first time of a set of general guidelines for assess­
ing the reliability of a given account on the basis of its origin 
and its formal characteristics. This made the book particularly 
useful to historians, and also provided more support for those 
who viewed the Arabic sources as essentially reliable for re­
constructing history, since the lack of consistent criteria for 
weeding spurious and tendentious material out of the Arabic 
historiographical tradition had all along been one of the main 
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factors leading skeptics to reject the whole tradition as essen­
tially useless for historians. 

The importance of Dun's book was quickly recognized by 
most serious students of early Islamic history, and its utility 
has endured and doubtless will endure for some time to come. 
Since its appearance in 1960, a great number of additional 
historiographical studies have been undertaken, and the sub­
ject has in some respects changed so greatly that it can hardly 
be considered the same field that Duri worked in the 1950s. 
Some scholars, such as Fuat Sezgin, Ursula Sezgin, Raif 
Khoury, and others, have provided us with highly detailed 
studies of individual transmitters or—in the case of Fuat Sez­
gin and his massive Geschichte des arabisehen Sehrifttum (Lei­
den, 1967—)—with an extensive catalog and summary of the 
whole historiographical tradition for the first four Islamic cen­
turies. The thrust of their work clearly follows that of Abbott 
and Dun, in that they take the historiographical tradition as 
a whole to be an organic development that can be used by 
historians if it is sufficiently well understood. On the other 
hand, scholars imbued with a more skeptical attitude have also 
been active, producing new studies asserting that the historio­
graphical tradition is at best highly suspect, and at worst, use­
less. Albrecht Noth's Quellenkritische Studien zu Themen, For-
men, und Tendenzen friihislamischen Geschichtsiiberlieferung 
(Bonn, 1973) rejects the notion that the different historio­
graphical "schools" of which Duri (and his predecessors) spoke 
used fundamentally different methods of handling material, 
thereby calling into question the notion that one school's view 
of the past might be, in general, more "accurate" than that of 
another. He also develops a much more detailed form-critical 
analysis of the content of early Arabic historical accounts than 
had Duri, emphasizing as he does so the view that the histo­
ricity of material displaying highly formalized characteristics 
is questionable. More recendy still, a radical source criticism 
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has been put forward by several English scholars. In Hagarism 
(Cambridge, 1977), Michael Cook and Patricia Crone present 
the view that the Arabic sources for early Islamic history are 
late, full of contradictions, and essentially useless for recon­
structing the religious concepts of early Islam; while John 
Wansbrough's The Sectarian Milieu (Oxford, 1978) goes even 
further, arguing that the sources represent later religious po­
lemic and can tell us nothing about the history of the early 
Islamic era. That is, the authors assert explicidy and uncom­
promisingly the skeptical thesis that had been implicit since 
the late nineteenth century, but had only been rather timidly 
embraced by practicing Islamic historians. 

The debate over the historicity of the Arabic sources thus 
continues to rage, and it is yet too early to tell what the issue 
of the debate will be. Pending its outcome, however, 'Abd 
al-'AzIz al-Durl's The Rise of Historical Writing Among the Ar­
abs will certainly continue to hold an important place in the 
literature as the clearest and most historically useful exposition 
of the general development of Arabic historiography, even if 
certain details in the picture he has drawn must be modified 
by more recent research. And, if it turns out that those who 
argue for the general historicity of the Arabic sources are ul­
timately vindicated in their debate with the skeptics, it will be 
in no small part because of the convincing picture Duri has 
drawn. It is therefore a pleasure to welcome the appearance 
of this book, so useful as an introduction to the Arabic his-
toriographical tradition and so important as a contribution to 
the long-standing debate, in English translation. 

Fred M. Donner 





Note on the English Translation 

In his introduction Professor Donner has discussed cAbd 
a]-'Aziz al-Duri's work and its place in the modern scholar­
ship on Arab historical writing. Here I will limit my remarks 
to considerations which have dictated the course I have fol­
lowed in editing and translating the book. 

As published in 1960, TheRise of Historical Writing Among 
the Arabs consisted of two parts: a study of the genesis and 
early growth of Arab historical writing, and a copious collec­
tion of extracts from medieval historical texts. This latter sec­
tion not only documented points raised in Duri's study, but 
also exposed the reader, in a direct way, to the style, method, 
and content of the historical writings of various scholars of 
early Islamic times. In the present volume, however, only the 
study of early Arab historical writing has been included, since 
the historical texts in English form would serve poorly the 
purposes for which these selections were intended. At the same 
time, I have tried to make the English edition more useful to 
students and non-Arabic-speaking historians by supplement­
ing the notes to the original Arabic text. References to schol­
arly works, in both Arabic and western languages, on early 
Arab historical writing have been added: some earlier studies 
are cited with the absence of the section of historical texts in 
mind, but most are intended to guide the reader to more re­
cent literature pertaining to points raised by Professor Duri, 
and to subsequent research published by the author himself 
on these subjects. I have also added further references to pri­
mary sources where this has seemed appropriate, and have 
tried to elucidate points and allusions in the text with which 
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a foreign reader may not be familiar. To differentiate this ma­
terial from the original, all additions have been set within square 
brackets. Notes not in the original Arabic text are lettered 
rather than numbered. 

A special problem arose with the technical terms of medie­
val Islamic scholarship which frequently appear in the text. I 
have preferred, for the most part, to leave these in their Arabic 
forms, since they convey particular nuances, ideas, and con­
ceptions which cannot but be obscured by rendering them 
into the terminology of another culture which approaches nei­
ther history nor historical writing in the same way. Also, I felt 
that as an introduction to the subject the translation should 
serve to familiarize the reader with the historiographical vo­
cabulary of medieval Islam. To facilitate this, the index indi­
cates in italic characters the pages where the reader can find 
definitions or explanations for the technical terminology used 
in the text. 

The Arabic text itself presented a further problem. Circum­
stances at the time made it impossible for the author person­
ally to supervise the book through every stage of the printer's 
work, or always to refer to the same edition of a given source. 
In editing the work, I have corrected typographical errors in 
the text and notes wherever I have found them,1 and have 
tried to standardize the notes and to refer the reader to better 
editions of texts published since 1960. Simple corrections have 
been made without comment, but wherever a change has in­
volved an actual addition, such material, as above, has been 
set within square brackets. In a few places, bracketed material 
represents departures from the text based on better editions 

1 Some of these I should point out to readers who may notice what seem 
to be discrepancies in comparing this translation with the Arabic original: 
e.g., read idda for 'adam on p. 24, 1. 11 of the Arabic text, ma'a asfaribt 
for ma'a asfaliihu on p. 45,1. 11, al-Hijr for al-bujja on p. 65,1. 9, al-qatima 
for al-qaima on p. 98, 1. 14, ahl al-Taman for abl al-nabi on p. Ill, 1. 6,fl 
l-ta'rikh for wa-l-ta'rikh on p. 136,1. 18. 
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for quotations from certain primary sources published since 
1960 (pp. 77, 84), or on Professor Duri's suggestions for 
limited clarification or revision (pp. 67, 91). 

In the preparation of this translation I have benefited greatly 
from the co-operation of Professor Duri himself, who read a 
draft of the entire translation and made suggestions for a 
number of improvements to the text and additions to the notes. 
I am also grateful to Professors Fred M. Donner and R. Ste­
phen Humphreys for their own careful reading of the trans­
lation and suggestions for changes and improvements. For er­
rors and shortcomings which remain, however, I alone bear 
responsibility. 

Beirut Lawrence I. Conrad 
1 February 1983 
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Preface 

Historical writing and the theories concerning it have been 
the subject of particular interest among historians in recent 
years, due to the important ways they affect both historical 
research itself and the direction in which such research is ori­
ented. Discussion of this subject is no longer limited to asking 
whether history is a science or an art; or, more properly speak­
ing, to efforts to relate history to one of the two fundamental 
fields of knowledge. Instead, informed opinion has focused its 
attention on the importance of history as a vital concern in its 
own right, with its own fundamental principles, research 
methods, and goals, and its own particular importance among 
the various fields of knowledge. Indeed, some have even called 
the modern age the "Age of History." 

Historical writing has been affected by the economic, social, 
and intellectual revolutions of modern times, as is manifest in 
the growth of the various fields of historical inquiry, and in 
speculation on the philosophy of history and on the ways the 
subject can be approached. The general crisis through which 
the West has passed since the dawn of this century has had an 
obvious impact on historical studies. Before this crisis it was 
customary to view Western civilization as the climax in the 
development of the civilization of all mankind. It was also 
customary to regard all the history of mankind from a West­
ern perspective, as if the pivot of world history was the West 
and all other history was merely prefatory or marginal to that 
of the West. But the two World Wars and the great changes 
that accompanied them made it clear that Western civilization 
was only one stage of many in the course of human civiliza-
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tion, and that the ascendancy of the West, which became man­
ifest especially in the nineteenth century, was itself but a his­
torical phase which was rapidly drawing to a close. Realization 
of this was reinforced by the appearance of new forces in the 
world, with their own cultural oudooks and achievements, and 
a vital role of their own to play in shaping the future of man­
kind. This is true of the United States, and also applies to the 
rise of the Soviet Union and the important roles both nations 
have played in world affairs, both cultural and otherwise. 

This was also an era characterized by nationalist movements 
and revivals, especially in Asia, and by the emergence onto the 
stage of world events—in particular after the Second World 
War—of ancient peoples who adopted cultural perspectives 
imbued with their own distinctive character and historical roots. 
This shook the Western theory maintaining that Western civ­
ilization would come to dominate the world and efface older 
stagnant civilizations, and that, culturally speaking, the world 
was destined sooner or later to become Westernized. 

These and other developments led to a reconsideration of 
the various historical theories and of the very concept of his­
torical writing. If history is essential to the understanding of 
the present, then these monumental changes in the world could 
not be understood from the study of Western history. More­
over, general developments in the first half of this century 
made it clear that Western civilization is not the ultimate goal 
of cultural development and has not been the only influential 
civilization in the world. These developments also demon­
strated that the Western view of history could not retain its 
parochial character, viewing matters only from a Western an­
gle, if it wished to achieve a comprehensive understanding of 
the present. 

There is another view that was overturned as a result of 
these developments. It is now clear that an understanding of 
the present cannot be achieved through an understanding of 
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the immediately preceding period by itself, and that the grad­
ual advance of history cannot in itself explain these great rev­
olutions, cultural or otherwise. Rather, preceding eras have 
sometimes had far-reaching effects on present developments. 
In other words, since the overall historical evolution of man­
kind may have had a great influence on these developments, 
the study of the great revivalist movements demands a return 
to the consideration of the fundamental roots of cultures and 
peoples. 

All of these factors have engendered a new view of the dis­
cipline of history. This is a view which is worldwide in out­
look to the extent that it places importance on other civiliza­
tions in addition to that of the West, and calls attention to 
the inter-relationship of civilizations and the reciprocal ex­
change of influence in the course of their interactions. This 
new view is also regional to the extent that it emphasizes the 
importance of studying the history of a given people on its 
own terms while keeping in mind overall historical develop­
ments. In this way it has become evident that it is necessary 
to rewrite the histories of certain countries afresh, and to do 
so in a way that will reflect the orientation of the new histor­
ical awareness in these countries and contribute to the under­
standing of their reawakening. This, in turn, places the pri­
mary responsibility for the writing of the history of any people 
on its own historians if a sound view of its history is to be 
achieved. 

As Arabs, we may here ask ourselves where Arab history 
stands with regard to these new intellectual perspectives. We 
can state unequivocally that we have only just begun to re­
solve the task at hand, for many recent works are from the 
pens of outsiders, whether Western or Eastern, authors who 
grew up in other cultures and foreign environments, and it is 
only to be expected that their writings should be affected by 
the intellectual perspectives prevailing in these cultures and 
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environments. Some of these writings have served historical 
studies, but others have set forth foreign views or perspectives 
which we initially accepted, but which now must be radically 
revised. We have a pressing need to understand modem the­
ories and perspectives on historical writing, so that we may 
benefit from the insights they offer and make use of them in 
our own historical research. This does not mean, of course, 
that we can simply follow in their footsteps, or superimpose 
the Western method of historical research letter for letter onto 
our own studies. But we can make use of many of the schools 
of thought and research methods we find, as a preliminary 
step towards the establishment of historical methods derived 
from the essential character of Islamic historical studies. 

It is particularly important that we pay attention to the "his­
tory of history"; that is, to the evolution of historical writing 
and to the historical methods and ideas which have accom­
panied this evolution. And here one of our most pressing needs 
is to study and research the history of history among the Ar­
abs, for without this, critical historical writing is impossible. 
We would not be able to scrutinize our sources, to criticize 
the different accounts, and to distinguish what is reliable from 
what is doubtful, what is primary from what is secondary, and 
what is genuine from what is fabricated. Without a critical 
study of historians and the evolution of historical writing among 
the Arabs, we would not even be able to distinguish historical 
accounts from mere stories. We need to understand the rea­
sons for the evolution of historical writing among the Arabs, 
to perceive the factors which motivated it, as well as the per­
spectives of those who wrote it, their historical ideas, their 
method of examining various accounts and setting down a 
text, and their view of the importance of history and its role 
in cultural activities and in public life. It is important that we 
be cognizant of the various factors which led to fabrication 
and confusion in the writing of history, from the effects of 
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political and partisan currents in society, to the role of story­
tellers, the impact of the Shu'ubiya movement, and religious 
influences. It is also important that we consider the effect of 
general developments on the development of historical writ­
ing. Without the study of these aspects of the subject it would 
hardly be possible to understand the worth of the historical 
sources available to us, or for us to criticize the research done 
by others, or for us to free our history from the defects which 
have marred it in the past and still do so at present. 

In this domain it will not help us to utilize the technical 
methodology of hadith for the study of history, or to place 
our faith on the high reputations which some historians enjoy. 
Al-Tabari, for example, is one of our outstanding sources; but 
a perusal of what he wrote about early Islam shows us that in 
fact we have before us a melange of the historians and other 
authors on whom al-Tabari relied, like Abu Mikhnaf, Sayf ibn 
cUmar, Ibn al-Kalbl, cAwana ibn al-Hakam, Nasr ibn Mu-
zahim, al-Mada'ini, 'Urwa ibn al-Zubayr, al-Zuhri, Ibn Is-
haq, al-Waqidi, Wahb ibn Munabbih, Ka'b al-Ahbar, and so 
forth. They differ in accuracy, outlook, style, and method of 
presentation; and each of them requires a special historical 
study. 

Let us take a specific subject, the biography of the Prophet 
Muhammad, as an example. The earliest sources available to 
us are the Stra of Ibn Ishaq and the MaghAzi of al-Waqidi, 
followed by Ibn Sacd and al-Tabari, after which we might 
turn to late sources like Ibn Sayyid al-Nas ('Uyun al-athar) 
and Ibn Kathir (Al-Bidaya wa-l-nihaya). But although this may 
at first appear to be a reasonable way to proceed, it in fact 
places us on perilous ground fraught with danger. The Sira of 
Ibn Ishaq (which was revised by Ibn Hisham) is the oldest 
biography of Muhammad to come down to us, followed by 
the Maghazi of al-Waqidi. On a close examination of Ibn Is-
haq we see that the accounts and reports which he transmits 
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differ in importance. The solid historical material in his book 
is derived primarily from al-Zuhri and certain scholars of ha-
dith, while another component portion of his reports is taken 
from popular stories dominated by elements of entertainment, 
piety, or boasting, and accompanied by a large amount of 
fabricated poetry. A third portion is derived from the IsraUiyat 
and the legends and reports of Wahb ibn Munabbih, espe­
cially in matters related to the pre-Islamic period. At this point 
the differing value and importance of these three component 
parts which provided biographical material for Ibn Ishaq be­
come apparent; in a serious study one cannot be content with 
citing the reports of Ibn Ishaq without distinguishing be­
tween the three elements mentioned above. 

From another point of view, we might say that Ibn Sayyid 
al-Nas or Ibn KathIr are late, that their information is taken 
from earlier well-known historians, and that, consequently, they 
are of secondary importance. This may be true for many of 
the reports these two authorities relate, but on close exami­
nation we find that each of them contains primary materials 
derived from historians earlier than Ibn Ishaq—such as the 
generation of al-Zuhri—that are not found in the biography 
of Ibn Hisham, and in this way we can acquire important 
additional historical material. After all this we can, by study­
ing the early and subsequent sources, perceive the evolving 
conception among Arab historians of the Prophet's biog­
raphy. When we compare the Sira of Ibn Hisham with 'Uyiin 
al-athar, for example, we witness a shift from simple historical 
reports in the early sources (e.g., tUrwa ibn al-Zubayr and al-
Zuhri) to accounts in which the elements of piety and reli­
gious sanctity are predominant, and in which religious senti­
ment and a tendency to exaggerate are strongly intertwined 
with the historical view of the narrator. In such manner we 
can undertake a truly historical study of the Prophet's life 
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founded on a sound evaluation of the sources and on a critical 
historical approach to the accounts in which this material has 
been preserved. 

However, the study of this subject is difficult and trouble­
some since the primary historical writings have not come down 
to us in their complete form; rather, what we have from them 
are only selections scattered in later historical works. This means 
that we must collect and organize these selections so as to 
obtain an approximate idea of the structure of these earliest 
sources. Such an endeavor implies the reclassification of the 
historical materials which have survived to modern times, es­
pecially those for the first three centuries after the Hijra, and 
tracing them back to their original sources-all in all, a diffi­
cult, slow, and perilous task. 

There is a second difficulty: namely, that these selections 
are usually (with rare exceptions) attributed to their original 
authors without reference to the works from which later writ­
ers took them. This compels us to resort to a great deal of 
supposition and conjecture as we attempt to gain knowledge 
about the original sources from which these selections are taken. 
Moreover, even after all this effort we are likely to obtain only 
broad outlines, which may or may not form a coherent whole, 
of these earlier historical compositions. 

In spite of these difficulties, it is my feeling that one cannot 
study Arab history without undertaking such an endeavor, or 
without reorganizing the historical materials according to their 
sources. Otherwise, history will be mixed with legend and belles-
lettres, and early accounts and later reports will be regarded 
as being of equal value. Neither the logic of history nor his­
torical method will permit this. 

The following pages represent a first attempt to study the 
evolution of historical writing among the Arabs, a collection 
of sketches linked both by chronological period—the first three 
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centuries after the Hijra—and by their unity of subject. In the 
first introductory essay I have dealt with the rise of historical 
writing and its development to the end of the third century 
A.H.; the general and summary manner in which I have done 
so makes this section virtually a collection of biographies elu­
cidating the general lines along which the discipline devel­
oped. The second essay deals with the evolution of the histor­
ical school of Medina as embodied in the works of its 
forerunner, tUrwa ibn al-Zubayr, and its true founder, al-
Zuhri. This section helps us to understand the origins of the 
biography of the Prophet. The third essay deals with Wahb 
ibn Munabbih as a storyteller and narrator primarily inter­
ested in legendary tales. His influence appears both in the 
IsmiliyAt and in stories about the pre-Islamic period, and 
likewise he represents the outlook of the tradition of Yemenite 
legend. I have discussed this in order to make it clear that he 
did not have a serious influence on the writing of the Proph­
et's biography, as some Orientalists have believed. The study 
of the Prophet's biography was developed by historians from 
among the scholars of hadith, not by storytellers. The legend­
ary element seeped into the Prophet's biography at a later 
time, and was subject to criticism by the historians. 

The fourth essay deals with the evolution of the historical 
school of Iraq (Kufa and Basra), the other school of history 
among the Arabs. This school arose independently, from roots 
which differed from those of the Medinan school, and re­
vealed the effect of particular circumstances, conditions, and 
motives associated with the tribal perspectives which existed 
within the newly established Islamic framework. It is my view 
that the evolution of historical writing among the Arabs can 
be traced to these two schools in Medina and Iraq. 

In the fifth essay I turn to the motives which led to the rise 
of historical writing among the Arabs, and to the historical 
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views and ideas which they wished to express and embodied 
in their writings. 

We are passing through a period of comprehensive revival, 
and I hope that historical studies will have their own role and 
influence in this auspicious period. 

tAbd al-tAzIz al-Duri 



CHAPTER ONE 

The Rise of History Among the 

Arabs and Its Development During 

the First Three Centuries A.H. 

I. 

Among the Arabs, historical writing has been an integral 
part of general cultural development.1 Its links with the dis-

1 For some general works on historical writing among the Arabs, see Fer­
dinand Wiistenfeld, Die Geschichtsehreiber der Araber und ihre Werke (Gottin-
gen, 1882); Carl Brockelmann, Gesehkhte der arabischen Literatur (Weimar 
and Berlin, 1898-1902); Supplement (Leiden, 1937-1942); 2nd ed. (Leiden, 
1943-49); Johann Fiick, Muhammad ibn Ishaq: literarhistorisehe Untersuehun-
gen (Frankfurt am Main, 1925); Josef Horovitz ["The Earliest Biographies 
of the Prophet and Their Authors," Islamk Culture, I (1927), pp. 535ff.; II 
(1928), pp. 22fF., 164fF., 495fF.;] translated by Husayn Nassar as Al-Maghazi 
al-ΰΐά wa-mu'allifiiha (Cairo, 1949); D. S. Margoliouth, Leaures on Arabk 
Historians (Calcutta, 1930); H.A.R. Gibb, "Ta'rikh," in EI1, Supplement 
(Leiden, 1938), pp. 233ff. [reprinted in his Studks on the Cirilizatwn of Islam, 
edited by Stanford J. Shaw and William R. Polk (Boston, 1962), pp. 108ft'.]; 
Regis Blachere, Histoire de la litterature arabe (Paris, 1952-66); Franz Rosen­
thal, A History of Muslim Historiography (Leiden, 1952); [2nd ed. (Leiden, 
1968). See also Ignazio Guidi, "L'Historiographie chez Ies semites," Revue 
biblique, VI (1906), pp. 509fF.; Israel Friedlander, "Muhammedanische Ge-
schichtskonstruktionen," Beitrage zur Kenntnis des Orients, IX (1910), pp. 
17ff.; Emile Amar, "Prolegomenes a l'etude des historiens arabes par Khalil 
ibn Aibak as-Safadi ,"Journal asiatique, IOth Series, XVII (1911), pp. 251ff.; 
XVIII (1911), pp. 5ff.; XIX (1912), pp. 243ff.; Rudi Paret, Die kgendare 
Maghazi-Literatur: arabisehe Dkhtungen Uber dk muslimisehen Kriegsziige zu 
Mohammeds Zeit (Tubingen, 1930); G. Richter, Dk Gesehkhtsbtld der ara­
bischen Historiker des Mittelalters (Tiibingen, 1933); translated by M. Saber 
Khan as "Medieval Arabic Historiography," Islamk Culture, XXXIII (1959), 
pp. 240ff.; XXXIV (1960) pp. 139ff.; Ilse Lichtenstadter, "Arabic and Islamic 
Historiography," Muslim World, XXXV (1945), pp. 126ff.; Zeki Velidi To-
gan, "Kritische GeschichtsaufFassung in der islamischen Welt des Mittelal-
ters," Proceedings of the Twenty-Second Congress if Orientalists, edited by Zeki 
Velidi Togan (Istanbul, 1953-57), I, 76ff.; translated by M. S. Khan as 'The 
Concept of Critical Historiography in the Islamic World of the Middle Ages," 
Islamk Studies, XTV (1975), pp. 175ff.; Julian Obermann, "Early Islam," in 



The Rise of History Among the Arabs 13 

cipline of hadith and with belles-lettres are particularly strong 
and deserve special attention. Moreover, the rise of Islam, the 
subsequent creation of an empire, the clash of various views 
and cultural currents, and the development and experiences of 
the new Islamic community, or umma, are all of vital concern 
to us if we are to understand the earliest stages in the devel­
opment of historical writing in this milieu. 

The Idea of History in the AncientNearEast, edited by Julian Obermann (New 
Haven, 1955), pp. 237ff.; B. Spuler, "Islamische und abendlandische Ge-
schichtschreibung: Ein Grundsatz-Betrachtung," Saeetdum, VI (1955), pp. 
125ff.; Nabia Abbott, Studies in Arabic Literary Papyri (Chicago, 1957-72), 
I, 5ff.; Joseph de Somogyi, 'The Development of Arabic Historiography," 
JSS, III (1958), pp. 373ff.; Fuat Sezgin, Geschiehte des arabischen Schrifitums 
(Leiden, 1967—), I, 235ff.; Ignaz Goldziher, "Historiography in Arabic Lit­
erature," in his Gesammelte Sehriften, edited by Joseph de Somogyi (Hilde-
sheim, 1967-73), III, 359ff.; Hamida Murtaza, "The Origin of the Muslim 
Historiography," Journal of the Pakistan Historical Society, XVI (1968), pp. 
198ff.; Albrecht Noth, "Isfahan-Nihawand: eine quellenkritische Studie zur 
friihislamischen Historiography," ZDMG, CXVIH (1968), pp. 274ff.; K. Jahn, 
"Universalgeschichte im islamischen Raum," in Mensch und Weltgeschichte: 
Zur Geschichte der Universalgeschichtsschreibung, edited by A. Randa (Salzburg 
and Munich, 1969), pp. 145ff.; Walther Braune, "Historical Consciousness 
in Islam," in Theobgy and Law in Islam, edited by Gustave E. von Grunebaum 
(Wiesbaden, 1971), pp. 37ff.; D. M. Dunlop, Arab Civilization to AD. 1500 
(London, 1971), pp. 70ff.; Gemot Rotter, ccAbu Zur'a ad-Dimasql (st. 281/ 
894) und das Problem der friihen arabischen Geschichtsschreibung in Sy-
rien," Die Welt des Orients, VI (1971), pp. 80fF.; Albrecht Noth, "Der Cha-
rakter der ersten grossen Sammlungen von Nachrichten zur friihen Kalifen-
zeit," Der Islam, XLVII (1971), pp. 168fF.; idem, Quellenkritische Studien zu 
Themen, Pormen und Tendenzen friihislamischer Geschichtsiiberlitferung, I: The-
men und Formen (Bonn, 1973); idem, "Die literarisch iiberlieferten Vertrage 
der Eroberungszeit als historische Quellen fur die Behandlung der Unter-
worfenen Nicht-Muslims durch ihre neuen muslimischen Oberherren," Stu-
dien zum Minderheitenproblem im Islam (Bonn, 1973), I, 282ff.; Gemot Rot­
ter, "Formen der friihen arabischen Geschichtsschreibung," in Deutsche 
Orientalistik am Beispiel TUbingens, edited by Gemot Rotter (Tubingen and 
Basel, 1974), pp. 63ft'.; Nisar Ahmed Faruqi, "Some Methodological Aspects 
of the Early Muslim Historiography," Islam and the Modern Age, VI (1975), 
pp. 88ff.; Tarif Khalidi, Islamic Historiography: the Histories of Mas'ΰάϊ (Al­
bany, 1975); Claude Cahen, "Notes sur l'historiographie dans la communaute 
musulmane medievale," REI, XLIV (1976), pp. 81ff.; John Wansbrough, The 
Sectarian Milieu: Content and Composition of Islamic Salvation History (Oxford, 
1978). On related literary developments in early Islamic times, see William 
Ma^ais, "Les Origines de la prose litteraire arabe," Revue afiicaine, LXVIII 
(1927), pp. 12ft".; Ruth Stellhorn Mackensen,"Arabic Books and Libraries in 
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Although it was in early Islamic times that historical writing 
appeared among the Arabs, elements of cultural continuity 
oblige us to turn our attention back to the pre-Islamic herit­
age. Both nomadic and other more settled societies existed in 
the Arabian peninsula in the period of the Jahillya; and al­
though the satisfactory information available to us is meager 
and generally the product of later times, we will consider it 
briefly here by way of introduction to the present study. 

Inscriptions and carvings in southern Arabia attest to the 
emergence of four kingdoms during the period extending from 
1200 B.C. to 527 A.D. These kingdoms all followed similar 
paths of development. They began as theocracies ruled by a 
priest-king, or mukarrib, exercising both religious and tem­
poral power, and then gradually evolved into secular king­
doms ruled by families of warriors and landowners.2 These 
kingdoms left inscriptions which, based on what we have 
learned so far, are datable to the period extending from the 
eighth century B.C. to the seventh century A.D. These inscrip­
tions record a variety of actions, such as acts of charity and 

the Umaiyad Period," AJSL, LII (1935-36), pp. 245ff.; LIII (1936-37), pp. 
239ff.; LIV (1937-38), pp. 41ff.; Franz Rosenthal, The Technique and Ap­
proach if Muslim Scholarship (Rome, 1947); C. A. Nallino, LaLittirature arabe 
des engines a I'epoque de la dynastic umayyaAe, translated by Charles Pellat 
(Paris, 1950); Regis Blachere, "Regards sur la litterature narrative en arabe 
au Ier siecle de l'hegire (= VIIe s.J.-C.)," Semitica, VI (1956), pp. 75ff.; 
Franz Rosenthal, Knowledge Tnumphant (Leiden, 1970). For some of the 
events which will frequently reappear in this book, the following works offer 
important historiographical discussions: Julius Wellhausen, Prolegomena zur 
dltesten Geschichte des Islam, published in his Skizzen tend Vorarbeiten, VI (Berlin, 
1899), pp. 3ff.; M. J. de Goeje, Memoire sur la conquete de la Syrie, 2nd ed. 
(Leiden, 1900); W. Sarasin, Das BildAlis bei der Historikem der Sunna (Basel, 
1907); W. Montgomery Watt, Muhammad at Mecca (Oxford, 1953); idem, 
Muhammad at Medina (Oxford, 1956); Erling Ladewig Petersen, 'Alt and 
Mu 'amya in Early Arabic Tradition (Copenhagen, 1964); Elias S. Shoufani, 
Al-Riddah and the Muslim Conquest of Arabia (Toronto, 1972); Fred M. Don-
ner, "The Bakr b. Wa'il Tribes and Politics in Northeastern Arabia on the 
Eve of Islam," Studia Islamica, LI (1980), pp. 5fF.; idem, The EaHy Islamic 
Conquests (Princeton, 1981).] 

2 Jacques Ryckmans, L'lnstitution monarchique a I'Arabie meridionale (Lou-
vain, 1951), pp. 25fF. 
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piety, submission of tax payments, irrigation projects, the 
building of walls and fortifications, and military campaigns.3 

Although some of these inscriptions are religious in nature, 
others are essentially efforts to record human actions and per­
petuate the memory of important deeds.4 In these inscriptions 
we at first find a confused method of dating events; but later 
on a fixed calendar beginning with the year 115 B.C. was in­
troduced, leading to a fixed system of dating.5 This develop­
ment, along with the interest in recording human actions, may 
have inspired the emergence of some measure of historically 
minded thinking. Al-HamdanI lends credence to this possibil­
ity when he refers to royal documents and Himyarite records 
that were preserved and consulted again later,6 and to the zu-
bur, the documents and genealogical records which some fam­
ilies and clans preserved.7 

3 Repertoire d'epigraphie semitique, vols. V-VII1 edited by J. Ryckmans (Paris, 
1929-50), nos. 2695, 2706, 2789, 2975, 2999, 3021, 3391, 3943. 

4 Ryckmans, Llmtitutim tmmarchique, pp. 71ff., 77; RES, nos. 3858, 3943; 
Corpus inscriptionum semiticarum, Part IV (Paris, 1889-1931), no. 6215; 
G. Ryckmans, "Inscriptions Sub-Arabes," LeMuseon, XLV (1932), pp. 294f.; 
Sidney Smith, "Events in Arabia in the 6th Century A.D.," BSOAS, XVI (1954), 
p. 431. 

5 Ryckmans, L'lnstitution monarchiqm, p. 282. 
6 In his account of a Yemenite scholar, al-Hamdani says that the man was 

"the heir to whatever written accounts of their learning that the kings of 
Himyar had stored away in their treasuries," and that "he read the old zubur 
of the Himyarites and their ancient inscriptions in their musnad alphabet." 
See his Al-Lklil, vol. I, edited by Oscar Lofgren (Uppsala, 1954), p. 5. He 
also mentions that genealogies of the descendants of al-Hamyasa' lVere re­
corded in the treasuries of the Himyarites, as were the genealogies of the 
kings descended from 'Amr ibn Hamdan"; Iklil, X, edited by Muhibb al-Diri 
al-Khatib (Cairo, 1368/1949), p. 30. 

7 Al-Hamdani says, concerning the genealogies of the La'wis, 'The ge­
nealogies of the La'wis are based on solid documentation (muqayyadat al-
usul) . . . I have taken them on their authority related from an ancient record 
(zabur) in the handwriting of Ahmad ibn Musa"; Iklil, X, 111. Elsewhere he 
says that he has taken the genealogy of Banu La'wa "that was related on their 
authority in their own time in the town (Rayda) and based on the records 
(zabur) they possessed. This genealogy has been compared with what Hisham 
ibn Muhammad ibn al-Sa'ib al-Kalbi and other genealogists have related"; 
Iklil, X, 119f. He also says, "The Marwanids of the Yemen . . . act according 
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Yemenite accounts found in the primary literary sources, 
however, are generally of a legendary character, to such an 
extent that even the events of the sixth century A.D., which 
was then the relatively recent past, are muddled.8 In these 
sources we find, in place of any reliable accounts, narrators 
like Wahb ibn Munabbih (d. 114/732) and 'Ubayd ibn Sharya,3 

who furnish us with a fanciful romantic story of the history 
of the Yemen which is an amalgamation of popular fables and 
Israiliyat, or tales of the ancient Israelites.b In this way they 
attempted to glorify the Yemenite Arabs, ascribing to them 
glorious achievements in war, craftsmanship, language, liter­
ature, and even religion—all in order to prove that they had 
surpassed the Arabs of the north in such achievements, or that 
they were in no way inferior to them in these respects.9 They 
set forth these accounts of their own past in a style which 
resembles the style of the stories in the ayyam al-'arab, the 
"Battle-Days" of the Arab tribes, including a very ample meas­
ure of forged verse to strengthen the impression made by the 
story. This is a phenomenon which calls for further attention. 
Its causes appear to be associated with the circumstances in 

to the genealogies that their ancestors set down and preserved by transmission 
from one illustrious ancestor to the next"; Iklil, X, 30f. [On the zubur, see 
EI1, IV, 1184f. (J. Horovitz).] 

8 In the opening section of his IkHl (I, 4), al-Hamdanl criticizes the histor­
ical accounts about the Yemen and says, "I found most people stumbling 
about in lost confusion, as the blackest darkness surrounded them in the dead 
of the night." He considers the lack of precision in chronicling events to be 
an element contributing to this confusion. 

a [On Wahb ibn Munabbih, see Chapter Three below. 'Ubayd ibn Sharya 
was an oft-quoted transmitter of reports who supposedly died in the mid-first 
century A.H. Abbott (Studies, I, 9ff.) discusses him in detail and considers him 
to be a historical figure, but other scholars have raised serious doubts as to 
whether he was any more than a fictitious character to whom many folkloric 
tales were attributed. See F. Krenkow, 'The Two Oldest Books on Arabic 
Folklore," IslamK Culture, II (1928), pp. 234ff.; EP, III, 937 (Franz Rosen­
thal).] 

b [On this literature, see EP, IV, 21 If. (G. Vajda).] 
9 Ibn Hisham, Kitab al-tijan fi muliik Htmyar wa-l-Taman, edited by 

F. Krenkow (Haydarabad, A.H. 1347), pp. 35, 47f., 52f., 74, 86f., 110, 162. 
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which the Arabs found themselves in the early Islamic period. 
Political circumstances and geographical factors certainly ex­
erted an influence in this, since partisan feeling and rivalry 
between the northern Arabs (Mudar) and southern Arabs 
(Yemen) were most particularly responsible for such reports 
of the past as these. These Yemenite narratives may in turn 
have been partly responsible for the partisan spirit which arose 
among the genealogists of the north.10 The remoteness of 
southern Arabia may have deterred the learned men of the 
north from traveling to Yemen and gathering information di­
rectly from the area.11 Moreover, these early narrators, or ru-
wat, were more nearly storytellers than they were historians. 
Thus, the accounts of Yemen that have come down to us are 
of little value and devoid of historical conception. Yet, from 
another point of view, it is likely that the idea of fixed dating 
(the calendar) among the Yemenites had an influence in the 
establishment of a fixed calendar (the Hijra dating system) 
among the Muslims.12 

In the north of the peninsula, the Lakhmid kings had 
"books," preserved in the churches of al-Hira, which con­
tained accounts of the Arabs of the city, their genealogies, and 
biographies of their rulers. Similarly, they were familiar with 
many Persian accounts of the Iranian past.13 But although 

10Al-HamdanI (Ikltl, I, 4) considers the partisan feelings, or 'asabiya, of 
the genealogists of Iraq and Syria to be one of the factors that contributed 
to the confusion over the genealogy of the Yemenites, and says that "the 
method of the genealogists of Iraq and Syria is similar, in that they abbreviate 
the genealogies of Kahlan and Mllik ibn Himyar in order to make the num­
ber of their ancestors correspond to the number ascribed to the sons of Isma'Il." 
[I.e., they compress Yemenite lines of descent to avoid conceding that the 
great families of the south are of greater antiquity than those of the north.] 

11 Al-HamdanI, Iklil, X, 30. About the northern chroniclers, he says that 
"they have made very few journeys to see their counterparts living in Yemen; 
and in the path followed by their learned men they encountered naught but 
some leavings from departed caravans"; Iklil, I, 4. 

12 Al-SuyiitI, Al-Shamartkh fi 'ilm al-ta'rikh, edited by C. F. Seybold (Lei­
den, 1894), p. 9. 

13 Al-Tabarf, Ta'rikh al-rusul wa-l-muliik (Cairo: HusaynIya Press, A.H. 1336), 
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some historians in later periods made use of these books and 
accounts in their own works, we find nothing which indicates 
that the Arabs of al-Hira themselves had any clear conception 
of history. 

The Arabs of the north had oral accounts of stories about 
their gods, and also accounts of their social affairs and their 
great exploits. The principal part of these accounts are con­
cerned with their raiding expeditions and battles (ayyam) and 
their genealogies. These accounts are intimately related to the 
organization, views, and customs of society, as is reflected most 
prominently by the ideas of muruwwa, the totality of the bed­
ouin virtues, of nasab, noble family origin, and of hasab, the 
distinction of great deeds and exploits, since individuals were 
expected to know their ancestors and the noble deeds which 
they had performed. As the ayyam were thus the subject of 
special concern in tribal society, the tribes had tales and nar­
ratives of their past deeds. These tribal accounts circulated 
both orally and in the form of prose. In the oral accounts, 
however, poetry plays a fundamental role, since it either ap­
pears throughout the story or comes at the end, depending 
on whether or not the poet has taken part in the events de­
scribed. This poetry does not carry the story forward, but rather 
gives it vitality and authority. And, with the passage of time, 
it came to be considered the solid evidence which confirmed 
the validity of the story. As Ibn Faris puts it, "Poetry is the 
register (Mwari) of the Arabs, through which genealogies are 
preserved and great deeds are displayed, and from which lan­
guage is learned. . . ."14 

II, 127 [edited by M. J. de Goeje et al. (Leiden, 1879-1901), I, 770]; Ibn 
Hisham, Sirat Rasid Allah, edited by Mustafa al-Saqqa et al. (Cairo, 1355/ 
1936), I, 321 [edited by Ferdinand Wiistenfeld (Gottingen, 1858-60), I, i, 
191]; HajjI Khalifa, Kashf al-zunun 'an asami l-kutub wa-l-funiin, edited by 
§erefettin Yaltkaya and Kilisli Rifat Bilge (Istanbul, 1941-43), I, 35. 

14 Al-TibrIzI, Sharh al-hamasa (Cairo, 1335/1916), I, 3; al-Suyutl, Al-Muz-
htrfl 'ulum al-lugha, edited bv Ahmad Jad al-Mawla et al. (Cairo, n.d.), II, 
470. 
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The ayyam stories had originated in evening tribal gather­
ings (majiilis), and were an orally transmitted assemblage of 
collective tribal accounts. They were the common property of 
the tribe, and remained so until the second/eighth century, 
when these accounts were gathered and compiled in written 
form. At the same time, however, we must bear in mind that 
the political and social currents of the early Islamic period 
exerted a distinct influence on the ayyam literature. Accounts 
of the "Battle-Days" are chronologically confused, and gen­
erally reflect partisan tendencies and represent the views of 
only one side. Moreover, they lack coherence and order, and 
embody no concept of history. Nevertheless, they do contain 
certain historical facts. Their fundamental importance is that 
they persisted through the early Islamic period, and their style 
affected the early stages of historical writing, especially in Iraq. 

The presence of poetry in the ayyam made them a subject 
of keen interest to philologists, genealogists, and historians 
(e.g., Abii cUbayda, al-Mada'ini, Ibn Qutayba, Abu I-Faraj 
al-Isfahanl, and Ibn cAbd Rabbih), and likewise, the ayyam 
eventually became an element in historical accounts. Ibn al-
AthIr tried to present accounts of the ayyam in historical se­
quence.15 HajjI Khalifa considers the ayyam to be a branch of 
history, saying, "The study of the ayyam al-'arab is a branch 
of learning in which one studies the momentous events and 
great ordeals which occurred among the Arab tribes . . . and 
it is appropriate that the above-mentioned field of learning be 
placed among the branches of history."16 

For modern historians the importance of the ayyam ac-
15 Ibn al-Athlr, Al-Kamilfl l-ta'rikh (Cairo, A.H. 1290), I, 209, 219, 220, 

225ff. [edited by C. J. Tornberg (Leiden, 1851-71), I, 502ff.]. 
16 HajjI Khalifa, Kashf al-zuniin, I, 204. On the ayyam, see Werner Caskel, 

"Aijam al-'arab: Studien zur altarabischen Epik," lslamica, III (1930), pp. 
IfF.; Ahmad al-Sha'ib, Ta'rikh al-naqaid, 2nd ed. (Cairo, 1954), pp. 53ff.; 
EI1, I, 218f. (E. Mittwoch); [EP, I, 793f. (E. Mittwoch); E. Meyer, Der 
historisehe Gehalt der Atyam al-Arab (Wiesbaden, 1970); 'Abd al-Jabbar al-
Bayatl, Kitab ayyam al-'arab qabla I-Islam (Baghdad, 1976)]. 
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counts lies in their persistence into early Islamic times, and in 
their style. The style of the ayyam stories is direct and full of 
vitality, a realistic approach in which prose is blended together 
with poetry. This style had its effect on the beginnings of 
historical writing among the Arabs, and its influence was par­
ticularly strong in the tribal milieu. 

Tribal life is characterized by its adherence to tradition, and 
has only a confused and limited notion of time. This is be­
cause time, from the tribal point of view, is punctuated by 
great events which tribesmen customarily take as starting points 
for dating events or fixing matters of chronology; when an 
important event occurs, whatever preceded it is disregarded 
and subsequent events are dated according to it. In some times 
and places, like al-Hira and Mecca, the tribes were in contact 
with other cultures. But their interest in these cultures was 
limited to their own immediate and particular affairs, and we 
have no evidence indicating the presence of other outside in­
fluences. 

The era of the Jahiliya left no written literature, and was 
rather a period of oral culture. Although its legacy in general 
contributed to the persistent interest in ayyam and in geneal­
ogies, and to the survival of a certain style in relating accounts, 
i.e., the pseudo-historical storytelling style, it is nevertheless 
devoid of any genuinely historical view of its subject matter. 

II. 

New views arose with the emergence of Islam. The Qur'an 
expounded a serious conception of the past, called attention 
to the limitations of the Arabs' earlier recollections, and traced 
history back to the beginning of Creation. The Qur'an stressed 
the lessons and warnings provided by the history of bygone 
times, and recalled the experiences of past nations and peoples 
in order to emphasize the spiritual and ethical precepts they 
involved. It set forth a universal view which conceived of his-
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tory as a succession of prophetic missions—all essentially a 
single message preached by various prophets, the last of whom, 
Muhammad, was the khatam, or "seal," of the prophets and 
messengers. This view made its influence felt by directing at­
tention to the history of the prophets and to the Isra Uiyat. 
Yet this universal conception of history was limited to the 
periods which preceded the rise of Islam; for later times, at­
tention was focused on the history of Islam. The Muslims 
were the successors of the previous nations among whom past 
prophets had carried out their missions, and their own deeds 
and affairs were thus deserving of special interest. This point 
of view was buttressed by the famous hadith, "My community 
will never agree on an error," a hadith important in establish­
ing the concept of communal consensus, or ijma. Finally, the 
Qur'an stated that the Prophet's words were of divine inspi­
ration, and that his life was an example for Muslims to emu­
late. Here we find an immediate motive for the study of the 
Prophet's words and deeds. 

The Arabs of Islamic times felt that they were possessors of 
a message of great significance, and that they were passing 
through an important stage in history. The great conquests, 
for example, made them aware that they had an important role 
to play in history, and this recognition had a powerful impact 
on historical studies. It was in this era that TJmar ibn al-
Khattab established a fixed calendar, the Hijra dating system. 
This became a vital element in the rise of historical thought; 
and the temporal fixing of events, or rather their classification 
in chronological order, has been the backbone of historical 
studies ever since. 'Umar also initiated the diwan system, or 
the recording of the names of warriors and their families ac­
cording to tribe. This gave genealogies new importance and 
provided further incentive for studying them. 

Considering these views and factors, and surveying the rise 
of historical studies, we notice that the first manifestations of 
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such writing originated from two fundamental perspectives: 
the Islamic perspective, which arose among the scholars of 
hadith, and the tribal perspective, or that of the ay yam. These 
two outlooks reflect the two great currents in early Islamic 
society: the tribal current represented by the enduring persist­
ence of the tribal heritage, and the Islamic current embodied 
in spiritual principles and activities. Each of these two per­
spectives had a cultural center in which it was predominant: 
the Islamic perspective thrived in Medina, the abode of pro­
phetic sunna, and the tribal perspective in Kufa and Basra, the 
two new garrison towns which were centers of tribal activity. 
All three cities were centers of vigorous cultural activity in 
early Islamic times. Each perspective developed its own school 
of historical writing, and each school exerted its own influence 
upon the other. In the end, however, the Islamic perspective 
prevailed as the viewpoint of the scholars of hadith rose to a 
dominant position in historical writing, as we shall see later 
below. 

III. 
Men of learning considered it their natural role and essen­

tial task to devote their attention to the words and deeds of 
the Prophet, whether as sources of spiritual guidance, or as 
sanctions providing precedents applicable to jurisprudence, 
administrative organization, and the affairs of everyday life. 
Similarly, Muhammad's military campaigns and the expedi­
tions of his Companions were a matter of special interest and 
pride among Muslims in general, and were favored topics of 
conversation at evening gatherings. Interest in these events 
was further reinforced by the fact that participation in the 
campaigns and other activities of the Prophet was a factor in 
improving one's social status, and also a point considered in 
the determination of stipends in the dtwdn registers. Before 
long, the Companions themselves came to be regarded as par­
agons for later generations to emulate in word and deed, and 
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thus their sayings and activities also came to be included in 
the hadith}7 Eventually, through the course of the first cen­
tury A.H., interest broadened to include the activities of the 
entire Islamic community. These various considerations all 
manifested themselves in historical studies. 

The study of the maghazt, or military expeditions of the 
Prophet, began in Medina in conjunction with the study of 
hadith. The scholars of hadith continued to show interest in 
the maghazi, but some of them, in studying the life of the 
Prophet, began to do so in a manner which moved beyond 
the limitations of the juridical aspects of the subject. The pi­
oneers of maghazi studies were scholars of hadith, as is con­
firmed by the way in which the learned regarded the maghazi 
authors. This also explains the importance of the isnadf the 
chain of authorities transmitting a report, in assessing the value 
of the maghazi; this meant that the value of a hadith or other 
account depended upon the reputation of the hadith scholars 
or transmitters who figured in the chain of authorities. This 
point of view very early on gave rise to a critical attitude to­
wards the ruwat, the sources who transmitted the informa­
tion. It introduced the element of investigation and inquiry 
into the gathering of the various accounts, and laid a firm 
foundation for historical studies. On the other hand, narra­
tives and popular tales about the maghazi were also passed 
along by word of mouth. Storytellers, the qussas, went to great 

17 See Joseph Schacht, The Origins ofMubammcdan Jurisprudence (Oxford, 
1950), pp. 3ff. 

c [The development of the isnad and its evolution as a critical tool are still 
topics of considerable controversy. For some of the more important views, 
see Ignaz Goldziher, Muslim Studies, edited and translated by S. M. Stern and 
C. R. Barber (London, 1967-71), II, index; Leone Caetani,AnneUi dell'Islam 
(Milan, 1905-26), I, 29ff.; Josef Horovitz, "Alter und Ursprung des Isnad," 
Der Islam, VIII (1918), pp. 39ff.; Schacht, Origins, pp. 38ff.; J. Robson, 
'The Isnad in Muslim Tradition," Transaaions of the Glasgow University Ori­
ental Society, XV (1955), pp. 15ff.; Abbott, Studies, I, 8f.; II, 5£f., and fre-
quendy thereafter; M. M. Azmi, Studies in Early Hadith Literature (Indian­
apolis, 1978), pp. 212ff.; Michael Cook, Early Muslim Dogma (Cambridge, 
1981), pp. 107ff.] 
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lengths in relating these accounts and turned them into a kind 
of folklore,d but although some of this did in later times find 
its way into certain biographies of the Prophet, the attitude 
towards transmitted accounts, and the methods employed in 
their criticism, essentially continued to follow the methodol­
ogy of the scholars of hadith. 

The earliest studies of the Prophet's life were also referred 
to as the maghazi, a word which from a linguistic point of 
view means the raids and military campaigns of the Prophet, 
but which actually extended to the entire period of his pro­
phetic mission."= Such studies were taken up by some of the 
most prominent descendants of Muhammad's Companions.18 

Let us now consider these writers. 
We begin with Aban ibn cUthman ibn 'Affan (d. between 

95/713 and 105/733), a scholar of hadith inclined towards the 
study of the maghazi. One of his students set his maghazi 
materials down in writing, but this is described as a work of 
hadith.19 Excluding a solitary reference to him in al-Ya'qubi,20 

d [On the qussas and the tales (qisas) they related, see Goldziher, Muslim 
Studies, II, 145ff.; idem, Die Richtungen der islamischen Komnauslegung (Lei­
den, 1920), pp. 58ff.; J. Pedersen, "The Islamic Preacher," in Ignace Goldziher 
Memorial Volume, edited by Joseph de Somogyi (Budapest, 1948), I, 226S,; 
idem, "The Criticism of the Islamic Preacher," Die Welt des Islams, New Series, 
II (1953), pp. 215ff.; Charles Pellat, LeMilieu basrien et lafiyrmation de Gahiz 
(Paris, 1953), pp. 108fF.; EP, IV, 733ff. (C. Pellat); V, 185ff. (C. PeUat)'. 
Cf. also p. 28, note f below.] 

e [For some detailed remarks on the sira-maghdzi connection, see Theodor 
Noldeke, Gesehtchte des QorAns, 2nd edition, revised by Friedrich Schwally et 
al. (Leipzig, 1909-38), II, 220f.] 

18 See Horovitz, "Biographies"; [also Fuck, Muhammad ibn Ishaq, pp. Iff.; 
GAS, I, 235ff.]. 

19 Ibn Sa'd, Kitab al-tabaqat al-kabir, edited by Eduard Sachau et al. (Lei­
den, 1904-40), V, 156. [Further light is shed on this matter in al-Zubayr ibn 
Bakkar, Al-Akhbar al-muwaffaqiyat, edited by SamI Makki al-'Αηϊ (Baghdad, 
1392/1972), pp. 332ff. According to this report, the amir Sulayman ibn tAbd 
al-Malik asked Aban in A.H. 82 to write for him 'iStyar al-Nabi and his magh-
azi," and Aban replied, "I have them with me, checked and documented from 
sources I trust." A copy was made for Sulayman, but he destroyed the sheets 
later for political reasons.] 

20 Ta'tikh, edited by M. T. Houtsma (Leiden, 1883), I, 3. 
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we find no one among the historians who transmits or reports 
information on his authority, whereas in the books of lpadith 
we do find accounts handed down through him. Aban ibn 
1Uthman thus seems to represent an intermediate stage be­
tween the study of hadith and the study of maghazi. 

The founder of maghazi studies appears to have been the 
famous jurisconsult and hadith scholar 'Urwa ibn al-Zubayr 
(d. 94/712), since he was the first to compose a book on the 
maghazi.21 Part of his work on the subject survives as quota­
tions cited in the works of such historians as al-Tabari, Ibn 
Ishaq, al-Waqidl, Ibn Sayyid al-Nas, and Ibn Kathir. These 
borrowings are the earliest surviving writings on the history 
of the maghazi. They cover various aspects of the Prophet's 
life, such as the beginning of the Qur'anic revelations, some 
of the raids, and some of the personal affairs of the Prophet, 
although in his accounts cUrwa does not go into detail on 
the fighting during the campaigns. He set down some of his 
lectures in writing, while part of his historical writings com­
prised written replies to questions addressed to him by the 
Umayyad court.22 He used the isnad in a form which reflects 
the attitude of his day. He apparendy relied on hadith mate­
rials in his written replies, but set forth a continuous narrative 
(or story) without mentioning the chain of authorities who 
had transmitted it. In his accounts of such important events 
as the beginning of Qur'anic revelation and the Hijra, how­
ever, he does give his isnad. The attitude towards the isnad in 
his day was still flexible, and on its use there were as yet no 
detailed rules, which appeared later. 

'Urwa's style of writing is direct and far removed from lit­
erary affectation, and at the same time his attitude is realistic, 
unequivocal, and free from exaggeration. His social position 

21 HajjI Khalifa, Kashf al-zuntin, II, 1747; al-Sakhawi, Al-I'lfin bi-l-tawbikh 
li-man dbamma l-ta'rikh (Damascus, 1349/1930), p. 99. 

22 See Ibn Sa'd, V, 132ff.; al-Tabari, Tankh, I, 1180, 1284, 1634. 
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enabled him to gather historical information from its earliest 
sources, especially from 'A'isha and the family of al-Zubayr, 
who were his kinsmen. He also had access to some written 
documents, and made reference to verses of the Qur'an per­
taining to the events he describes.23 Although he does cite 
poetry from time to time,24 this is not indicative of any influ­
ence by the style of the ayyam, but rather reflects 'Urwa's own 
fondness for verse and the role of poetry in the culture of his 
time. 

'Urwa's interest in history also extended to the period of 
the Rashidun caliphs, and included such topics as the Ridda 
wars and the battles of al-Qadisiya and al-Yarmuk.25 It is thus 
at an early date that we find an interest in events affecting the 
umma. Unfortunately, the accounts which have come down 
to us from eUrwa are few and far between. They are insuffi­
cient for us to gain any clear conception of his maghazi work, 
or even of the structure (assuming any such structure existed) 
according to which he arranged his accounts. 

Let us note here that if we seek to understand the devel­
opment of historical writing, we must bear in mind that aca­
demic studies, even in the early maghhzi tradition, were col­
lective endeavors, and that the activities of individuals were 
part of the work of a particular school. Everyone who took 
up a career of learning added his own studies and research to 
those of his masters, and in this way both preserved the learn­
ing of the school to which he belonged and added to it other 
material which had come to his attention. 

The role of one of 'Urwa's contemporaries, ShurahbIl ibn 
Sa'd (d. 123/740), reflects the social attitude developing at 
that time. Participation in the various aspects of the Prophet's 

23 See Ibn Hisham, I, ii, 754; al-Baladhuri, Vutuh al-buldm, edited by M. J. 
de Goeje (Leiden, 1866), p. 79; al-Tabari, Tarikh, I, 1180f., 1288. 

24Al-TabarI, Ta'rikh, I, 2348. 
25 Al-tabari, Ta'rikh, I, 1185, 1199, 1242. 
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mission was becoming a standard of steadily increasing im­
portance in determining one's social status, thus Shurahbil gave 
lists of the names of the Companions who had participated in 
great events, such as the warriors who fought at the battles of 
Badr and Uhud and the groups of Muslims who emigrated to 
Abyssinia and to Medina. 

In the following era there were three scholars primarily re­
sponsible for the advancement and extension of maghazi stud­
ies: tAbd Allah ibn AbI Bakr ibn Hazm (d. 130-35/747-52), 
cAsim ibn 'Umar ibn Qatada (d. 120/737), and Muhammad 
ibn Muslim ibn Shihab al-Zuhri (d. 124/741). Their works 
firmly established the framework for maghazi writings, and 
laid out the greater part of the materials used by Ibn Ishaq 
and later by al-Waqidi. Of these early works, however, only 
selections have survived to modern times. 

Al-Zuhri was the first true historian of these three au­
thors;26 for rather than confining himself to supplementing 
the maghazi account of 'Urwa ibn al- Zubayr,27 he undertook 
a broad-ranging search to collect the accounts and hadith in 
general circulation in Medina and wrote down whatever he 
found in order to aid his memory. He subjected these ac­
counts to careful examination and arranged them within a clear 
and solid framework. A study of those of his accounts as have 
survived suggests that he was the first to endow the sira—and 
this is the term he uses—with a definite structure, and to set 
down its outlines in unequivocal form. His format for the sira 
begins by providing some information on the pre-Islamic era 
relevant to the life of the Prophet Muhammad. He then takes 
up the important aspects of the Meccan period of the Proph­
et's life, the Hijra to Medina, and discusses Muhammad's mil-

261 have already written a separate study devoted to this historian ["Al-
Zuhri: a Study of the Beginnings of History Writing in Islam," BSOAS, XIX 
(1957), pp. Iff.]; I will therefore omit references to the sources here, but will 
return to al-Zuhri in Chapter Two below. 

27 Al-SakhawI, Al-I lm bi-l-tawbikh, p. 89. 
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itary campaigns and the conquest of Mecca, some of the em­
bassies he dispatched, and the delegations which came for 
audiences with him. Al-Zuhri also speaks about other activi­
ties of the Prophet, and then his final illness and departure 
from this life. He strictly follows the chronological sequence 
in describing events of the stra, and gives the dates for the 
most important ones. 

Al-Zuhri took most of his materials for the sim from hadtth. 
We find only a slight trace of the qisas tales in his writing, and 
similarly, we detect a faint echo in his materials from the qisas 
al-anbiya ("tales of the prophets") literature/ in which he 
appears to have been interested. Al-Zuhri was fond of poetry, 
as were the other men of his age, and in fact was quite knowl­
edgeable on the subject. But his use of poetry in his Maghazi 
was limited, and in his writing he was far removed from the 
style of the ay yam. 

The studies of al-Zuhri also covered the era of the Rashidun 
caliphs, since his scrutiny extended to the important events 
and major problems in the early history of the umma. These 
included the election of Abu Bakr as caliph, the establishment 
of the dlwan system, the collection of the Qur'an, the shiira, 
the fitna, the murder of iUthman, the election of 'All, the 
First Civil War, and the passage of political authority to the 
Umayyads. In this way he demonstrates the importance of the 
experiences through which the community had passed. From 
another standpoint, we should also note that al-ZuhrI was a 
learned genealogist. He wrote a book on Quraysh genealogy, 
and Mus'ab al-Zubayri mentions him as a source in his book 
Nasab Quraysh. 

Al-Zuhri provided his accounts with isnads,, and he was re-

f [On the qisas al-anbiya, see Tilman Nagel, Die Qisas al-anbiya: ein Bei-
trag zur arabiscben Literaturgeschiehte (Bonn, 1967); J. Pauliny, "Einige Be-
merkungen zu den Werken Qtsas al-anbiya in der arabischen Literatur," 
(Graecolatina et Orientalia1 I (1969), pp. IllfF.; Raif Georges Khoury, Les 
Legendes prophettques dans I'Islam depuis Ie Ier jusqu'au ΠIe Steele de I'Hegire 
(Wiesbaden, 1978).] 
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nowned for the strength of the isnads in which his name ap­
peared. In this respect his attitude is representative of that of 
his age, inasmuch as he sometimes shows preference for ac­
counts passed down through the descendants of the Compan­
ions, the tabi'un, to satisfy the conditions of isnad criticism. 
He did, however, introduce a new element, the collective is-
nad under which he combined a number of accounts into a 
single continuous narrative. In doing so he took an important 
step towards continuous historical writing. Al-Zuhri also ren­
dered another important service to historical studies in that 
he committed his accounts to writing. He is considered the 
first to have done so in any systematic fashion, and a consid­
erable quantity of his writings was kept in the imperial library 
at the Umayyad court.e As for the accounts stating that he 
was coerced into writing down his works, these are echoes of 
disputations which arose after al-Zuhri's time.28 

The studies of 'Urwa ibn al-Zubayr and al-Zuhri cast light 
on the origins and scope of historical writing. From these 
works it appears that, in addition to the sira, interest in the 
great tribulations and events which the Islamic community 
had experienced was a factor of fundamental significance in 
the rise of historical writing. Qur'anic exegesis, considering 
the many references in the Qur'an to Muslim affairs, was an­
other factor. Administrative exigencies, such as organization 
of the taxation and diwAn systems, were also motives for writ­
ing.29 Finally, the social status and the respect which scholars 
enjoyed in society were both elements promoting the quest 

β [The evolution and role of library collections have been discussed in sev­
eral useful works. See Mackensen, "Arabic Books and Libraries"; Abbott, 
Studies, I, 20ff.; Youssef Eche, Les Bibliotheques arabes (Damascus, 1967), pp. 
9ff.] 

28 Ibn al-jawzl, Safwat al-safwa (Haydarabad, A.H. 1355-56), II, 78; al-
Dhahabi, Tarajim rijal rawa Muhammad ibn Ishaq ra'ts ahl al-tnaghazi 'un­
burn, edited by August Fischer (Leiden, 1890), pp. 67, 69, 72; Ibn Kathir, 
Al-Btdaya wa-l-nibaya (Cairo, 1351-58/1932-39), IX, 344. 

29 Al-Bukhari, Al-Tankb al-kabir (Haydarabad, 1360-79/1941-59), IV, 32; 
al-Dhahabi, Tarajim, p. 45. 
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for knowledge, as tUrwa ibn al-Zubayr and al-Zuhri con­
firm.30 

We should note that the accounts of these authors are dis­
tinguished by their candor and their essentially humane char­
acter, and that the exaggeration we find among the historians 
of later times is of only rare occurrence in these earlier works. 
The inclination, for example, towards fatalism in explaining 
events, a tendency promoted by the Umayyads, has no ob­
vious manifestations in the work of either tUrwa or al-Zuhri. 
We rather find that the deeds of the Prophet are sometimes 
presented as actions of divine inspiration, and yet in other 
situations are deemed nothing more than practical human in­
itiative, as, for example, in the story of the Batde of the Ditch. 

The studies of tUrwa and al-Zuhri thus demonstrate that 
the outlines of the Prophet's biography were laid out in the 
first century A.H. The writers responsible for this were not 
storytellers like Wahb ibn Munabbih, but rather were scholars 
of hadith with an admirable capacity for criticizing and scru­
tinizing the various accounts available to them. Storytellers 
who promoted popular tales, and in them adopted tales from 
the IsrailiyAt, only made their influence felt after the epoch 
of al-Zuhri. 

Due to his own influence in the spheres of folklore and the 
IsrailiyAt, this is an appropriate place to turn our attention 
to Wahb ibn Munabbih (d,110/728).h By both birth and cul­
ture Wahb was a Yemenite, and he elaborated a point of view 
which was alien to the Medinan school. 

Wahb wrote a book about the maghAzi,31 and a fragment 
from the work has been discovered by Professor Becker.1 But 

30 See al-Baladhuri, Futuh al-buldan, pp. 19f., 61, 384. 
h [Also see now Raif Georges Khoury, Wabb b. Munabbih (Wiesbaden, 

1972); also his Les Legendes prophettques, pp. 158ff.] 
31 HajjI Khalifa, Kaskf al-zunun, II, 1747. 
1 [C. H. Becker, Papyri Scbott-Reinhardt, I (Heidelberg, 1906), pp. Iff. Cf. 

pp. 132-33 below.] 
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this fragment does not offer any clear idea of how he struc­
tured the slra, or of his attitude towards the isnHd. The author 
of the Hilyat al-awliya quoted two fragments from Wahb 
concerning the stra·,32 these come without isndds, and their 
style is typical of the style of the storytellers—full of skillful 
illustration, glorification, and legendary material. The style of 
the ayyam is likewise evident in the fragment discovered by 
Becker. Wahb's Maghazl, however, is not mentioned in the 
histories of the Prophet's life, nor did it make any impression 
on the maghazi literature. 

Wahb was particularly interested in theIsraUiyAt, tales and 
myths related to the Old Testament, and sought to use them 
to clarify some of the Qur'anic references to ancient events. 
In this way he was able to introduce the qisas element into 
Islamic studies. He collected whatever such stories were cir­
culating among the Muslims, especially the tales of Ka'b al-
Ahbar (d. 32-34/652-54) and cAbd Allah ibn Salam (d. ca. 
40/660),33 and added to them other lore he had gained through 
his contacts with the ahl al-kitab and by reading their scrip­
tures. His book Al-Mubtada' was the first attempt to write 
the history of divine mission. Examination of the passages 
cited from this work by Ibn Qutayba (in his Ma'arif), al-
Tabari, and al-Maqdis! (in his Al-Bad' wa-l-ta'rikb) indicate 
that Wahb began with the Creation, proceeded step by step 
through Old Testament history to the prophets mentioned in 
the Qur'an, and even discussed a number of righteous men, 
such as Luqman and the Seven Sleepers. 

Wahb's accounts of the history of Yemen are legends taken 
from Israillyat tales and popular folklore. They contain an 
ample measure of fabricated poetry, and are in keeping with 

32 Abu Nu'aym al-Isfahani, Hilyat al-awliya wa-tabaqat al-asfiya (Cairo, 
1351-57/1932-38), II, 73fF., 79ff. 

33 Al-Dhahabi in August Fischer, "Neue Ausziige aus ad-Dahabi und Ibn 
an-Naggar," ZDMG, XLIV (1890), p. 439; al-Sakhawi, ΑΙ-ΙΊάη bi-l-tawbikb, 
p. 49. 
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the style of the ayyam. Wahb produced in prose form a Ye­
menite folk epic in order to refute the claims to preeminence 
made by the Arabs of the north. 

Wahb was not a scrupulous writer, and was not above mak­
ing false allegations. For this reason he is to be regarded as 
no more than a narrator and storyteller; al-Sakhawi considers 
his reports to be unworthy of serious historians.34 He articu­
lated a point of view which, compared to the approach of the 
hadith scholars of Medina, was distorted and weak. But he 
created from the IsraUiyAt material for the history of the pre-
Islamic past, and offered a first example of universal history, 
as represented in his history of divine mission. This perspec­
tive found a strong echo in the work of a famous historian of 
the Medinan school, Ibn Ishaq. 

Let us now return to the Medinan school of history estab­
lished by al-Zuhri, in order to consider two historians of par­
ticular importance, both of whom were al-Zuhri's students— 
Musa ibn tUqba and Muhammad ibn Ishaq. 

Musa ibn cUqba (d. 141/758)) strictly adhered to the method 
of the school of Medina. We find him reflecting the gradually 
increasing emphasis of the hadith scholars on the isnad, and 
evincing a particular emphasis on giving the dates for the events 
he describes. In addition to documents and oral accounts he 

34Al-SakhawI, be. cit.\ Ibn Khallikan, Wafayat al-a'yan wa-anba abna al-
zam&n (Cairo, A.H. 1299); II, 238 [edited by Ihsan tAbbas (Beirut, 1968-
72), VI, 35f. ]. 

ι [On Mflsa ibn tUqba, see Fuck, Muhammad ibn Ishaq, pp. IlfF.; Horo-
vitz, "Biographies," II, 164ff.; GAS, I, 286f. A manuscript abstract of the 
contents of his Maghazi was published by Eduard Sachau in his "Das Berliner 
Fragment des Musa ibn tUqba; ein Beitrag zur Kenntnis der altesten ara-
bischen Geschichtsliteratur," in Sitzungsbericbte der Preussisehen Akademie der 
Wissensehaften (Berlin, 1904), pp. 445ff. Cf. also Joseph Schacht, "On Mflsa 
ibn 'Uqba's Kitab al-maghazl," Aaa Orientalia, XXI (1953), pp. 288ff.; the 
English translation and remarks by A. Guillaume, The Life of Muhammad 
(London, 1955), pp. XLinff.; Abdu Braimah, "A Reconstruction of the Lost 
Book Kttab al-maghazi of Musa b. tUqba," M.A. thesis (American University 
in Cairo, 1968).] 
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made use of written sources, especially the works of his teacher 
al-Zuhri, although for such written materials he relied on the 
narrator transmitting them, the ram, rather than on the book 
itself. Musa ibn 'Uqba depended primarily on the work of al-
Zuhri and added to it his own special studies, thus adding 
material to the legacy of the school. It is clear, however, that 
assessment of the work he produced will require a detailed 
and rigorous study of all the passages in the works of Ibn 
Ishaq, al-Waqidi, al-Tabari, Ibn Sayyid al-Nas, and Ibn KathIr 
where Musa's writings are quoted. 

When we come to Ibn Ishaqk we notice new lines of devel­
opment, the most obvious of which are the presence of the 
folkloric qisas element and the tendency to exaggerate. We also 
sense that we have moved on to scholars who were historians 
first, and scholars of hadith second. 

Ibn Ishaq (d. 151/761) has bequeathed to us the oldest sira 
to survive almost completely intact. His basic design for the 
sira probably consisted of three parts: the Mubtada\ or the 
history of the period between Creation and Muhammad's call; 
the Mab'ath, or the mission of the Prophet Muhammad; and 
the Maghazt, the Prophet's military campaigns and raids. But 
in my view the book itself actually consists of two distinct 
parts, the Mubtada' and the Maghazi. It was thus possible to 
transmit the two together, or each of them separately.35 

k [There is an enormous literature on Ibn Ishaq. In addition to Flick's study, 
mentioned above, see Horovitz, "Biographies," II, 169ff.; Guillaume, Life of 
Muhammad, pp. xmff.; 'Abd al-'Aziz al-Dflrl, Dirasafi sirat al-Nabi wa-
mu'allifiha Ibn Ishaq (Baghdad, 1965); Rudolf Sellheim, "Prophet, Chalif, 
und Geschichte: die Muhammed-Biographie des Ibn Ishaq," Oriens, XVIII 
(1967), pp. 33ff.; EP, III, 810f. (J.M.B. Jones); GAS, I,'288ff. The study of 
Ibn Ishaq's historical writing must now be reexamined in light of two recent 
publications of sira materials transmitted on his authority by Yunus ibn Bu-
kayr: Sira, edited by Muhammad HamId Allah (Rabat, 1976); Kitab al-siyar 
wa-l-magbazi, edited by Suhayl Zakkar (Beirut, 1398/1978).] 

35 See al-Sakhawi, Al-Tlm bi-l-tawbikh, p. 88, also p. 92, where he says, 
"As for the tales of the prophets, these are included in the Mubtada' of 
Muhammad ibn Ishaq ibn Yasar al-Muttalibl, the author of the Sira of the 
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In both his view of history and his method, Ibn Ishaq far 
surpassed the bounds of the school of Medina. In his writings 
he combined the method of the scholars of hadith with that 
of the storytellers, and made use of various aspects of the in­
terest in the maghazi and the history of the ancient prophets. 
He thus drew together hadith reports, historical accounts, ma­
terial from the Isra iliyat, and popular qisas lore, along with a 
great deal of both genuine and fabricated poetry.1 As a result, 
his sources of information are a heterogeneous mixture which 
calls for considerable caution. In the Mubtada', for example, 
Ibn Ishaq cited accounts on the authority of the ahl al-kitab 
and new converts to Islam, derived much information from 
Wahb ibn Munabbih36 and non-Arabs {'ajam), and reported 
ancient Arab tales and fables of Yemenite origin.37 His ac­
counts of the era of Muhammad's mission derive substantially 
from his teachers in Medina, particularly tUrwa, al-Zuhrl, 
tAsim ibn cUmar ibn Qatada, and tAbd Allah ibn AbI Bakr 
ibn Muhammad ibn Hazm, with further material added from 
the results of his own studies. In some cases his accounts do 
no more than provide exegesis for Qur'anic verses, some 
transmitted from others and some his own work. But we also 
find that his information on the Meccan period appears in 
most cases without an isnad, and the frequency with which 
we find the word qissa, "story," as a heading for his narratives38 

Prophet." See also al-Khatib al-Baghdadl, Tartkh Baghdad (Cairo, 1349/1931), 
I, 215; al-MaqdisI, Al-Bad' wa-l-ta'rikh, edited and translated by Clement 
Huart (Paris, 1899-1919), II, 38; Ibn ai-'Imad, Shadhamt al-dbabab fi akh-
btir man dhahaba (Cairo, A.H. 1350-51), I, 230; al-Dhahabi/Fischer, p. 419. 

1 [Cf. W. Montgomery Watt, "The Materials Used by Ibn Ishaq," in His­
torians of the Middle East, edited by Bernard Lewis and P. M. Holt (London, 
1962), pp. 23ff.] 

36Al-Tabari, Ta'tikb, I, 361, 471, 504, 539, 551ff., 562; idem, Jatni' al-
bayan 'an ta'wtt ay al-Qur'an (Tafitr; Cairo, A.H. 1323-29), XVI, 12, 51; 
XVII, 45; al-Hamdanl, Ikltl, I, 10. 

37 Ibn Hisham (Cairo), I, 73ff., 81ff. [Wiistenfeld ed., I, i, 48f., 52ff.], and 
similarly, pp. 27, 29 [Wiistenfeld ed., I, i, 16f., 18f.], and the Wiistenfeld 
edition, I, i, 197. 

38 See Ibn Hisham, I, i, 203, 224. 
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indicates the influence the qisas tales had on his work. His 
accounts of the Medinan period bear a stronger stamp of ear­
nest intent and reveal a clearer attentiveness to the isrnd, but 
we nevertheless find along with this the influence of popular 
folklore, and similarly, the influence of pious devotion in the 
way Ibn Ishaq exaggerates.™ He cites poetry either in the course 
of his reports or else in aggregate form at the end of the dis­
cussion of the event in question, clearly indicating how he has 
combined the method of the storytellers with that of the scholars 
of hadtth. This poetry, in both its fabricated and its genuine 
varieties, sheds light on contemporary political currents of the 
day, such as the rivalry between the Ansar and Quraysh.39 

Ibn Ishaq is criticized for his dependence on accounts trans­
mitted by the cthl al-kitab, his many citations of fabricated 
poetry, his errors in giving genealogies, and because he fails 
to criticize his sources and passes down information from the 
books of other living writers (i.e., without actually hearing 
the reports from their authors).40 He does, however, express 
doubt about some of his accounts,41 and sometimes makes use 
of Qur'anic verses to corroborate them. He was not adept at 
poetry, and acknowledged his shortcomings. In using the is­
nad he was not as rigorous as the scholars of hadtth would 
have demanded, but he sufficiently advanced the method of 

m [On such elements in the Stra, see Josef Horovitz, "Zur Muhammadle-
gende," Der Islam, V (1914), pp. 41ff.; translated by Emma Agnes Licht as 
"The Growth of the Mohammed Legend," Muslim World, X (1920), pp. 49ff.] 

39 See Dr. WalId 'Arafat's dissertation, "A Critical Introduction to the Study 
of the Poetry Ascribed to Hassan b. Thabit." [Now see the introduction to 
his edition of the Diwan of Hassan ibn Thabit (London, 1971), I, 23ff.; also 
his "Early Critics of the Authenticity of the Poetry of the Stra," BSOAS, XXI 
(1958), pp. 453ff.; "An Aspect of the Forger's Art in Early Islamic Poetry," 
BSOAS, XXVIII (1965), pp. 477ff.] 

40 Yaqut, Mu'jam al-ndaba, edited by D. S. Margoliouth, 2nd ed. (Lon­
don, 1923-31), VI, 400; Ibn Sayyid ai-Nas, 'Uyiin al-athar fi funiin ai-ma-
ghazt wa-l-shama'il wa-l-siyar (Cairo, A.H. 1356), I, 12. 

41 E.g., Ibn Hisham (Cairo), I, 176, 194, 203f. [Wiistenfeld ed., I, i, 106, 
117, 121f. The critical attitude of Ibn Ishaq is discussed in detail in Guil-
laume's introduction to his Life of Muhammad, pp. xixff.] 
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using the collective isnad so that he was able to offer an en­
gaging story from his accounts." The materials he used were 
documents, written sources, and oral narratives and reports. 

The impact of political and intellectual currents of the day 
manifests itself in the accusation charging that Ibn Ishaq was 
of pro-Shfi tendencies, an accusation not devoid of founda­
tion.42 He is also described as a Qadarite, a believer in free­
dom of the will. It may also be that he was opposed to the 
Umayyads, but evidence confirming this is still wanting. 

The Sira of Ibn Ishaq was criticized in Medina; but it was 
favorably received in the eastern provinces, and apparently its 
style and content were in keeping with the cultural perspec­
tives of the region. The text that has survived to modern times 
is a revision made by Ibn Hisham (d. 218/813), who received 
the text in the recension of al-Bakka'I, which in the opinion 
of al-Sakhawi offered a better text than the recension of Yunus 
ibn Bukayr al-Shaybanl.43 In his revision of the text Ibn Hi-
sham tried to prune out weak sections, particularly in the 
Mubtada\ to eliminate the fabricated poetry, and to make the 
text more compatible with the point of view of the hadith 
scholars. It appears that historians generally viewed the Sira 
of Ibn Ishaq with favor, especially after Ibn Hisham had re­
vised it.44 

Another book, a Ta'rikh al-khulafa\ or "History of the 
Caliphs," has been attributed to Ibn Ishaq, but only scattered 

" [See J. Robson, "Ibn Ishaq's Use of the Isnad," BJRL, XXXVIII (1955-
56), pp. 449ff.] 

42 See Yaqut, Mu'jam al-udaba, VI, 400; Ibn Hisham (Cairo), I, 106; 
III, 234f. [Wiistenfeld ed., I, i, 66; ii, 677f.]; also the Wustenfeld edition, I, 
i, 152ff., 435. 

43 Al-Sakhawi, ΑΙ-ΓΙάη bi-l-tawbikb, p. 88. [But cf. note k above.] 
44 Ibn Khallikan, Wafayat al-a'yan, edited by Ferdinand Wiistenfeld (Got-

tingen, 1835-50), VIII, 7fF. ['Abbas ed., IV., 276f.]; al-Dhahabl, Tadhkirat 
al-huffaz, 2nd ed. (Haydarabad, A.H. 1333-34), I, 163f.; Ibn Kathlr, Al-Bi-
daya wa-l-nihaya, X, 109; al-Sakhawi, Al-I'Ian bi-l-tawbtkh, p. 117; Ibn al-
'Imad, Shadharat al-dhahab, I, 225, 230. 
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selections from it have come down to us. This work appar­
ently covered the history of the Rashidun and Umayyad ca­
liphs.0 

Ibn Ishaq both employed and supplemented the approaches 
of his predecessors. Thus in the Mubtada' his plan appears to 
have been influenced by Wahb ibn Munabbih, which may be 
one reason for the presence of a special section on Yemen in 
the work. Although his writings are separate and distinct works, 
viewed as a whole the Mubtada', the Maghazi, and the Ta'rikh 
al-khulafa' articulate a definite historical conception, the idea 
of writing universal history. 

Historical studies developed further in the work of Muham­
mad ibn tUmar al-Waqidi (130-207/748-823).P His book Al-
Maghazi, or the raids and military campaigns of the Prophet, 
is limited to the Medinan period, and in content and method 
is more strictly in keeping with the school of Medina than 
was the Slra of Ibn Ishaq. Al-WaqidI was systematic and se­
lective in his treatment of the material available to him. He 
first presents a general outline of the topic under discussion, 
and then follows up by relating the details. He begins with a 
list of his primary sources, and another of the expeditions of 
the Prophet and their dates, also giving, when he discusses 
the expeditions which the Prophet led himself, the names of 
those who governed Medina in his absence. Then he takes up 

° [Abbott has published and discussed a papyrus fragment which seems to 
be a part of this history; see her Studies, I, 80ff.] 

Ρ [On al-Waqidi, see EI1, IV, 1104f. (J. Horovitz); GAS, I, 294ff.; J.M.B. 
Jones, "Ibn Ishaq and al-Waqidi: the Dream of 'Atika and the Raid to Nakhla 
in Relation to the Charge of Plagiarism," BSOAS, XXII (1959), pp. 41ff.; 
Petersen, 'Alt and Mu'awiya, pp. 83ff.; Rudolf Vesely, "La Bataille d'Uhud 
chez al-Wakidl," in Studia semitica phUologica necnon philosophtca Ioanni Bakos 
dtcata, edited by Stanislaus Segert (Bratislava, 1965), pp. 25IfF.; Amanullah 
Khan, "Al-WaqidI: an Assessment of His Position as an Historian," Journal 
of Research (Humanities), V (1970), pp. 81ff.; and most importantly, Jones' 
detailed account of al-Waqidi and his place in the sira-maghazi literature in 
his introduction to his edition of al-Waqidfs Kitab al-maghazi (London, 1966), 
I, 5ff.] 
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the history of the expeditions one after the other in chrono­
logical order, paying particular attention to their dates.1! 

Al-WaqidI was more rigorous than Ibn Ishaq not only with 
respect to method, but also in his use of the. isnad, in the 
precision with which he dated events, in his attitude towards 
poetry (since he used it only in moderation), and in the way 
he reduced the folkloric qisas element in his material. He reg­
ularly uses the collective isnad to present the essential infor­
mation for each expedition, and then cites individual accounts 
to present further details or divergent reports. This method 
clearly demonstrates that al-Waqidl is presenting accounts of 
the school of Medina under his collective isnad, and then is 
adding to them whatever else has come to his attention. The 
contribution made by his own studies is apparent in the sup­
plementary material he furnishes, in the precision of the dates 
he gives, in his presentation of a clearer outline for the various 
expeditions, and in his interest in the geographical details rel­
evant to the locations of the various battlefields. 

Al-Waqidfs critical attitude is manifest in several respects: 
in his travels to various battlefields in order to round out his 
other material, in his rigorous scrutiny of the sources which 
had come down to him,45 in his search for new documents, 
and in the lists he prepared of the participants in the expedi­
tions, lists which were so much more complete that he later 
made an excellent compilation of them. Al-WaqidI very fre-
quendy refers to Qur'anic verses pertaining to the events he 
describes, and for important cases he mentions the verses as 
an addendum to his accounts, as, for example, in his discus­
sion of the battles of Badr, Uhud, and the Ditch. Proceeding 
in this way allows him to present narrative in smooth se­
quence. Al-WaqidI is candid in his accounts, and despite the 

Ί [See J.M.B. Jones, "The Chronology of the Maghazi: a Textual Survey," 
BSOAS, XIX (1957), pp. 245ff.] 

45 Ibn Sayyid al-Nas, 'Uyiin al-athar, I, 17, 18. 
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presence of 'Alid tendencies in his writing, he is far removed 
from factional partisanship.46 We do, however, sense the in­
fluence of the qisas lore in his Maghazi. 

Al-WaqidI took nothing from Ibn Ishaq. This is attribut­
able to the attitude of Medina towards the latter, to the di­

vergence of al-Waqidl's approach from that of Ibn Ishaq, and 
to the prevailing attitude in Medina that historical hadith ma­
terials were the property of the school of Medina and so were 
at the disposal of both men. 

Al-WaqidI also undertook the more general study of Islamic 
history, and wrote books on such important subjects as "The 
Ridda," the day of "The House," or the murder of 'Uthman, 

"The Battle of SifHn," "The Batde of the Camel," and the 
conquests in Syria and Iraq. Of particular importance to us is 
his Al-Ta'rikh al-kabir, or "Great History," which apparendy 
covered the history of the caliphs at least as far as the year 
179/795. His Kitab al-tabaqat, a history of the classes of ha­

dith scholars in Kufa and Basra, is also important for its illus­
tration of the way hadith studies influenced the writing of 
history, for such works assisted hadith scholars in evaluating 
isnads. This book was probably the prototype and source upon 
which Ibn Sa'd, al-Waqidl's secretary, relied in his own Ta-
baqatJ 

The historical works mentioned above were composed in 
accordance with the method followed by the scholars of ha­
dith in studying Islamic history, but eventually such works 
broadened in scope to the point where, from the standpoint 
of subject, they converged with the works of the akhbariyun 

46 See the complete text of al-Waqidl's Magbazl edited by J. M. Jones, but 
still in manuscript form in the library of the School of Oriental Languages, 
University of London [now published, as noted above. On the question of 
ShI'I sympathies in al-Waqidl's Maghazi, see Jones' introduction, pp. 16ff.] 

' [On die tabaqat literature, see Ibrahim Hafsi, "Recherches sur Ie genre 
tmbaqat," Arabica, XXIII (1976), pp. 227ff.; XXIV (1977), pp. Iff., 150ff] 
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and the philologists. When Ibn Sa'd (d. 230/844)s wrote his 
Kitab al-tabaqat al-kabir, "Great Book of Classes," he set down 
in the first section (entitled Akhbar al-Nabt) the final lines for 
the structure of the sira, far surpassing al-Waqidl in the or­
ganization and systematic division of his material into chap­
ters, in giving a more extensive collection of documents, and 
in his markedly stronger interest in the embassies of the Prophet. 
Similarly, since he discusses some of the prophets who had 
some connection with the mission of the Prophet Muham­
mad, and then gives their line of descent, Ibn Sa'd's section 
dealing with the pre-Islamic era is tantamount to an introduc­
tion to the era of Muhammad's own mission. Ibn Sa'd dealt 
at great length with hadith material on the virtues of the 
Prophet, his merits, and the proofs of his prophethood, mak­
ing of these a special chapter which became the archetype for 
the shamail and dalail literature of later times.47 Ibn Sa'd's 
work finally and firmly established the structure for the history 
of the Prophet's life: all subsequent histories of the sira fol­
lowed the same plan and relied primarily on the materials pre­
sented in the works mentioned above. 

During the secondyeighth century, sira studies spread to other 
lands beyond Medina—Yemen, Iraq, and Syria. Only a few 
remnants of these works have survived, but they do indicate 
the steadily increasing interest in this field of historical studies. 

From this brief presentation we can see that interest in the 
study of hadith led to the rise of historical studies, i.e., to an 
interest in gaining religious knowledge, 'Um, rather than us-

s [On Ibn Sa'd, see Otto Loth, Das ClassmbMb des Ibn Sa'd: einleitende 
Untersuchungen Uber Authentic und Inhalt (Leipzig, 1869); idem, "Ursprung 
und Bedeutung der Tabakat, vornehmlich der des Ibn Sa'd," ZDMG, XXIII 
(1869), pp. 593ff.; Eduard Sachau, introduction to Ibn Sa'd, III, i (Leiden, 
1904), pp. 5ff.; Κ. V. Zettersteen, "Ibn Sa'd ock hans arbete Kitab et-Ta-
baqat el-Keblr," LeMonde Oriental, I (1906), pp. 66ff.; EP, III, 922f. (J. W. 
Fiick), Petersen, 'Alt andMu'awiya, pp. 90ff.; GAS, I, 300f.] 

47 EI1, Supplement, p. 235 [ = Gibb, Studies on the Civilization if Islam, p. 
113; cf. also Ndldeke, Geschichte des Qorans, II, 135], 
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ing individual judgment, ray, for proving a fact or settling a 
question of law. When hadith expanded to include the activi­
ties and sayings of the Prophet's Companions, the sahaba, and 
their descendants, the tabiiin, and when the experiences of 
the Islamic community (particularly its consensus, or ijma ) 
became a source of law, historical studies also expanded to 
include these subjects. Moreover, political issues, particularly 
the question of the caliphate, demanded investigation from a 
historical and topical standpoint. Similarly, other factors, both 
administrative and social, also made their influence felt. 

In line with the basic principles of Islam, there arose his­
torical attitudes which found expression in the study of the 
slra, in the writing of universal history as expression of a con­
tinuous succession of prophetic missions, and in the study of 
the history of the umma. One fundamental concept pervades 
these attitudes—that it is divine will that created the world, 
and divine will which directs its activities, although the con­
cept of qadar, or freedom of the will, was also present, and 
the experiences of the Islamic community were similarly re­
garded as very important. We note that the majority of the 
early reports on the sira were simple, realistic, and straightfor­
ward accounts. But the passage of time, the example of Chris­
tian and Jewish tradition, and the activities of the storytell­
ers—inspired either by social factors or by piety—eventually 
gave rise to a tendency for embellishment and exaggeration. 

IV. 

The second perspective on historical writing developed out 
of the persistent interest in the exploits and genealogies of the 
Arab tribes.1 The conquests added new feats and great 
achievements to the tribal topics available for study, and in 
like manner, the founding of an Islamic empire opened up 

1 [The historical and social background to this and the following sections 
is discussed in depth in Goldziher, Muslim Studies, I, esp. pp. 45ffV] 
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new horizons for investigation. Among the tribes there quickly 
developed a spirit of partisanship ('asabiya) for and pride in 
the particular garrison towns, or amsar, in which these tribes 
lived. Moreover, general political developments in the early 
days served to consolidate tribal alignments, and also to in­
crease the interest in them. Added to this was the fact that 
information pertaining to the conquests was important for its 
bearing on the settlement of the tribes in the amsar, and on 
administrative plans in general. The Umayyads encouraged 
studies on such topics, which during the period of their rule 
were an indispensable part of a good education.48 

The second century A.H. witnessed MbArtyiin, philologists, 
and genealogists engaged in vigorous activity each in his own 
field. The akhbariyiin, or narrators of akhbar, "accounts" or 
"stories," represented the line of historical studies, in which 
the others also had a role to play. But at the same time, the 
works of such scholars, especially in the early period, indicate 
that the various aspects of their interests and writings at times 
intermingled. During the first two centuries A.H., the activi­
ties of these scholars were concentrated in Kufa and Basra, 
two bustling centers of the Arab tribes. This gives the Iraqi 
accounts a predominant position in this perspective on histor­
ical writing. 

Qisas and akhbar on the great deeds of the tribes were told 
in evening gatherings (majdlis) of the tribe or governor, or in 
the mosque, and were customarily regarded as the collective 
property of the families or tribes. There also appeared trans­
mitters, ruwat, who passed down scattered akhbdr or poetry. 
If we know very little about the transmitters of verse, we know 
a great deal about the ruwat who transmitted reports in prose. 

48 Ibn al-Nadlm, Fihrtst, edited by Gustav Fliigel (Leipzig, 1871-72), p. 
89; also Salah al-Din al-Munajjid's introduction to 1Umar ibn Yiisuf, Turfat 
al-ashab fi ma'rifat al-ansab, edited by Κ. V. Zettersteen (Damascus, 1369/ 
1949), pp. 6ff. 
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At the dawn of the second century A.H. the inclination to 
collect these Mbar and relate them in continuous organized 
fashion, arranged according to subject or event, emerges into 
our view in written form. The Mbatiyiin were thus the first 
historians in the tribal perspective. In their gathering of his­
torical materials they consulted family and tribal accounts, and 
also other accounts in circulation in the garrison town. These 
they supplemented, especially on matters concerning the 
Rashidun caliphate, with accounts from Medina. There were 
also government registers in Iraq and Syria, most notably the 
Diwan al-khatam, or iiDiwan of the Seal," and similarly the 
army dtwans in which the tribes were registered. It is probable 
that the Mbariyiin made use of these as well. The influence 
of the Islamic framework on these authors is confirmed by the 
fact that they could not disregard the isnad. Though they used 
it freely and somewhat carelessly, its gradually increasing im­
portance among the Mbariyun indicates the continuity of the 
influence of the Islamic perspective on the writing of history. 
The collection of Mbar was part of a phase of general culture, 
that of the gathering of hadith and other accounts in each 
individual province. 

The writings of the first Mbariyun have not survived to 
modern times, thus our assessment of their work is restricted 
to the extracts which have come down to us by way of such 
later historians as al-Tabari and al-Baladhuri. Let us now look 
at some of these Mbariyiin. 

Let us begin with Abu Mikhnaf (d. 157/774), a Kufan M-
bdri with an interest in genealogies.49 He authored more than 
thirty books in which he wrote about the Ridda, the con­
quests in Syria and Iraq, the shiim, Siffin, on subsequent events 

49 His grandfather was one of the devoted followers of 'All and was killed 
at Siffin. See al-Tabari, Ta'rikb, I, 3302f. [Abu Mikhnaf has since been stud­
ied in detail in Ursula Sezgin, Abil Mibnaf: eitt Beitrag zur Historiographie der 
ummyadischen Zeit (Leiden, 1971); cf. also EI2,1, 140 (H.A.R. Gibb); Peter­
sen, 'Alt and Mu'Awiya, pp. 55ff.; G/4S, I, 308f.] 
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in Iraq up until the end of the Umayyad period (especially 
battles and revolutionary movements), and on the Kharijites. 
He is esteemed as one of the most distinguished akhbanyun 

of Iraq.50 

Abu Mikhnaf was somewhat indulgent in his use of the 
isnad.51 He used family accounts, especially on the subject of 
SifKn,52 and relied heavily on the accounts of his own tribe of 
al-Azd.53 He also profited from other Kufan accounts, taking 
material, for example, from al-Sha'bi and from the ruwat of 
such other tribes as Tamlm, Hamdan, Tayyi', and Kinda. All 
of this he complemented with accounts from Medina.54 We 
note that he transmits his accounts through many chains of 
authority, and that these change with the shifts from one event 
to another, a feature characteristic of the early akhbartyiin. 

Abu Mikhnaf usually presents the Iraqi (Kufan) version of 
events. He is more favorably inclined to Iraq as opposed to 
Syria, because of the tendency of the tribes to take pride in 
their own provinces; and for the same reason he favors the 
tAlids as opposed to the Umayyads. Similarly, the tendency 
of the tribes to boast of their own exploits at times is mirrored 
in his accounts.55 Nevertheless, his narratives are generally free 
of factional bias. 

The writing of Abu Mikhnaf shows us a continuous unin-

50 Ibn Qutayba, Kitab al-ma'arif, edited by Ferdinand Wiistenfeld (Gottin-
gen, 1850), p. 267 [edited by Tharwat 'Ukasha (Cairo, 1960), p. 537]; Ibn 
al-Nadlm, Fibrist, p. 93; Yaqut, Mu'jam al-udaba, VI, 220f.; al-Kutubl, 
Fawat al-wafayat (Cairo, A.H. 1283), II, 175 [edited by Ihsan 1Abbas (Beirut, 
1973-74), III, 225f.]. 

51 Hadith scholars regarded his isnad as weak. See Ibn Qutayba, loc. cit.\ al-
Kutubi, loc. cit. [cf. also the detailed account of Abu Mikhnafs use of the 
isnad in Sezgin, Ahu Mihnef, pp. 66fF.]. 

52Al-Tabari, Tankh,\ 3202f., 3266, 3383; II, 122. 
53Ibid., I, 3276ff., 3283, 3288, 3349, 3396, 3430, 3438; II, 111. 
54 See al-Baladhuri, Ansab al-ashraf, vol. V, edited by S.D.F. Goitein (Je­

rusalem, 1936), p. 31 [vol. IV, i, edited by Ihsan 'Abbas (Wiesbaden, 1979), 
p. 519]; al-Tabari, Ta'rikh, I, 3403. 

55 Al-Baladhuri, Ansab al-ashraf, V, 19f. ['Abbas ed., IV, i, 504, 506]; al-
Tabari, Ta'rikh, I, 3202f., 3270, 3323fF. 
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terrupted narrative, although sometimes the account does not 
hold together very well.u At times his writing presents a fas­
cinating and animated image of events, full of speeches and 
dialogues, and on some occasions it is mixed with poetry.56 

In such manner he reflects the influence of evening story-ses­
sions, and stylistically, somewhat of the approach of the ayyam 
tales. 

tAwana ibn al-Hakam (d. 147/764), another Kufan akh-
bati, was well versed in poetry and genealogy.57 He wrote a 
book entitied Slrat Muawiya wa-bani Umayya, "Lives of 
Mu'awiya and the Umayyads," which in all likelihood was a 
history of the dynasty dealing with the Umayyad caliphs in 
consecutive order.58 His other work, Kitab al-ta'rikh, dealt 
with Islamic history in the first century A.H. The quotations 
taken from him demonstrate that he wrote about the Rashi-
dun caliphs, the Ridda, and the conquests—subjects on which 
he is particularly reliable—the struggle between 'Ali and his 
adversaries, the abdication of al-Hasan, and the affairs of Iraq 
and Syria up to the end of the era of tAbd al-Malik ibn Mar-
wan. 

tAwana5S accounts are indicative of inside knowledge of 
Umayyad affairs.59 He probably took this information from 
the pro-Umayyad tribe of Kalb in particular, for he does take 
pride in his knowledge of this tribe.60 tAwana most often 
presents the Umayyad as opposed to the Iraqi version of 

u [See W. Fischer, "Die Prosa des Abu Mihnaf J" in Islamwissenschaftliche 
Abhandlungen, edited by Richard Gramlich (Wiesbaden, 1974), pp. 96ff.] 

56 Al-BaladhurI, Ansab al-ashraf, V, 34f. ['Abbas ed., IV, i, 522f.], 300f.; 
al-Tabari, Ta'rtkh, I, 3296ff., 3303f. 

57 Ibn al-Nadim, Fihrist, p. 134; Yaqvit, Mujam al-udaba, VI, 94. [Cf. 
also EP, I, 760 (Saleh el-Ali); Petersen, 'Alt and Mu'Awiya, pp. 53ff.; GAS, 
I, 307f.] 

58 See Rosenthal, Muslim Historiography, p. 92 [2nd ed., pp. 89f.]. 
59 See al-Baladhurl, Ansab al-ashraf, V, 132ft'., 159; al-Tabari, Ta'rtkh, II, 

197f., 239f., 791ff. 
60 Yaqvit, Mu'jam al-udaba, VI, 95. 



46 The Rise of Historical Writing Among the Arabs 

events,61 which explains the somewhat pro-Umayyad tone ap­
parent in some of his accounts. This even reaches the point 
where the Umayyad emphasis on the concept of divine fore-
ordainment, jabr, in the interpretation of events, is reflected 
in his accounts.62 Nevertheless, he does at times cite Iraqi and 
Medinan accounts which reflect views of groups opposed to 
the Umayyads.63 It can thus be said that 'Awana was not 
partial to any particular side. 

The accounts of cAwana have reached us by way of Ibn al-
Kalbi, al-Mada'inl, and al-Haytham ibn tAd!, who took them 
either directly from him or from his books.64 His design for 
the writing of general history based on chronological se­
quence or on the lives of the caliphs represents a pioneering 
step in the development of historical writing within the tribal 
perspective. 'Awana was erratic in his use of the isnad,65 and 
the way he cites poetry in his akbbar reflects the influence of 
the style of the ayyam tales.66 

The Kufan Sayf ibn 'Umar (d. 180/796) wrote two books. 
The first, a work novel in its historical viewpoint, deals with 
the Ridda and the conquests and combines the two move­
ments into one; and the second covers the fitna, particularly 
the Battle of the Camel. Sayf basically presents the Iraqi view­
point, and benefits primarily from the accounts of his own 
tribe of Tamlm. His akhbar on the conquests (especially on 
the conquest of Iraq) are favorable to Tamim and tend to be 
romantic, in line with the ayyam style. Sayf did, however, make 
use of Medinan accounts in his akhbar. Hisham ibn 'Urwa 

61 Al-Tabari, Ta'rikh, II, 420f. 
62 See al-Baladhuri, Ansab al-ashraf, V, 140, 194ff.; also vol. XI, edited by 

Wilhelm Ahlwardt (Greifswald, 1883), p. 40. 
63Ibid., XI, 19ff. (siding with the Zubayrids), 59ff. (against al-Hajjaj); al-

Tabari, Ta'rikh, II, 9ff. (against Kufa), 309ff. (with the 'Alids). See Yaqut, 
Mujam al-udabH\ VI, 94f. 

64Al-Tabari, Ta'rikh, II, 113, 189, 421, 424. 
65 See Yaqut, Mu'jam al-udaba, VI, 94. 
66 Al-Baladhuri, Ansab al-ashraf, XI, 38ff.; al-Tabarl, Ta'rikh, II, 463ff. 
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and Ibn Ishaq were among the ruwat from whom he took 
information.67 

Nasr ibn Muzahim (d. 212/827) ,v another Kufan, was the 
first Shfi akhbari. His books revolved around subjects impor-
tant to the Shf a: 'The Battle of the Camel," "The Battle of 
Siffin," "The Murder of al-Husayn," 'The Murder of Hujr ibn 
'Adi," "History (akhbar) of al-Mukhtar," and "Merits" (ma-
naqib), i.e., of the Shfi imams.68 The printed text of his Siffin 
could also be reconstructed based on the extant quotations 
from it, and it is possible for us to examine the work to gain 
an approximate idea of its character. In Siffin we find that 
Nasr ibn Muzahim was of Iraqi and Shfi inclinations: he cites 
hadith against Mu'awiya and his faction, and presents hadith 
materials, akhbar, and even qisas in order to buttress the cause 
of 'All.69 Nevertheless, in discussing the faults of Mu'awiya 
he does not conceal some of the criticism directed against the 
'Alid faction by its adversaries. Some later authors criticized 
Nasr severely for his partisan tendencies, while others com-
mended him.70 

Nasr gives us a story throbbing with life and vitality on the 
events which led to the battle of Siffin and ended with the 

67 See al-Tabari, Ta'rikh, I, 1798f., 1871; Ibn Hajar, Tahdhib al-tahdblb 
(Haydarabad, A.H. 1325-27), IV, 295f. On Sayf, cf. Wellhausen, Prolego-
mena, pp. 3ff.; [£7l, IV, 73; Petersen, Alt and Mu'awiya, pp. 78ff.; Rosen-
thal, Muslim Historiography, p. 188; GAS, I, 311f.; also the reconstruction of 
some of his most important narratives in Ahmad Ratib 'Armush, Al-Fitna 
wa-waq'at al-jamal (Beirut, 1391/1972)]. 

v [See Carl Brockelmann, "Nasr ibn Muzahim: der alteste Geschichtschrei-
ber der Schia," ZS, IV (1926), pp. Iff.; Petersen, Alt and Mu'awiya, pp. 
104ff.; Rosenthal, Muslim Historiography, p. 64; GAS, I, 313; Sezgin, Abu 
Mihnaf, pp. 47f., 123ff.] 

68 Ibn al-Nadlm, Fihrist, p. 93; Yaqut, Mu'jam al-udaba', VII, 210; al-
Dhahabl, Mizan al-i'tidal flnaqd al-njdl (Cairo, A.H. 1325), III, 232. 

69 Nasr ibn Muzahim, Waq'at Siffin, edited by 'Abd al-Salam Muhammad 
Harun (Cairo, A.H. i365), pp. 35, 158, 164f., 246f. 

70 Yaqut, Mu'jam al-udaba, VII, 210; Ibn Hajar, Lisan al-mizdn (Hay-
darabad, A.H. 1329-31), VI, 157; Ibn Abl l-Hadld, Sharh nahj al-balagha 
(Cairo, A.H, 1329), I, 71 [edited by Muhammad Abu 1-Fadl Ibrahim (Cairo, 
1959-64), I, 210ff.]. 
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arbitration between 'All and Mu'awiya. His accounts are full 
of poetry, dialogue, and speeches. Much of this poetry is fab­
ricated: we see all of the prominent personalities reciting verse, 
either of their own creation or quoted from others, and even 
adducing it in correspondence. The book is semi-folkloric, a 
collection of akhbar strung together in a somewhat disjointed 
fashion. It is worthy of note that Mu'awiya appears in the 
book as a tribal shaykh, and even some of the statements made 
by Abii Sufyan in pre-Islamic Mecca are here put in the mouth 
of Mu'awiya. It will be noticed that Nasr was negligent in 
matters of dating, and extremely careless in his use of the is-
nad.71 His style of writing is clearly patterned after that of the 
ayyam tales and reflective of evening social gatherings. In 
keeping with the method of the ayyam tales, Nasr ends his 
book with a list of the names of the prominent supporters of 
'All who died at Siffin. Finally, however, we should point out 
that the fact that it is possible to reconstruct the book, pri­
marily from selections taken up by al-Tabari and Ibn AbI 1-
Hadid, indicates its value in the eyes of the historians. 

The studies of the akhbariyiin reach their apogee with al-
Mada'inl (d. 135-225/752-839),w a Basran who later lived in 
Baghdad. The isnad was of stronger influence on him than on 
his predecessors because of cultural developments.72 With him 
there appears an orientation towards more comprehensive 
gathering and more extensive organization of historical ac-

71 Siffin, pp. 42, 43, 158, 167. 
w [On al-Mada'ini, see EI1, III, 81f. (C.Brockelmann): S.D.F. Goitein's 

introduction to al-Baladhuri, Ansab al-ashraf, V, 14ff.; Pellat, Le Milieu bas-
rien, pp. 144f.; Petersen, 'Alt and Mu'awiya, pp. 92ff.; Rosenthal, Muslim 
Historiography, pp. 69f.; GAS, I, 314f.; Gemot Rotter, "Zur LJberlieferung 
einiger historischer Werke Mada'inls in Tabaris Annaien," Oriens, XXIII-XXIV 
(1974), pp. 103ff.; Badri Muhammad Fahad, Shaykh al-akhbanyin; Abti l-
Hasan al-Mada'ini (Najaf, 1975); Lawrence I. Conrad, "Arabic Plague 
Chronologies and Treatises: Social and Historical Factors in the Formation 
of a Literary Genre," Studia Islamica, LIV (1981), pp. 61fF.] 

72 See Yaqflt, Mu'jam al-udaba, V, 309. 
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counts, endeavors which had become feasible by al-Mada'inl's 
time because of the work of earlier authors. We thus see him 
borrowing from such earlier authors as Abu Mikhnaf, Ibn Is-
haq, and al-Waqidi, adding to these his own special re­
searches. It appears that he synthesized historical and literary 

studies. A look at the long list of his compositions and books,x 

totalling about 240, clearly indicates that he occupied himself 
with studies ranging from the life of the Prophet to 'Abbasid 
history and covered, among other subjects, the conquests, ca­
liphs, tribal notables (ashmf), battles, and poets. One of his 
works, Nasab Quraysh wa-akhbaruha, "Genealogies and Nar­
ratives on Quraysh,"73 was written along the lines of the books 

of genealogy. Some of his books, such as those pertaining to 
the life of the Prophet, comprised nothing more than chapters 
of the sim. His history of the caliphate, Akhbar al-khulafa' al-

kabir, appears to have been his most extensive historical work, 
in that it covered the period from the caliphate of Abu Bakr 
up until al-Mu'tasim, and was written according to the method 
of the akhbariyun. 

Al-Mada'inl's research and strictness represent a step above 
his predecessors. He apparently followed the method of the 
hadith scholars in his criticism of his sources, and thus came 
to enjoy greater confidence than his predecessors. Moreover, 
he borrowed more extensively from the Medinan sources than 
had those who had preceded him, and also used Basran ac­
counts to good advantage, particularly on the subjects of the 
Kharijites, the city of Basra, and the conquests of Khurasan 
and Transoxania. On the events and subjects with which he 
dealt, al-Mada'inl offered more extensive and more balanced 
narratives than his predecessors did. Al-Mada'ini became a 

x [See Fahad, Shaykh al-akbbariyin, pp. 20ff., for a detailed list of these 
works; also Pellat's classification in Le Milieu basrien, p. 144.] 

73 See Ibn al-Nadlm, Fihrist, p. 102. 
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fundamental source for later historians, and modern research 
has confirmed the accuracy of his work. 

V. 

Genealogical studies rendered service to historical writing 
in both content and compositional format.^ Interest in ge­
nealogies revived in Islam,74 and establishment of the diwan 
system introduced a new incentive for interest in them. The 
Umayyads, beginning with Mu'awiya, encouraged such stud­
ies as these, and it is reported that Walid II (d. 126/744) 
commmanded that a complete register of the genealogies of 
the tribes be made.75 Administrative exigencies, such as the 
organization of a system for paying stipends ('ata) and the 
allotment of residential quarters and lands to the tribes in the 
arnar, further contributed to the recording of genealogical 
registers and intensified interest in them. Added to this were 
tribal disputes, the effect of political circumstances on the sta­
tus of the tribes, the appearance of a new aristocracy in Islam, 
and various social factors, all of which spurred the study of 
tribal genealogies. Finally, disputations with the Shu'ublya 
and the attacks by partisans of the movement on Arab ge­
nealogies led to a new Arab emphasis on genealogical studies. 

Genealogical information was available in poetry, especially 
in polemic verse, or the naqaid, in family and tribal sources, 
and in the rosters of the army registers. The first genealogists 
appeared in the Umayyad period, and their concerns were lim­
ited to the genealogies of one particular tribe. It was not until 
later, when accounts were being gathered together in the sec­
ond/eighth century, that genealogists appeared who were in­
terested in the genealogies of more than one tribe. 

y [On the evolution and character of Arab genealogical studies, see the 
important work of Werner Caskel, Gambarat an-Nasab: das genealogtsche Werke 
des Htsam ibn Muhammad, al-Kalbi (Leiden, 1966), I, 23ff.] 

74 See al-Munajjid's introduction to the Kitab turfat al-ashai. 
75 Ibn al-Nadlm, Fibrist, p. 91. 
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The first to write on the ansab was Abu Yaqzan al-Nassaba 
(d. 190/805). None of his works have survived except as quo­
tations in later books, but these fragments provide the first 
evidence of the gathering of genealogies, primarily from tribal 
sources. 

Cultural developments, and also the strong connections be­
tween genealogy, akhbar, and literary studies, manifest them­
selves in the works of two authors from the Arab tribe of 
Kalb. Muhammad ibn al-Sa'ib al-Kalbl (d. 146/763)2 under­
took studies in genealogy, philology, and history. His studies 
on genealogy are indicative of an effort to collect the tribal 
accounts on the subject, relying, so he claims, on the most 
learned genealogist of each tribe.76 In addition, he consulted 
polemic verse and studied the naqaid of al-Farazdaq under 
the guidance of the great poet himself. Although scholars of 
badlth criticized him and suspected him of extremist Shfi bias, 
there was general agreement on his ability as a genealogist.77 

His son Hisham ibn Muhammad al-Kalbl (d. 204/819)a fol­
lowed up and improved on his father's studies on genealogy. 
It appears that his book Jamharat al-nasab, "Compendium of 
Genealogy," part of which is found in the British Museum,b 

was an expanded edition of his father's work and contained 
brief notices, some of them important, on famous men of all 

2 [See Petersen, 'Ali and Muawiya, pp. 73ff.; Caskel, Gamharat an-Nasab, 
I, 72ff.; EP, IV, 495 (W. AtaUah).] 

76 Ibn al-Nadlm, Fihrist, p. 140. See also Ibn Sa'd, VI, 249; Ibn Khallikan, 
Wafayat cd-a'yan (Cairo), I, 624f. ['Abbas ed., IV, 309ff.]; Ibn Hajar, Tab-
dhtb al-tahdhib, IX, 180. 

77 See Ibn Khallikan, Wafayat al-a'yan (Cairo), I, 625 ['Abbas ed., IV, 
309f.]; Ibn Hajar, TabdMb al-tahdhib, IX, 180. 

? [See Petersen, 'Ali and Mu'awiya, pp. 76ff.; Caskel, Gambarat an-Nasab, 
I, 75ff.; EP, IV, 495f. (W. AtaUah).] 

B [MS. Add. 23297; other manuscript material also exists. The contents of 
the entire work have been exhaustively studied and tabulated by Caskel in the 
work mentioned above. Cf. also M. J. Kister and M. Plessner, "Notes on 
Caskel's Gamharat an-Nasab," Oriens, XXV-XXVI (1976), pp. 48ff.; 'Abd al-
'Aziz al-Dtiri, "Kutub al-ansab wa-ta'rlkh al-jazlra," Journal of the Jordan 
Arab Academy, II (1979), pp. 5ff.] 
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later times. Al-Hamdani, however, considers it deficient in the 
genealogies it gives for the tribes of Yemen. 

In his historical studies, Hisham ibn al-Kalbi discussed the 
history of the ancient prophets, the Arabian peninsula in pre-
Islamic times; the battle-days (ayyam) of the Arab tribes, Ira­
nian history, and Islamic history. His akhbar came from a va­
riety of sources, and some of his evidence was documentary. 
On the history of the ancient prophets he borrowed from the 
ahl al-kitab, and for the history of Iran he relied on transla­
tions from the Persian and on Arabic akhbar and qisas then in 
common circulation. He also borrowed from the books of 
'Awana and Abu Mikhnaf. He displays sound judgment, es­
pecially in his use of written sources and of documents from 
the churches of al-Hira, which pertained to the history of the 
Arabs of al-Hira and the relations between the Arabs and the 
Sasanians. But he was not as rigorous as he should have been, 
for he took much information from popular qisas tales (espe­
cially on the history of Yemen), legendary sources, and some 
of the fabricated akhbar about pre-Islamic poets.78 

Also among the genealogists was Mustab al-Zubayri (d. 
233-36/847-50),c a descendant of Ibn al-Zubayr. Mus'ab was 
a scholar learned in the ayyam and in genealogy, and wrote 
two books: Al-Nasab al-kabir, "Great Book of Genealogy," 
and Nasab Quraysh, "Genealogy of Quraysh." The second of 
these has survived to modern times and is considered the best 
book on Quraysh genealogy. The plan of the book indicates 
that he adhered to a specific framework for writing, one which 
Ibn al-Kalbi had followed before him, and which al-Baladhuri 
would follow later on. He refers in the book to al-Zuhri, to 
his father, to other genealogists, and sometimes to certain ru-

78 See Ibn al-Nadlm, Fihrist, p. 143; Ajjhani, IX, 19; Yaqiit, Mu'jam al-
udabH\ VI, 259; al-Dhahabi, Tadbktrca al-huffaz, I, 313. 

c [On this writer, see GAS, I, 271f.; E. Levi-Prove^aTs introduction to his 
edition of al-Zubayrfs Nasab Quraysh (Cairo, 1953), pp. 5ff.; also his "Le 
Kitab nasabQuraysh de Mus'ab al-Zubayri," Arabtca, I (1954), pp. 92ff.] 
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wot.79 He also gives the impression that he relied on various 
oral accounts. The book sheds particularly strong light on the 
shifts in tribal alignments and on changes in genealogical lines 
of descent.80 In addition to genealogical lines of descent, al-
Zubayri offers akhbar, some of them detailed and important, 
on some of the most important personalities from JahilIya times 
up to his own day.81 He quotes poetry, especially for the early 
period, to document or corroborate a prose account. In gen­
eral the book demonstrates the value of genealogical studies 
to historical writing. 

When we come to al-Haytham ibn 'AdT (d. 206/821)d we 
see another example of the coalescence of historical and ge­
nealogical studies, a synthesis arising from different ap­
proaches to the study of history.82 Al-Haytham's Ta'rikh al-
ashmf al-kabir, "Great History of the Notables," was a work 
of history in the genealogical framework which was the ante­
cedent to the Ansab al-ashmf of al-Baladhuri. He also wrote, 
in the style of the tabaqat, a history of jurists and hadlth schol­
ars entitled Tabaqat al-fuqaha wa-l-muhaddithin\ this was 
probably the first work of its kind in the tribal perspective. 
Aspects of his interests in regional affairs appear in his two 
books on the administrative and residential districts, or khitat, 
of Kufa and Basra. Each of these gave a history of the city 
and included topographical and geographical information. Our 
attention is drawn particularly to his work Kitab al-ta'rikh 
'ala l-sintn, "Book of History According to the Years," a book 

79 Nasab Quraysh, pp. 229, 246. 
80 Ibid., pp. 5, 7. 
81 Ibid., pp. 4, 128, 145, 147. 
d [See EP, III, 328 (C. Pellat); GAS, I, 272.] 
82 Al-Haytham ibn 'Adi wrote more than fifty books (see Ibn al-Nadlm, 

Fihrist, pp. 99f.; Yaqut, Mujam al-udaba, VII, 265f.) covering the geneal­
ogies of the tribes, accounts of their histories and great families, the mathalib, 
or "faults," the governors of the amsdr, the quarters of these cities, and other 
subjects such as the Kharijites and Persian history. 
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on Islamic history chronologically arranged by year.83 Al-
Haytham ibn 'AdI is criticized, however, for being somewhat 
inaccurate and for using the isnad loosely.84 

It was during the second century A.H. that philologists be-
gan to play a role in the study of history.e Tribal outlooks, 

83 Selections from the works of al-Haytham ibn 'AdI survive in the histo-
ries of al-Tabarl and al-Baladhuri as follows: 1. Historical periods (number 
of years), from Adam to the Hijra (al-Tabarl, Ta'rikh, I, 1072); these are 
probably from his book Hubut Adam wa-tftiraq al-'arab fi nuziiliha manazi-
lahd, "Fall of Adam and the Dispersal of the Arab Tribes as They Settled in 
Their Homelands." 2. Names of some of the secretaries of the Prophet, Abu 
Bakr, and 'Umar (al-Tabari, II, 836), also names of secretaries of the Umayyad 
caliphs from Yazld ibn 'Abd al-Malik to Ibrahim ibn al-Walld (ibid., II, 838). 
3. The Umayyad Period—Here there appear akhbdr on Yazld ibn Mu'awiya 
(al-Baladhuri, Ansdb cd-ashmf, vol. IVB, edited by Max Schloessinger, Jeru-
salem, 1938, pp. 1, 8 ['Abbas ed., IV, i, 286, 295]), the movement of Ibn 
al-Zubayr and the battle of al-Harra (Ansdb, IVB, 21, 30, 39, 40, 42, 49 
['Abbas ed., IV, i, 309, 319, 329, 330, 333, 340f.]), 'Ubayd Allah ibn Ziyad 
{Ansdb, IVB, 81, 83, 84, 101 ['Abbas ed., IV, i, 378, 381, 382f., 401]), 
Marwan ibn al-Hakam (Ansdb, V, 136, 152, 155, 159), the days of'Abd al-
Malik and Ibn al-Zubayr (Ansdb, V, 191), the affair of the Tawwabun, or 
"penitents" (Ansdb, V, 212, 231), Ibrahim ibn al-Ashtar, Mus'ab ibn al-
Zubayr, and the batde of Harura' (Ansdb, V, 251, 263, 275, 282), the affair 
of Zufar ibn al-Harith and the murder of Mus'ab (Ansdb, V, 296, 305, 335), 
other akhbdr on 'Abd al-Malik and his entry into Kufa (Ansdb, V, 345f., 
352), and some akhbdr on Hisham ibn 'Abd al-Malik and Khalid al-Qasri 
(al-Tabarl, II, 1655, 1658, 1668). 4. Al-Haytham also relates akhbar on the 
'Abbasid dynasty which primarily pertain to al-Mansur, e.g., his designation 
as successor, the swearing of allegiance to him, the construction of Baghdad, 
and his death (al-Tabarl, III, 89, 273, 278, 401, 411, 420, 429, 456). There 
is also some material on al-Mahdl (al-Tabarl, III, 532). 

It appears that most of his akhbdr were taken from his written works, since 
the account given on his authority begins by saying, "Al-Haytham ibn 'AdI 
said (quia)," or "related (dhakarn)." Other accounts do, however, come from 
him via oral transmission. Also, in the quotations taken from him there ap-
pears only a single account or khabar on each topic or event; no differing 
accounts on the same subject appear. 

84 See Ibn al-Nadlm, Fihrist, p. 145; Yaqut, Mu'jam al-udaba', VII, 261; 
Ibn Khallikan, Wafayat al-a'yan (Cairo), II, 269 ['Abbas ed., VI, 106ff.]. 

e [For further details on these developments, see Pellat, Le Milieu basrien, 
pp. 128ff.; H. Fleisch, "Esquisse d'un historique de la grammaire arabe," 
Arabica, IV (1957), pp. Iff.; Abbott, Studies, III, 25ff., 153ff.; Muhammad 
Husayn A1 Yasln, Al-Dirdsdt al-lugbawiya 'inda I- arab ild nihdyat al-qarn al-
thdlith (Beirut, 1400/1980); Ramzi Baalbaki, "Arab Grammatical Controver-
sies and the Extant Sources of the Second and Third Centuries A.H." in Studia 
Arabica etlslamica: Festschrift for Ihsdn 'Abbas on his Sixtieth Birthday, edited 
by Wadad al-Qadl (Beirut, 1981), pp. Iff.] 
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tribal rivalries, and now philological needs—all these served 
to focus scholarly attention on poetry. The cultural struggle 
between the Arabs and non-Arabs, or 'ajam, after the emer­
gence of the Shu'ublya movement, placed particular emphasis 
on this field of study.85 

Poetry was transmitted by bedouin ruwdt who customarily 
prefaced their recitation with a prose introduction explaining 
the circumstances of its composition and clarifying the histor­
ical references it contained. Some philologists, alongside their 
interest in questions of grammar and philology, began to show 
interest in the akhbar and genealogies which appeared in po­
etry or to which poets referred, and so began to show an 
inclination towards the writing of history. Among those rep­
resentative of this trend was Abu cAmr ibn al-'Ala', "the 
most learned of men on the Arab tribes, the Arabic language, 
variant readings of the Qur'an, poetry, and the battle-days of 
the Arabs."86 

Representative of the same perspective was Abu tUbayda 
(110-211/728-826)/ a student of Abii 'Amr ibn al-'Ala . Abu 
'Ubayda based his work on that of his teachers (such as Abu 
'Amr and Yunus ibn Habib). He also directed his attention 
to the bedouin ruwat and gathered together the accounts they 
were transmitting, which for the most part pertained to their 
own tribes. Interest in the accounts of these ruwat encouraged 
them to come to the towns—especially to the Mirbad of Basra— 
where some of them settled down.s Abu 1Ubayda undertook 
wide-ranging studies which extended over almost the entire 

85 Al-Jahiz, Al-Bayan wa-l-tabyin, edited by 'Abd al-Salam Muhammad Ha-
riin (Cairo, 1367-70/1948-50), III, 366. [Cf. Goldziher, Muslim Studies, I, 
98ff.; 'Abd al-'Αζϊζ al-Durl, Al-Judhur al-ta'rikhiya li-l-sbu'Ubiya (Beirut, 
1962).] 

86Tiha al-Hajiri, "Abu 'Ubayda," Majallat al-katib al-misri, II (1946), p. 
280. [Cf. also Pellat, LeMilieu basrien, pp. 76ff.; EP, I, 105f. (R. Blachcre).] 

f [See Pellat, Le Milieu basrien, pp. 141ff.; EI2, I, 158 (H.A.R. Gibb); Al 
Yasin, Al-Dirasat al-lughawiya, pp. 108fF., 206ff., 388fF.] 

B [The Mirbad was the vast marketplace and social forum of early Basra. 
See Pellat, Le Milieu basrien, pp. Ilf.] 
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range of the accounts transmitted by the northern Arabs. These 
were not only accounts transmitted by the ruwdt, but also 
those handed down in families, tribes, and local areas. Abu 1-
Faraj accordingly ranks Abu cUbayda "among the most 
knowledgeable men on the battle-days, history, poems, ge­
nealogies, and dialects of the Arab tribes,"87 while al-Jahiz 
considers him one of the most learned men of his time, saying, 
"In all the earth there was no one, either orthodox or non-
orthodox, more learned in all fields of knowledge than he 
was."88 Ibn al-Nadim refers to the broad scope of his studies 
in saying, "He possessed the learning of both Islam and the 
JahilIya."89 

Abu tUbayda wrote a great number of books on the history 
of the Arab tribes and of early Islamic times. In writing, his 
approach was that of the philologists, i.e., he gathered the 
accounts pertaining to a particular event or subject together 
in book form. In this way he wrote about the cities and amsar, 

the "boasts" (mafakhir) and "faults" [mathalib) of the tribes, 
history (akhbar), historical personalities, battles, factions (the 
Kharijites), judges, and the mawali, in addition to other stud­
ies on hadith, the Qur'an, and poetry. He was so renowned 
for his learning on the battle-days of the Arab tribes that Abu 
1-'Abbas al-Mubarrad dubbed him the most learned of all his 
peers "on the ayyam and akhbar of the Arab tribes," a distinc­
tion also accorded to him by Ibn Qutayba.90 In later times, 
his studies on the ayyam became a fundamental source for 
historians.91 

Abu 1Ubayda made an effort to be a rigorous scholar, spec-

87Al-Hajiri, "Abu 'Ubayda," p. 285. 
88Al-KhatIb al-Baghdadl, Ta'rikh Baghdad, XIII, 252; Yaqflt, Mujarn cd-

tidaba, VI, 165. 
s9Fihrist, p. 53. 
90 Yaqiit, Mujam cd-udaba, VI, 165. 
91 See Mahmud Ghannawl, Naqa'td Jarir wa-l-Farazdaq: dtrasa adabiya 

ta'rikbiya (Baghdad, 1954), Chapter I. 



The Rise cf History Among the Arabs 57 

ifying his ruwat, giving different accounts of a given subject, 
and sometimes offering a succession of mutually complemen­
tary accounts for the sake of clarity. In his akhbar on the bat-
tie-days he faithfully reflects both the spirit and the literary 
style of the bedouin ruwat. Abu tUbayda relied primarily on 
his written notes and records, not on memory, and in this 
respect was representative of the level of culture in the era in 
which he lived. Indeed, it was said of him, "Abu 'Ubayda 
was a scholar as long as he was left with his books to read"; 
also that "the register (diwan) of the Arab tribes rests in his 
house."92 

Abu 1Ubayda assumed a position unfavorable to the Arabs 
in the cultural conflict between the Arabs and the Shu'ublya. 
He wrote a Kitab al-mawalt in which he apparently discussed 
the non-Arab Muslims, and also an Akhbar al-furs (or "Merits 
of the Persians," Fada'il al-furs, as Ibn al-Nadim calls it) in 
which he presented pro-Persian akhbar. Similarly, he wrote a 
great deal on the mathalib, or "faults," of the Arabs. All of 
this is consistent with the cultural line of the Shu'Qbiya move­
ment. He is not suspected of retouching his accounts and his 
scholarly reputation is very high, but his akhbar bring to light 
some repugnant personal faults.93 It is probable that Abu 
tUbayda was one of those ShutQbis referred to as the Ahl al-
taswiya, "proponents of equality"; this is consistent with state­
ments linking him to the Kharijites.94 

92 Ibn al-Nadim, Fihrist, p. 53; al-Khatlb al-Baghdadi, Tarikh Baghdad, 
XIII, 252; Yaqiit, Mu'jam al-udaba, VI, 164; al-Yafi'I, Mtr'at al-jamn wa-
'ibrat al-yaqzan (Haydarabad, A.H. 1337-39), II, 44, 46; Ibn al-'Imad, Sha-
dharat al-dhahab, II, 24. [The first of these two quotations compares Abfl 
1Ubayda unfavorably with al-Asma'I, who had no need of books to dem­
onstrate his learning.] 

93 See Ibn al-Nadim, Fihrist, p. 53; al-Tha'alibi, Lataif al-ma'arif, edited 
by P. de Jong (Leiden, 1867), p. 63 [edited by Ibrahim al-Abyari and Hasan 
Kamil al-Sayrafi (Cairo, 1960), p. 99, mentioning Abfl 'Ubayda in a list of 
notorious sodomists], 

94Ibn Qutayba, Ma'arif, p. 269 ['Ukasha ed., p. 543]; idem, KttAb al-
'arab, edited by Muhammad Kurd 'All in his Rasd'U al-bulagha\ 3rd ed. 
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The Shu'ublya movement had a definite impact on histor­
ical studies, since its partisans schemed against the Arabs and 
made a special effort to distort their history. This in turn caused 
the Arabs to react unequivocally by addressing themselves to 
a broad-ranging study of their own history and literature.95 

The Shu'ubiya and the secretarial class, or kuttab, were re­
sponsible for the broadening interest in the culture and heri­
tage of the Persians, and the second century A.H. witnessed a 
widespread popular movement to translate works from Per­
sian. Books both historical and pseudo-historical were trans­
lated, the most important of these being the Khoday-namag, 
which Ibn al-Muqaffac (d. 144/760) translated from the Pah-
Iavi (Middle Persian) and entided Siyar al-muluk, "Lives of 
the Kings." Other direct translations were made of the same 
book, which likewise appeared in other forms as translations 
with additions of myths and historical akhbar from other Pah-
Iavi works. Other literary works on the same subject relied on 
these translations.96 

The Khoday-nwmag presents the story of Iranian national 
history as viewed by the nobility and religious authorities. It 
contains fabulous tales and legends from the Avesta, religious 

(Cairo, 1365/1946), p. 346; Yaqut, Mu'jam al-udaba, VI, 164; al-Hajirf, 
"Abu 'Ubayda," p. 414. Also see Ignaz Goldziher, Muhammedanische Studien 
(Halle, 1889-90), I, 194ff. [=Mttslim Studies, I, 179ff.]; Pellat, Le Milieu 
basrien, p. 142ff.; H.A.R. Gibb, "The Social Significance of the Shu'ubiya," 
in Studia orientalia Ioanni Pedersen dicata (Copenhagen, 1953), pp. 105ff. 
[reprinted in Gibb's Studies on the Civilization oflslam, pp. 62ff.]. 

95 See Gibb, "Significance of the Shu'ubiya"; 'Abd al-'AzIz al-Dflri, 
Muqaddimafl ta'rikh sadr al-Islam (Baghdad, 1949), pp. 2ff. [also, in addi­
tion to the studies cited in the previous note, Roy P. Mottahedeh, 'The 
Shu'Ciblyah Controversy and the Social History of Early Islamic Iran," IJMES, 
VII (1976), pp. 161ff.]. 

96 Hamza al-Isfahani found eight different translations of the Khoday-na-
mag, and the mdbedb Bahram ibn Mardanshah made use of twenty transla­
tions; Miisa ibn 'Isa al-Kisrawi found no two copies which could be collated 
together. See Hamza al-Isfahani, Ta'rikh sint muluk al-ard wa-l-anbiya, ed­
ited by J.M.E. Gottwaldt (Leipzig, 1844-48), I, 8f.; al-Biriim, Al-Athar al-
baqiya, edited by Eduard Sachau (Leipzig, 1878), p. 99. 
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traditions, the story of Alexander (taken from outside sources), 
and fanciful genealogies; and it does not distinguish between 
that which is completely incredible, that which is semi-myth-
ical, and information of a truly historical nature. The image it 
gives of the Sasanians is probably more historical than any 
other it contains, but the information known about the Sa-
sanian period up to Yazdagird I was scanty at best; thus the 
gap was filled by extravagant literary pieces and resounding 
speeches. 

Books other than the Khoday-namag were also translated, 
such as the A 'in-namag, "Conventions and Decrees," the Gah-
ndmag, "The Book of Ranks," as well as historical and folk 
tales, and historical works based on the contents of the Kho-
ddy-namag but rearranged in a new order.97 These books in­
troduced a dubious folkloric element, full of mythical content, 
into the corpus of historical material. As the Persians had no 
fixed calendar, there was no chronological year-by-year se­
quence in these works. On the other hand, the method of 
writing history based on a succession of biographies, or siyar, 
was known and followed among the Arabs prior to the ap­
pearance of these translations—it was for this reason that the 
Khoday-ndmag was called Siyar al-mulUk, whereas the term ta-
baqat designated successive generations of descendants.98 Books 
of akhbar on the ruling families thus consisted of a series of 
biographies, siyar, of the successive caliphs. For these reasons 

97 Al-Mas'udi, Al-Tanbih wa-l-ishmf, edited by M. J. de Goeje (Leiden, 
1893), pp. 106ff.; Arthur Christensen, IAran sous Ies Sassanides (Copenhagen, 
1936), pp. 52ft'.; translated by Yahya al-Khashshab as Irrnfi 'ahd al-Sasani-
yin (Cairo, 1957), pp. 52ff.; also West, Grundriss, II, 117; Theodor Noldeke, 
Geschichte der Perser und Araber zur Zeit der Sasaniden (Leiden, 1879); idem, 
Das iranisehe Natwnalepos, 2nd ed. (Berlin and Leipzig, 1920); [translated by 
Leonid T. Bogdanov as The Iranian National Epic (Bombay, 1930)]; K. A. 
Inostrantsev, Iranian Influence on Moslem Literature, translated by G. K. Na-
riman (Bombay, 1918). 

98 Hamza al-Isfahanl, Ta'rikb, I, 8; al-Mas'udl, Al-Tanbth wa-l-ishmf, pp. 
85ff. ' 
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available confused historical material for the period prior to 
Islam, but offered no conception or new design for the writ­
ing of history. The motivating factors behind the translations 
were apparently political and cultural ones." 

Translations were also made from Greek and Syriac. But 
these too were of cultural inspiration, and they contain noth­
ing to indicate that they had any effect on historical writing. 

It is thus clear that the tribal perspective on historical writ­
ing arose from persistent tendencies and antecedent founda­
tions which in Islam found new incentives, new horizons, and 
a new structural framework. The motivating factors were pri­
marily social and political, and to a limited extent, spiritual 
and administrative. Thus the appeal to divine foreordainment 
as an explanation for events, the appeal embraced by the 
Umayyads, found no significant endorsement in such centers 
of opposition to the regime as Kufa and Basra, while the spirit 
of 'asabtya for the various provinces, factional politics, and 
tribal fervor all reflected their influence into historical writing. 
Likewise, cultural associations and developments explain the 
shift from individual accounts transmitted by the ruwat to books 
composed by the akhbatiyun and the genealogists, and from 
oral accounts to written works. The third century A.H. had no 
sooner dawned than we find the two historical perspectives— 
that of Medina, and that of Kufa and Basra—joining together 
in common fields of interest in historical studies, and in com­
mon historical views. 

VI. 

The above-mentioned historical studies produced extensive 
historical material of various degrees of critical rigor. The trend 
towards employment of the critical method of the hadith 
scholars gained strength and established itself in Iraq. There 

99 Al-Jahiz, Al-Bayan wa-l-tabyin, III, 3, 14. 
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emerged, for example, an enthusiasm for travel in search of 
learning, the rihlaβ talab d-'ilm,h in order to pursue one's 

subject for study and collect as much information as possible. 

The hadith scholars initiated this practice, and the historians 
followed after them. Likewise, cultural developments made 

people more acutely aware of and attentive to the importance 

of the collective experiences of the Islamic community and the 

importance of the ijma over a wide range of topics. Finally, 

the fundamental principles and perspectives of Islam gained 
the decisive advantage over the tribal perspectives in society. 

Together, these factors affected both the scope of historical 

studies and the oudook on the writing of history. 

The second half of the third century A.H. witnessed the 

appearance of historians who were not restricted by any of the 
schools or perspectives mentioned above. Instead, they tried 

to make use of stra materials, the "books" of the akhbartyun, 
genealogical works, and the other available sources. Their studies 
comprehended the entire umma in systematic fashion. Their 
task was to criticize and then select materials for their works, 

and their horizons were of general, or universal dimensions. 
The first representative of this new development was Ah­

mad ibn Yahya ibn Jabir al-Baladhuri (d. 279/892),1 who wrote 
two important books: the Tcutuh al-buldan, "Conquests of the 
Provinces," and the Ansab al-ashraf, "Genealogies of the Nota­
bles." The Futuh al-buldan studies the history of the Islamic 
conquests and presents a continuous story for the conquest of 
each province. Al-Baladhuri took his material from books spe­
cifically pertaining to the conquests in each province, from 

h [Important research on the rihla fl talab al-'Um has been done by Gold-
ziher, Muslim Studies, II, 164ff.; and by Abbott, Studies, II, 40ff.] 

1 [See Goitein's very important introduction to al-Baladhuri's Ansab al-ash-
raf, V, 9ff.; and more recently, EI2, I, 971f. (C. H. Becker/F. Rosenthal); 
Muhammad Hamidullah, "Le 'Livre des Genealogies' d'al-Baladuriy," BEO, 
XTV (1952-54), pp. 197ff.; Petersen, Alt and Muawiya, pp. 136ff.; Caskel, 
Gamharat an-Nasab, I, 115; Rosenthal, Muslim Historiography, index; GAS, 
I, 320f.; Sezgin,AbiiMibnaf, pp. 48ff.; al-Durl, "Kutub al-ansab," pp. 21ff.j 
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materials he was able to collect during his travels to these 
regions, and from other sources available to him. His method 
of writing consisted of selecting material after he had sifted 
and criticized it, and presenting a balanced image of events 
while refraining from citing multiple accounts of the same 
event. He relied heavily on the accounts of Medina, which 
were known, more than others, for their impartiality and ac­
curacy, and likewise used primarily regional accounts. In this 
book al-Baladhuri offers much valuable information on cul­
tural, economic, and administrative affairs. 

The Ansab al-ashraf is a general work on Islamic history 
within a genealogical framework. In both design and content 
it constitutes an unusual mixture. Its design combines the 
methodologies of the tabaqat, akhbar, and genealogical works. 
The biography of each caliph comprehends the events which 
occurred in his reign, including the activities of the political 
factions, with subtitles for important events which are similar 
to the titles of the "books" of the akhbariyun. Al-Baladhuri 
usually adheres to chronological order, although there do ap­
pear exceptions dictated by the need to follow genealogical 
succession (e.g., the discussion of Yazid appears before that 
of'Uthman ibn cAffan). 

Al-Baladhuri subjects his sources to criticism before taking 
material from them. We do notice, however, that views on 
earlier historians had finally stabilized in his era. This is re­
flected by such phrases of his as "al-Waqidi in his isnad," "Abu 
Mikhnaf in his isnad," and so forth.100 Also, some accounts 
were apparently accepted by most historians, as is evident from 
some of al-BaladhurFs akhbHr which begin by saying qalit, "They 
said."101 It seems that in his selection of historical material al-
Baladhuri placed particular importance on the accounts attrib­
utable to the province in which the event occurred, and com­
plemented them with other reports on the subject. In his 

iwAnsab al-ashraf, V, 3, 36 ['Abbas ed., IV, i, 484, 524]. 
10I Ibid., XI, 283ff., 287ff. 
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discussion of the shum, for example, he relies primarily on al-
Waqidi and al-Zuhri (from Medina), adds to that accounts on 
the authority of Abu Mikhnaf (which are closer to the tAlid 
position), and takes material pertaining to genealogy from al-
Zubayr ibn Bakkar. In his akhbar on tAbd al-Malik ibn Mar-
wan, he relies heavily on al-Mada'ini (from tAwana ibn al-
Hakam), tAwana ibn al-Hakam himself (from Damascus), and 
al-Waqidi (from Medina), and supplements these with some 
Iraqi accounts. And on the battle of al-Harra, he essentially 
bases his discussion on al-Mada'ini, al-Waqidi, tAwana, and 
"teachers" from Medina, thus giving Medinan and Umayyad 
versions of the event. 

Al-Baladhuri's sources were both written works and oral 
accounts. Such expressions as haddatham, "he told me," and 
qala It, "he said to me," indicate directly received oral ac­
counts, while rawa, "he reported," generally refers to written 
works. Qala, "he said," can imply borrowing from either an 
oral or a written source.102 Al-Baladhuri uses the isnad as a 
matter of course in certain of his accounts pertaining to events 
in Medina in the time of the Rashidun, and also in some 
individual accounts. But when he takes information from a 
source the isnad of which is well known, he considers it suf­
ficient to give only the name of the source. Very frequently 
he uses the collective isnad to indicate the consensus on basic 
points of fact, then gives minor additions.103 It sometimes 
happens that al-Baladhuri cites a number of accounts among 
which there is a certain degree of contradiction on the same 
subject.104 In his work there are also some isolated accounts 
with no isnad at all.105 

Despite his affiliations with the "Abbasids, al-Baladhuri is 

102Ibid., IVB, 54; V, 24f., 28 ['Abbas ed., IV, i, 347, 510ff., 514f.], 135. 
[On the medieval Islamic terminology used in the transmission of reports and 
texts, see GAS, I, 237ff.] 

103Ibid., V, 34 ['Abbas ed., IV, i, 522]. 
ioiIbid., V, 19f., 24 ['Abbas ed., IV, i, 504ff., 510f.]; XI, 59. 
105 As the author says, "Some learned men said," qala ba'd abl al-'ilm. 
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Despite his affiliations with the 'Abbasids, al-Baladhuri is 
impartial and balanced in the akhbar he gives. He thus gives 
free play to all the accounts and makes a serious effort to be 
objective in selecting narratives for presentation. 

In the Ansab al-ashraf, al-Baladhuri gives expression to the 
concept of the unity of the Islamic community and the con­
tinuity of its experiences in Islamic history. The Vutuh al-bul-
dan, on the other hand, indicates the value of the umma's 
experiences for administrative and judicial purposes. 

Coming now to al-Ya'qfibl (d. 284/897),) we find a scholar 
expressing a conception of universal history. Al-Ya'qubl was 
a historian from the secretarial class who combined wide eru­
dition with professional experience in the administration. Be­
ginning in the days of his youth, he traveled widely and suc­
ceeded in gathering large collections of historical and 
geographical information.106 He also wrote a book, Kitab al-
buldan, "Book of the Provinces," on historical geography, the 
first work of its kind in Arabic.k All this had an influence on 
both the style and content of his history. 

The Tankh of al-Ya'qubl consists of a comprehensive syn­
opsis of universal history prior to Islam, and of Islamic history 
up to the year 259/872. In his writing al-Ya'qubi adheres to 
the chronological sequence of periods and events. He begins 
with Creation (this section is missing from the printed edi­
tion), and does not confine himself to discussion of the history 
of the prophets, Iranian history, and the history of the Arabs 
prior to Islam. Instead, he also includes the history of such 
other ancient nations as the Assyrians, Babylonians, Indians, 
Greeks, Romans, Egyptians, Berbers, Abyssinians, Blacks (zu-
nuj), Turks, and Chinese, thus applying in its fullest sense his 

' [See EI1, IV, 1152f. (C.Brockelmann); Petersen, Alt and Mu'amya, pp. 
169ff.; Rosenthal, Muslim Historiography, pp. 133£] 

l06Kitab al-buldan, edited by M. J. de Goeje (Leiden, 1892), p. 233. 
k [See Andre Miquel, La Geographie humaine du monde musulman jusqu'au 

milieu du lie Steele (Paris, 1967-80), I, 102ff., 285ff.] 
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conception of universal history. It appears that his interest in 
this part of his history, and to the extent permitted by the 
information available to him, was focused on its cultural as­
pects. It could be said that the material he sets forth in his 
book reflects the intermingling of cultures in Islamic society. 
We also note the influence his interest in geography had on 
his writing.107 Similarly, his predilection for astronomy man­
ifests itself in the passages he wrote in this section concerning 
the Persian and Roman calendars,108 and in the astrological 
information he offers in the second section in specifying the 
beginning of the reign of each caliph. 

In the first part of the history al-Ya'qubi maintains a critical 
attitude towards his sources. In his writing on the history of 
the prophets he goes back to the primary sources, and does 
so with remarkable rigor. When he discusses Iranian history 
he makes it clear that the materials for this history prior to 
the Sasanian period are legendary and unworthy of our con­
fidence. He also uses Greek sources (in translation) when he 
writes on Greek culture. 

In the Islamic history al-Ya'qubl follows the method of se­
lecting material from accounts he has already subjected to crit­
ical examination. He specifies that he based his work on "what 
has been reported by past authorities from among the schol­
ars, ruw&t, biographers, akhbrniyUn, and chronologists," and 
that he found that these sources "disagreed in their hadith and 
akhbar, and in giving dates and life-spans." He therefore tried 
to sift through them, take "the reports and accounts enjoying 
the greatest consensus of approval," and compile these to­
gether to write his history. He considered it unnecessary to 
give isnads, since the attitude towards the important historical 
isniids had already been fixed before his time. He is thus con­
tent to mention his basic sources in the introduction to the 

107 Ta'nkh, I, 207. 
lmIbid., I, 178, 199f. 
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second section,109 and thereafter we only rarely find references 
to a source or chain of authorities.110 We note that his sources 
were 'Alid, 'Abbasid (such as Sulayman ibn 'All al-Hash-
iml),111 and Medinan (e.g., al-Waqidl and Ibn Ishaq); simi-
larly, he took material from such akhbariyun as al-Mada'ini, 
al-Haytham ibn 'Adi, and Ibn al-Kalbi (on genealogy), and 
from certain astronomers like al-Khwarizml and the mathe-
matician Ma Sha' Allah. 

We also notice that al-Ya'qubi is balanced in his akhbar and 
generally accurate in the information he presents. At times he 
provides information found in no other source.112 This does 
not, however, prevent certain aspects of his own inclinations 
from manifesting themselves in points of detail. Thus, in his 
discussion of the Rashidun and Umayyad caliphs he some-
times reveals 'Alid sympathies, goes to great lengths in relat-
ing the sayings and speeches of the imams, and gives their 
biographies in conjunction with accounts of their deaths.113 

It would probably be most accurate for us to describe his 
point of view as ImamI, since he treats the rebellion of Zayd 
ibn 'All with casual brevity.114 

In his account of the 'Abbasids, he reveals a certain pen-
chant for indulgence or sycophancy. He refers to the da'wa 
as the da'wa of the Hashimites,115 and to the era of the cAb-

109 Ibid., II, 3f. 
110 Ibid., II, 27, 32f., 126, 159. 
111 See al-Jahiz, Al-Bayan wa-l-tabyin, III, 367. 
112 Al-Ya'qubl, Ta'rikh, II, 479. 
113 Ibid., II, 52, on 'All's conversion to Islam; 125, on his reputation; 35, 

on Abu Talib; 125, on Ghadlr Khumm; 126f., on the virtues of the Prophet's 
family; 137, on al-Saqlfa; 220f., on the attitude of Talha and al-Zubayr; 
225f., on al-Hasan ibn 'All; 315f., 318, 320, on his view of the Zubayrids. 
See also pp. i91f., 195ff., 256f., 261f., 302f., on the Umayyad period. [Cf. 
William G. Millward, "Al-Ya'qubPs Sources and the Question of Shfa Par-
tiality," Abr-Nahrain, XII (1971-72), pp. 47fF.; Yves Marquet, "Le Sl'isme 
au IXe siecle a travers l'histoire de Ya'qubi," Arabica, XIX (1972), pp. Iff., 
lOlff.] 

114Ibid., II, 391. 
115 Ibid., II, 318, 392, 408. 



The Rise of History Among the Arabs 67 

basids as al-dawla, "the dynasty." He also cites tAbbasid ac­
counts in his akhbar.116 Likewise, his discussion of the tAb-
basid caliph al-Mahdi subdy reflects something of the 1Abbasid 
propaganda claiming that this caliph was the messianic mahdi 
come to spread justice in the world.117 He offers a similar 
presentation when he takes up certain events embarrassing to 
the tAbbasids, such as the murders of Ibn Hubayra and Abu 
Muslim and the fall of the Barmakids. Even when he comes 
to the death of the imam Musa al-Kazim he is content to relate 
the tAbbasid explanation for it. But these points do not limit 
the value of his work, its importance, or its position in the 
development of historical writing among the Arabs. 

Al-Ya'qubl laid out his study of Islamic history according 
to the order of the caliphs, although at the same time he ad­
hered to the plan of presenting events in chronological order 
according to year.118 As he draws closer to his own time, he 
begins to restrict himself to recording akhbar in concise form; 
thus, for example, we see him devoting only slight notices to 
the perilous Zanj rebellion. This can perhaps be explained in 
light of al-Ya'qubi's plan. He sought to write a concise con­
densed history based on the extensive and variegated materials 
before him, and by doing so to explicate the development of 
the umma on the one hand, and to fill a cultural need [on the 
other]. For such tasks, contemporary history was not of much 
assistance. 

Let us now turn to Ibn Qutayba (d. 270/883).1 His book 
Al-MaiArif is an encyclopedic compendium in which various 

ll6Ibid., II, 409, 429ff., 433. 
n7Ibid., II, 432ff., 475ff., 479. 
118 See, in particular, what he has to say in Ta'rikh, II, 167. 
1 [The studies of Gerard Lecomte are of particular importance to our un­

derstanding of Ibn Qutayba. See his Ibn Qutayba: I'homme, son oeuwe, ses idees 
(Damascus, 1965), esp. pp. 12Iff; EP, III, 844ff. (G. Lecomte); also Charles 
Pellat, "Ibn Qutayba wa-l-thaqafa al-'arablya," in Melanges Taba Husain, ed­
ited by Abdurrahman Badawi (Cairo, 1962), pp. 29fF.; Conrad, "Arabic Plague 
Chronologies and Treatises," pp. 59ff.] 



68 The Rise of Historical Writing Among the Arabs 

lines of historical writing are blended together. We find in it 
a conception of writing universal history, beginning with the 
Creation and ending in the days of al-Mu'tasim. It also dis­
plays the approach of the akhbAnyun and genealogists to the 
writing of history, and briefly discusses the ayyam al- 'arab. 

There also appears in it the jurist's interest in how places were 
conquered, by treaty of submission (sulhcm) or by force of 
arms ('amvatan). It is believed that the work was composed 
in order to fill the need of the secretarial class, or kuttab, for 
fundamental historical information. 

In writing the Ma'arif, Ibn Qutayba benefited from both 
written sources and oral accounts, and followed the method 
of selecting his historical information after he had subjected 
his sources to critical evaluation. One will notice that those of 
his sources whom he mentions by name were scholars of lofiy 
reputation in their fields of study (e.g., Ibn Ishaq, al-Waqidl, 
and Ibn al-Kalbl). Ibn Qutayba was the first to consult the 
Old Testament to take information directly from it about the 
beginning of Creation and the history of the prophets.119 His 
historical material is distinguished for its impartiality and em­
phasis on matters of historical fact. At times he presents the 
prevailing view of events,120 but at others he offers his own 
novel judgments.121 

Al-Dlnawari (d. 282/891)m wrote Al-Akhbar al-tiwal, "Book 
of Long Narratives," another exemplar of universal history. 
Although he adheres to chronological order in his writing, he 
concentrates on certain events and movements and discusses 

119Ibn Qutayba, Ma'artf, pp. 6ff.['Ukasha ed., pp. 9ff.; cf. also Georges 
Vajda, "Judeo-Arabica: Observations sur quelques citations bibliques chez 
Ibn Qutayba,"REJ, IC (1935), pp. 68ff.; Gerard Lecomte, "Les Citations de 
l'Ancien et du Nouveau Testament dans l'oeuvre d'Ibn Qutayba," Arabica, V 
(1958), pp. 134ff.; idem, Ibn Qutayba, pp. 192ff.]. 

120Ibid., pp. 183, 186 ['Ukasha ed., pp. 359ff., 366ff.]. 
121 Ibid., pp. 273f., on al-Hajjaj ['Ukasha ed., p. 397]. 
m [On him, see EP, II, 300 (B. Lewin); Petersen, 'Alt andMu'amya, pp. 

159ff.; Rosenthal, Muslim Historiography, pp. 92, 133.] 
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them in some detail. This makes his history more of a series 
of akhbar linked together by the author. For the pre-Islamic 
period he tried to present parallel corresponding sketches of 
events in Iran, Yemen, the Arabian peninsula, and Byzantium, 
although Iranian history is predominant and holds a place of 
fundamental importance in this period. He shows no interest 
in the history of the prophets, and passes over the mission of 
Muhammad in a few lines. For the Islamic period, his topic 
of interest is primarily events in Iraq and Iran. 

Al-Dinawari shows little aptitude for criticism in his book, 
and in his akhbar reveals something of an inclination towards 
the 'Abbasids. He shows no interest in the isnad, since he 
sought to present a summary derived from other works. Ex­
amination of his historical material indicates that he brought 
together the IsrailiyAt, Persian sources, and accounts from 
Iraq and Medina. 

Finally, we come to the Tarikh al-msul wa-l-muluk, "His­
tory of the Prophets and Kings," of al-Tabari (d. 310/923)," 
which represents the highest point reached by Arab historical 
writing during its formative period. Al-Tabari was an indefa­
tigable student of learning. He studied under teachers in al-
Rayy, Baghdad, Kufa, Basra, Syria, and Egypt, and finally set­
tled to live in Baghdad. In his knowledge of historical and 
juridical sources he gained a reputation unrivaled by any other. 

Al-Tabari's view of history and style of writing were influ­
enced by his studies and education as a scholar of hadith and 
jurisprudence. Thus his method for criticizing accounts is di­
rected towards the isnad, while his sources are historians with 
reliable reputations in their fields, or in the subjects on which 
they wrote. In his history he gives expression to two funda-

n [There is an enormous literature on this historian. See Goldziher, Rieh-
tungen, pp. 85ff.; EI1, IV, 578f. (R. Paret); Petersen, 'Alt and Mu'awiya, 
pp. 149ff.; Rosenthal, Muslim Historiography, pp. 134f.; GAS, I, 323ff.; Mar­
shall G. S. Hodgson, The Venture of Islam (Chicago, 1974), I, 354ff.] 
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mental historical conceptions: on the one hand, the essential 
oneness of prophetic mission, and on the other, the impor­
tance of the experiences of the umma and the continuity of 
these experiences through time. It was of equally great im­
portance to follow the community through times of both unity 
and discord, its experiences in both situations serving to elu­
cidate how the umma was faring through the course of its 
history. 

In al-Tabari's view, the value of an account depended on 
the strength of its isnad: the closer the first link in an isnad 
came to the event itself, the better the report was. Thus early 
historical writings and accounts preserved nowhere else have 
survived to modern times by virtue of the method al-Tabari 
used in compiling his history. The accounts themselves may 
already have been influenced by various factors, such as mem­
ory, personal inclinations and predilections, and so forth, and 
even after criticizing and evaluating them it was impossible to 
be absolutely sure of their accuracy and integrity. This is what 
made ra'y, or individual judgment, so unreliable and some­
times confusing. To al-Tabari it therefore sufficed to pass along 
the accounts of trustworthy ruwat and historians, who them­
selves bore the responsibility for the integrity of their work. 
In the material he presents, then, the ray of al-Tabari mani­
fests itself in his evaluation of accounts and narratives and in 
his selection of some rather than others. He avoids passing 
judgment, rarely shows preference for one account over an­
other (all the more so since he gives those which are generally 
accepted), and displays a manifest impartiality in the ones he 
cites. 

His style of writing was influenced by his attitude towards 
the sources. Striving to give the different accounts concerning 
an event or subject, he could not proffer a continuous history 
of it. It appears that he sought to compile the entire corpus 
of Arabic historical accounts into his work—a goal to which 
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earlier scholars in the field of hadith had aspired—and this 
explains the enormous number of his sources.0 This was a 
great service on the part of al-Tabari, and with it the first era 
in the development of historical writing draws to a close, since 
in later times we find no one who tried to reevaluate the his­
torical sources for the periods on which al-Tabari had written. 

Al-Tabarfs history begins with the Creation, covers the 
prophets and kings of antiquity, proceeds to the history of the 
Sasanians and the Arab tribes,P and then discusses Islamic his­
tory up to al-Tabari's own time (A.H. 302). His view of his­
tory as an expression of divine will and a depository for ex­
periences probably explains the brevity or weakness of the last 
section of the history, which deals with contemporary history. 

VII. 

Regional history appeared in the third/ninth century. Some 
of these works, such as the FutUh Misr, or "Conquest of Egypt," 
by Ibn cAbd al-Hakam (d. 257/870),1 were histories of one 
particular province; others were histories of cities, like the 
Tankh Wasit, "History of Wasit," by Bahshal (d. 288/900)/ 
and the Ta'rikh Baghdad, "History of Baghdad," by Tayfur 
(d. 280/893).s The composition of some of these books was 
an outgrowth of the regional studies in hadith; these give the 

° [These have been examined in detail in Jawad 'All, "Mawarid ta'rikh al-
Tabari," Majalkt al-tnajma' al-'ilmi al-Jraqt, I (1950), pp. 143ff.; II (1951), 
pp. 135ff.; Ill (1954), pp. 16ff.; VIII (1961), pp. 425ff.] 

Ρ [This section of al-Tabari's history was translated, with a detailed and 
important commentary, in Noldeke's Geschichte der Perser und Araber.] 

s [Edited by Charles C. Torrey (New Haven, 1922); cf. also the important 
study by Robert Brunschvig, "Ibn 'Abdalhakam et la conquete de TAfrique 
du Nord par Ies Arabes," AIEO, VI (1942-47), pp. IlOff.; Ibrahim Ahmad 
al-'AdawI, Ibn Abd al-Hakam: mid al-mu'arrikhin al-'arab (Cairo, 1963); 
EI2, III, 674f. (F. Rosenthal).] 

' [Edited by Gurgis 'Awwad (Baghdad, 1387/1967). See EP, I, 949 
(F. Rosenthal); GAS, I, 349.] 

s [Ibn Abl Tahir Tayfur, Kitab Baghdad, edited by Hans Keller (Leipzig, 
1908). Cf. EP, III, 692f. (F. Rosenthal); GAS, I, 348f.] 
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biographies of the hadith scholars who grew up in these cities 
or lived there for a length of time, and present these biogra­
phies in tabaqat form. Others were written out of a sense of 
devotion and pride for the city or province. These histories 
usually contain some geographical or topographical informa­
tion.1 

From our review of the above, we find that historical writ­
ing among the Arabs was a natural development in Islam. The 
new religion, the formation of an empire, and the establish­
ment of a fixed system of dating—all these laid the founda­
tion. The Islamic perspectives represented in the interest in 
the biography of the Prophet, the consensus (ijnrn") and col­
lective experiences of the umma, the views and judgments of 
its learned men, and the great events which had defined the 
course of its history, were then the principal factors motivat­
ing the study of history in Medina. On the other hand, the 
tribal perspectives oriented towards interest in genealogies, 
poetry, and the battle-days, persisted in the new tribal centers 
in Kufa and Basra, though within a new framework, and found 
fresh incentives in the new political, social, and cultural cur­
rents. Behind these two perspectives there was the awareness 
among all of a historical mission, and this to a certain extent 
explains the diversity and breadth of historical works. 

The development of historical writing was a vital part of 
cultural development. Scattered accounts—in akhbar, hadith, 
and genealogical form—came to be gathered together in oral 
form by akhbarlyun or hadith scholars, but history did not 
emerge in any definite form until the beginning of the use of 
writing for preserving narratives and accounts. The first stage 
in the rise of history was primarily regional and somewhat 

1 [Cf. further on such works, Salih Ahmad al-'ΑΙϊ, "Al-Mu'allafat al-
'arabiya 'an al-Madina wa-l-Hijaz," Majallat al-majma' al-'ilmi cU-lraqi, XI 
(1964), pp. 118ff.; Rosenthal, Muslim Historiography, pp. 150ff.; GAS, I, 
339ff.] 
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limited in scope: in Medina, the cradle of Islam, interest was 
directed at the sira and the age of the Rashidun caliphs, and 
in Kufa and Basra it turned towards the activities of the tribes 
and the conquests. This phase also made its appearance in 
other aspects of culture, in the development of the concept of 
ijma, and in the study of hadith, for in this first stage, the 
attention these two fields of study received was confined to 
the scope of a single city or province (e.g., Medina, Kufa). 
But the continuous influence of the fundamental principles 
and ideas of Islam, and their infusion into society at the ex­
pense of tribal views and regional social ideas, explains the 
appearance of such new cultural developments as the gradually 
increasing importance of the isnad and the expansion of its 
use in reporting events, and the focusing of communal aware­
ness on the unity of the umma and the importance of its con­
tinuous experiences. There then developed a kind of system­
atic gathering of historical narratives and accounts (and similarly, 
of hadith) from the different provinces, and the inclination for 
writing general histories, some of which involved a universal 
view of the history of the pre-Islamic past. 

From its earliest days history was regarded as a form of 
'ilm, or formal learning, as opposed to ra'y, an exercise in 
individual judgment; and the emphasis was on the evaluation 
and criticism of the sources according to the method of the 
isnad. Since accounts and narratives were exposed to the influ­
ence of personal predilections, factional tendencies, and var­
ious forms of 'asahiya, assuring oneself of the trustworthiness 
of the chain of ruwat who had transmitted the report was the 
way to confirm the integrity of the report itself. Beyond this, 
it can be said that the inclinations of the historian manifest 
themselves in the kinds of accounts and narratives he offers 
and quotes. Personal judgment could be expressed after the 
text of the account or narrative had been cited, but not before. 
A historian developed a reputation for trustworthiness when 
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he presented varying accounts, or when he presented well-
known impartial accounts. Thus the level of a given author's 
strictness and criticism emerges when we examine his accounts 
in light of the above remarks. 

Islam takes an interest in life in general. So for this reason 
the affairs of this life are important, and likewise, experiences 
and examples are essential to proper personal conduct. Here 
history is the best source of guidance. It provides examples 
enabling the individual to live a better life and serving to en­
lighten the ruling authorities; history was thus important for 
a proper education. Moreover, the ijma was an important 
source of legislation, and a fundamental guide for taking the 
proper course of action. In its broad lines, history was an 
expression of the will of God. For particular events or indi­
vidual actions, however, mankind was no doubt accountable, 
and opinions about such events were therefore bound to dif­
fer. Thus history was generally helpful in understanding the 
development of the umma, and also useful to Islamic religious 
studies when it offered histories of the Prophet's life, provided 
practical precedents for administration, and shed light on the 
Commvinity5S experiences and on the ijma'. On the other hand, 
much history was written for political or social reasons. This 
holds true of most of the "books" of the akhbariyiin, and sim­
ilarly of some of the general histories, since it is hardly possi­
ble to find any motive for the writing of al-Dlnawarfs Al-
Akhbar al-tiwal or Ibn Qutayba's Mamif other than the mo­
tives of general culture. 

Let us mention here that, with the help of speculative the­
ologians and the Mu'tazila, the principle of free will met with 
broad acceptance in the early 'Abbasid period. Although the 
hadith scholars triumphed over the Mu'tazila politically in the 
first half of the third century A.H., their cultural ascendancy 
did not come until later. It is therefore impossible to speak 
with certainty—as some have done—of the supremacy of the 
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principle of divine foreordainment and the impact it had on 
the writing of history in this period. Causation was found in 
man's activities in accordance with God's will in the world. 

In historical writing there appears a strong emphasis on the 
element of time, and chronological order is generally followed 
in historical works. This manifests itself in the writing of his­
tory based on the succession of the caliphs, the order of events, 
or the series of tabaqat, and culminates in the writing of an-
nalistic history. Dates and isnads were fundamental elements 
for assuring accuracy. In books of genealogy and tabaqat, at­
tention is paid to time in the records of death dates and life­
spans (these latter were mentioned in order to compensate for 
uncertainty over birth dates). History thus consisted of the 
activities of mankind over specific spans of time. This view of 
time is an Islamic one. 

The various forms of historical writing developed from the 
methods of the sira, akhbar, and genealogies, and the concept 
of the umma·, the element of time pervaded them all. In such 
manner, historical "books" derive from the akhbar style, and 
the sim, tabaqat, and biographies derive from the sim style; 
while general or annalistic history is founded on the idea of 
the umma. Finally, the genealogical style appears in certain 
works of general history—even histories of families influenced 
by the akhbar style—and in other historical works. 

These three centuries were the formative period of historical 
writing among the Arabs, the age in which the lines and 
methods for the writing of history were established. The era 
which followed witnessed other cultural elements, such as ge­
ography, philosophy, and astronomy, which had their effects 
on the writing of history. But no change worthy of note 
overtook the early historical ideas and methods. 



CHAPTER TWO 

Origins of the Historical School 

of Medina: cUrwa—al-Zuhri 

Studies both historical and otherwise began as common en­
deavors represented by academic circles, or balaqdt, each gath­
ered around a teacher, and when a superior student had sur­
passed a certain academic level it was possible for him to 
establish his own circle. Instruction was available to anyone 
who sought it, and the teacher's lecture, or riwaya, circulated 
from one student to the next. In this way, and with the pas­
sage of time, there arose a school of history, hadith, and ju­
risprudence. The first school of history was the maghazi school 
of Medina,1 the growth and orientation of which was closely 
linked to the efforts of two authorities on jurisprudence and 
hadith: cUrwa ibn al-Zubayr and his student al-Zuhri. 

I. 

'Urwa was one of the notables of Quraysh.3 His father was 
al-Zubayr ibn al-'Awwam, and his mother was Asma' bint 
AbI Bakr; 'A'isha was his maternal aunt, KhadIja bint Khu-
waylid was his grandmother, and his brother was 'Abd Allah 
ibn al-Zubayr. His wife was Umm Yahya, the youngest child 
of al-Hakam ibn AbI l-'As. He prided himself on his ancestry 
on both his father's and mother's sides,2 which consequentiy 

1 The word maghazi usually signifies battles and military expeditions. This 
is correct from a linguistic standpoint, but in the sense intended here, and in 
the early Islamic period, the meaning of the word comprehends the entire era 
of the Prophet's mission. [Cf. p. 24, n. e above.] 

a [On 'Urwa ibn al-Zubayr, see Horovitz, "Biographies," I, 542ff.; EI1, 
IV, 1047 (V. Vacca); GAS, I, 278f.] 

2 See al-Jahiz, Al-Bayan wa-l-tabyin, I, 180; al-Baladhuri, Ansab al-asbraf, 
V, 160, 371; al-Tabari, Ta'rikh, II, 2313; al-Dhahabl, Tamjim, p. 40. 
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had an influence both on his upbringing and on the accounts 
he produced. 

The sources differ on the year of his birth, with various 
authorities saying that he was born in A.H. 22, 26, or 29.3 

According to one report he was born in 23/643; this seems 
to be the most accurate account, since it is confirmed by an­
other report stating that he was thirteen years old at the time 
of the Battle of the Camel (in A.H. 36), and is supported by 
'Urwa's own statement that on his way to the battlefield that 
day he was turned back because of his tender age.4 Numerous 
reports on the year of his death are available to us; al-Tabari 
places it in A.H. 94, as also do 'cIbn Sa'd and his colleagues,"5 

while Ibn Qutayba, as also Ibn Khallikan, makes it either A.H. 
93 or 94.6 There are also other accounts placing his death in 
A.H. 92, 95, 99, 100, or IOl,7 but the earliest and most reli­
able is that placing his death in the year 94/712. 

TJrwa grew up and studied in Medina. He then lived for 
the seven years between A.H. 58 and 65 in Egypt, where he 
also married,8 and visited Damascus several times. TJrwa's 
aspirations differed from those of his father and his two brothers 
'Abd Allah and Mus'ab, and he clearly voiced his own out­
look in saying, "My wish is to be abstinent in this world, to 
gain [Paradise] in the next, and to be among those from whom 
learning is handed down."9 This attitude manifested itself in 

3Ibn Khallikan, Wafayat al-a'ym (Cairo), I, 399 ['Abbas ed., Ill, 258]; 
al-Dhahabl, Tamjim, p. 48. 

4 Ibn Sa'd, V, 133; al-Dhahabl, Tamjim, p. 48; Ibn Hajar, Tahdhib al-
tahdhib, VII, 183f. 

5 Ibn Sa'd, V, 135; al-Tabari, Ta'rikh, II, 1266; al-Dhahabl, Tarajim, pp. 
42, 48. 

6 Ibn Qutayba, Ma'Anf edited by Muhammad al-SawI (Cairo, 1353/1934), 
p. 98 ['Ukasha ed., p. 222]; Ibn Khallikan, Wafayat al-a'yan (Cairo), I, 399 
['Abbas ed., Ill, 258], 

7 Al-NawawI, Tahdbtb al-asma', edited by Ferdinand Wiistenfeld (Gottin-
gen, 1842-47), p. 331; al-Dhahabl, Tarajim, p. 48; Ibn Hajar, Tahdhtb al-
tahdhtb, VII, 184. 

8 Al-Baladhuri, Futiih al-buldan (Cairo, 1932), p. 219 [de Goeje ed., p. 
217]; Horovitz ["Biographies," I, 543ft'.], Al-Maghazi al-ula, p. 13. 

9 Ibn Khallikan, Wafayat al-a'yan (Cairo), I, 399 ['Abbas ed., Ill, 258]. 
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the way he lived: Ibn Hisham says of him, "He used to fast 
all the time except on the feast days of tId al-Fitr and 'Id al-
Adha, and when he died he was fasting."10 His love of learn­
ing is evident from a report by his son Hisham stating, "On 
the day of the battle of al-Harra, my father burned some books 
of jurisprudence which belonged to him, and afterwards he 
used to say, 'Having them back would be dearer to me than 
to have such things as my family and fortune.' "u tUrwa did 
not participate in the successive political events of his time. 
As al-tIjlI said of him, "He was a trustworthy upright man 
who took no part in discords."12 He was opposed to the pol­
icies of the Umayyads, but decided only to dissociate himself 
from the "oppressors."13 

tUrwa passed his life between studying and teaching. He 
sought out hadith and other sources of learning, and passed 
down reports from such eminent men and women of Medina 
as 'A'isha, tAmra, Usama ibn Zayd, tAbd Allah ibn tAmr 
ibn al-'As, Abu Hurayra, and tAbd Allah ibn tAbbas.14 He 
became one of the "seven jurists of Medina" and one of its 
most outstanding scholars of hadith, such that tUmar ibn tAbd 
al-tAziz said of him, "There was no one more learned than 
tUrwa ibn al-Zubayr," and al-Zuhri once remarked, "tUrwa 
was a sea the buckets never muddied."15 It is important to us 
here that we study tUrwa as a historian, leaving aside his role 
in jurisprudence and hadith. 

10 Ibn Sa'd, V, 134; al-Dhahabl, Tarajim, p. 42, also see p. 43. 
11 Ibn Sa'd, V, 133; al-Dhahabl, Tamjtm, p. 41. 
12Al-DhahabI, Tarajm, p. 45. 
13 Ibn Sa'd, V, 135; al-Dhahabr, Tamjim, pp. 43f. 
14 See Ibn Sa'd, V, 133; al-Dhahabl, Tarajim, p. 45. 
15 See Abii I-Faraj al-Isfahanl, Kitab al-aghanl (Cairo, 1345-94/1927-74), 

VIII, 89, 93 [(Bulaq, A.H. 1285), VIII, 92, 97; also Abu Zur'a al-Dimashqi, 
Ta'rikh, edited by Shukr Allah ibn Ni'mat Allah al-Qawajanl (Damascus, 
1400/1980), I, 418;] al-Dhahabl, Tarajim, pp. 45.; Ibn Hajar, Tahdhib al-
tabdhib, VII, 182. Al-Jahiz says (Al-Bayan wa-l-tabyin, II, 202), '"Urwa ex­
horted his sons, saying, 'Seek to gain in learning, for if you are the lowliest 
of men now, you may become the most renowned of men later.'" Also see 
Ibn Sa'd, V, 134. 
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Before taking up his historical studies, we should indicate 
that tUrwa had ties with the Umayyads. He knew tAbd al-
Malik in his youth in Medina and used to meet with him in 
the mosque of the city. He came to see tAbd al-Malik in 
Damascus after the death of 'Urwa's brother 1Abd Allah, and 
similarly, later came to visit the caliph al-Walid. He met with 
difficulty at the hands of the Syrians, and the reports available 
to us indicate that although they esteemed him for his learn­
ing, he was wary in his dealings with them. All that concerns 
us here is that the Umayyad court asked him questions about 
events pertaining to the mission of the Prophet. He re­
sponded to these queries in essays, some of which have come 
down to us in al-Tabari and are among the earliest and most 
trustworthy fragments to survive to modern times.16 In the 
following pages we will try to describe 'Urwa's historical works 
in order to form a tentative idea of what they were like: 

1. Muhammad's call (ba'th) at the age of forty;17 the first 
signs of prophecy: "the first sign with which the prophet-
hood of the Apostle of God was begun . . . was . . . true 
vision (al-ru'ya al-sadiqa). . . . God evoked in him a desire 
for seclusion, so that nothing was dearer to him than to be 
isolated by himself';18 beginning of revelation (nuzul al-
wahy) while he was performing his devotions in a cave on 
Hira', and the first Qur'anic verses, "Recite, in the name 
of thy Lord . . .";b the fear which overcame the Prophet as 
a result; he tells KhadIja of his anxiety, so she quickly takes 
him to Waraqa ibn Nawfal, who prophesies that something 
great will happen to him.19 

tUrwa also offers an essay explaining how the Prophet 

16 On 'Urwa's relations with the Umayyads, see al-Jahiz, Al-Bayan wa-l-
tabyin, II, 70; Atjhani, IV, 118, 123; IX, 147; XVI, 44f.; Ibn Khallikan, 
Wafayat id-ayan (Cairo), I, 398f. ['Abbas ed., Ill, 25Sff.]. 

17Al-TabarI, Ta'rikh, I, 1140, 1835. 
18 Ibn Hisham (Cairo), I, 249 [Wiistenfeld ed., I, i, 151]. 
b [Surat al-'Alaq (XCVI) , 1.] 
19 Al-Tabari, Ta'rikh, I, 1147; Aghani (Cairo), II, 15 [Bulaq ed., Ill, 16]. 
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came to realize that he was destined for a mission of the 
greatest importance. This is the account of the two angels 
who met him in the Batha of Mecca,c split open his ab­
domen and heart, removed the blemish of Satan and a clot 
of blood from inside him, and set the seal of prophecy be­
tween his shoulder blades.20 

2. The Hijra to Abyssinia—This appears in a letter from 
tUrwa to 'Abd al-Malik ibn Marwan in which he discusses 
the beginning of Muhammad's appeal and the attitude of 
Quraysh at that time, saying, "They did not shy away from 
him when he first summoned them, and almost listened to 
him, until he made references to their idols. . . ." They then 
began to treat him harshly, and all but a few of the people 
broke away from him. "So thus matters remained, for as 
long as God decided that they should remain so." He then 
states that a group of Quraysh coming from al-Ta'if to Mecca 
rejected the Prophet's message, and incited his people against 
him so that they persecuted the Muslims. Moreover, they 
conspired together to lure away his followers, "so that there 
was severe trial and upheaval. . . . Some were led astray, but 
God vouchsafed those whom he willed." When the Prophet 
saw what had befallen his Companions, he ordered them to 
emigrate to Abyssinia. tUrwa explains that Abyssinia was 
chosen because over it there ruled a righteous king in whose 
domain no one suffered injustice, and similarly, because 
Abyssinia was a place where Quraysh conducted trade. Many 
of the Muslims thereupon emigrated, while Muhammad re­
mained in Mecca; "and so matters remained for years."21 

He also mentions tUbayd Allah ibn Jahsh's conversion to 
Christianity in Abyssinia.22 

c [The hollow where the oldest part of Mecca, including the Ka'ba, is 
located.] 

20Al-Tabari, Ta'rikh, I, 1154. 
21 Ibid., I, 1180f. 
22 Ibn Hisham, IV, 6 [Wiistenfeld ed., I, ii, 783f.]. 
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3. The increasing Quraysh opposition to the Prophet's 
mission and what he suffered at their hands. They even threw 
filth into his house, and one sprinkled dust over his head.23 

tUrwa also gives the names of those members of Quraysh 
who mocked the Prophet.24 Quraysh meets at al-Hijrd to 
deliberate on the matter of the Prophet: "He has belittled 
our customs, reviled our forefathers, denounced our reli­
gion, divided our ranks, and cursed our gods." The next 
day, as the Prophet passed by them, they rushed at him all 
at once. One of their men seized hold of the seam of his 
robe, but Abu Bakr stepped in front of him and, crying, 
said, "Woe unto you! Would you kill a man for saying, 
'God is my Lord'?" With that they withdrew.25 Departure 
of Abu Bakr from Mecca after seeing how the polytheists 
were joining ranks against the Prophet, and his return to 
Mecca under the protection of Ibn al-Dughunna.26 

4. The Hijra—'Urwa begins with an introduction on the 
circumstances leading up to the Hijra. He mentions the re­
turn of most of those who had emigrated to Abyssinia, and 
says that this "caused the adherents of Islam to increase and 
multiply in numbers. There were many conversions among 
the Ansar in Medina and Islam began to gain ground there, 
so that the people of Medina began to come to visit the 
Apostle of God—may the blessing and peace of God be 
upon him." The Quraysh were troubled by this and con­
spired together to persecute the Muslims. "They thus suf­
fered severe hardship, and that was the latter persecution." 
cUrwa reports the contacts the Medinans made with the 

23Ibn Hisham, II, 57f. [Wustenfeld ed., I, i, 277]; al-Tabarl, Ta'rikh, I, 
1199. 

24 Ibn Hisham, II, 50f. [Wiistenfeld ed., I, i, 271f.]. 
d [The area just beyond the northern corner of the Ka'ba.] 
25Ibn Hisham, I, 309 [Wustenfeld ed., I, i, 183]; al-Tabarl, Ta'rikb, I, 

1185. 
26 Ibn Hisham, I, 309; II, llff. [Wustenfeld ed., I, i, 183, 245f.]. 
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Prophet, saying, "Then there came to the Apostle of God— 
may the blessing and peace of God be upon him—seventy 
representatives, leaders of those who had accepted Islam, 
who appeared before him during the pilgrimage, then 
pledged their loyalty to him at al-tAqaba and offered him 
their oaths providing that 'we are of you and you are of us.' 
Quraysh thereupon became harsher in their treatment of 
the Muslims in Mecca, so the Prophet gave the order for 
the emigration (hijra) to Medina. It was concerning this 
that God revealed the verse, 'Fight them until persecution 
(fitna) is no more, and all religion is God's.' "27 

This fragment completes the discussion of the first per­
secution and the Hijra to Abyssinia. We do not know whether 
this was part of 'Urwa's letter to tAbd al-Malik, as Horo-
vitz believes, or whether it was an independent account, 
since it is probable that 'Urwa related the contents of the 
latter and this supplement separately.28 

Account of the Prophet's own Hijra to Medina—tUrwa 
begins by referring to the Hijra of the Muslims to Medina 
while the Prophet remained in Mecca waiting for the ap­
propriate moment to depart. He gives the details on the 
preparations for the Hijra, on the Prophet and Abu Bakr 
hiding for three days in the cave of Thawr, and on other 
related events, and describes the remainder of the journey 
to Medina.29 This fragment bears the same isnad as the two 
previous fragments, and contains a reference to the Qur'anic 
verse, "Fight them until persecution is no more," all of which 
points to the conclusion that its discussion was meant to 
supplement that of the two previous accounts.30 

27Al-TabarI, Ta'rikh, I, 1224f. [citing Surat al-Anfal (VIII), 39]. 
28 See Horovitz ["Biographies," I, 548f.|, Al-Magbazi al-ϋΐά, p. 20. 
29 Al-Tabari, Ta'rikh, I, 1234ff. There is another account giving the story 

of the Hijra which is similar to the above, but bears a different chain of 
authorities. See al-Tabari, Ta'rikh, I, 1237. 

30 This caused Horovitz to consider this and the two preceding fragments 
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In another account 'Urwa tells of the Prophet's arrival at 
Quba' on the way to Medina, and how the Muslims were 
every day awaiting his arrival.31 He also reports the afflic­
tion of some of the Prophet's companions by fever after 
their arrival in Medina,32 and gives an account of the atti­
tude of 'Abd Allah ibn Ubayy towards the appeal of the 
Prophet, a narrative in which there appears dissatisfaction 
and antipathy to the Prophet.33 

5. A report on the expedition of 'Abd Allah ibn Jahsh— 
The account contains details on the sending of the expedi­
tion, the Prophet's orders to 'Abd Allah, the attack on the 
Quraysh caravan, its capture by the Muslims and the killing 
of two of the Quraysh guards, and the misgivings which 
arose on the question of fighting during the sacred month, 
until the revelation of the verse, "They will ask thee about 
the sacred month . . . ," after which the Prophet agrees to 
take possession of the caravan.34 

6. The expedition of Badr—'Urwa's account appears in 
a letter he sent to 'Abd al-Malik ibn Marwan, and begins, 
'To wit: You wrote to me about Abu Sufyan and his de­
parture. . . ." A long continuous account, it begins by re­
counting Abu Sufyan's return from Syria at the head of a 
Meccan caravan, his appeal to the Quraysh for help, and 
the Prophet's capture of a young slave water-carrier of Qu-
raysh and his efforts to learn the enemy's numbers. 'Urwa 
refers to the Prophet's preparations for the battle, the clash 
between the two forces, and the Muslim victory. He does 
not discuss the fighting in detail, but rather is content to 

to comprise a single letter to 'Abd al-Malik, but I do not believe this to be 
the case. 

31 Ibn Hisham, II, 137ff. [Wustenfeld ed., I, i, 333ff.]; al-Tabari, Ta'rikh, 
I, 1242. 

32Ibn Hisham, II, 238 [Wustenfeld ed., I, i, 413f.]; al-Baladhuri, Futiib 
al-buldan, p. 25 [de Goeje ed., p. 11], 

33 Ibn Hisham, II, 236f. [Wustenfeld ed., I, i, 412f.]. 
34Al-TabarI, Ta'rikh, I, 1273ff. [citing Surat al-Baqara (II), 217]. 
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say, 'They (Quraysh) and the Prophet—may the blessing 
and peace of God be upon him—clashed, and God granted 
his Apostle victory, disgraced the leaders of disbelief, and 
restored from their affliction the hearts of the Muslims." 
The letter also contains some novel features, among them 
an explanatory introduction stating, "There had been fight­
ing between them before that. Some were killed in battle, 
Ibn al-HadramI was killed among others at Nakhla, and 
some of the Quraysh were taken prisoner. . . . cAbd Allah 
ibn Jahsh attacked them. . . . That conflict provoked war 
between the Aposde of God and Quraysh, and was the first 
time war broke out among them." We should also note his 
description of the Muslim frame of mind when they set out 
for Badr: 'They regarded the caravan as no more than an 
opportunity for them to plunder, and they did not think 
there would be any serious fighting when they encountered 
Quraysh."35 

In another account by cUrwa there are further references 
to Badr, among them one in which the Prophet instructs 
the Muslims, "This is the Quraysh caravan bearing their 
wealth; so set out to attack it, and God may deliver it up 
to you as spoils."36 Another describes Quraysh's fear of what 
the clan of Bakr might do should Quraysh set out, and the 
alleged role of Satan (IblIs) in convincing them to do so.37 

cUrwa also relates that when the Prophet saw the Quraysh 
forces approaching on the day of the battle, he called out, 
"O God, you have revealed to me the Book [ordered me to 
fight,] and promised me, you who does not break a prom­
ise, one of the two parties.·= O God, these Quraysh have 

35 Al-TabarJ, Ta'rikh, I, 1284ff. 
36 Ibn Hisham, II, 257f. [Wiistenfeld ed., I, i, 457f.]. 
37Ibn Hisham, II, 263 [Wiistenfeld ed., I, i, 432]; al-Tabarl, Ta'nkh, I, 

1296. 
c [Alluding to Surat al-Anfal (VIII), 7: "And when God promised you that 

one of the two parties will be yours . . .," taken in Qur'anic exegesis to mean 
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come in their conceit and pride, turning away from you and 
denouncing your Apostle as a liar. O God, this is your vic­
tory which you promised me. O God, destroy them in the 
early morning!"38 After the battle, the polytheists who had 
been killed were thrown into a pit.39 

7. The campaign against Qaynuqac—After Badr, the clan 
of Qaynuqac began to manifest feelings of envy and disloy­
alty. cUrwa mentions the revelation of the verse, "If thou 
fearest treachery at the hands of a people, then cast them 
out in like measure"/ the Prophet's siege of their quarters; 
their submission to his judgment; mediation by cAbd Allah 
ibn Ubayy; their expulsion from Medina, and the property 
confiscated from them by the Prophet;40 a report on the 
expedition to Bi'r Ma'una;41 also a passing reference to the 
expedition to al-Rajf 42 

8. The expedition of the Ditch—The effort of the Jews 
to rally the various parties against the Prophet; the induce­
ments they offered to Quraysh and Ghatafan; departure of 
Quraysh under the leadership of Abu Sufyan, followed by 
Ghatafan, Fazara, Banu Murra, and a clan from Ashjac; the 
Prophet hears of this and digs a ditch around Medina.43 

9. The campaign against Banu Qurayza—After the de­
parture of Quraysh and their allies, the Prophet attacked 
and besieged Qurayza; they submitted to his judgment, and 

that Muhammad was guaranteed either capture of the Quraysh caravan, or 
victory over the Meccan force (defeated at Badr) sent to relieve it. See al-
Waqidl, Maghazi, I, 131f.] 

38 Al-Waqid!, KitSb al-maghazi, edited by 'Abbas al-Shirbini (Cairo, 1947), 
p. 43 [Jones ed., I, 59]. 

39Ibn Hisham, II, 291f. [Wiistenfeld ed., I, i, 453f.]; al-Tabari, Ta'rikh, 
I, 1331. 

f [Surat al-Anfal (VIII), 58.] 
40 Al-Waqidi, Maghazi, pp. 139, 141 [Jones ed., I, 177fF., 180]; al-Tabari, 

Ta'rikh, I, 1360. 
41 Al-Waqidi, Maghazi, p. 270 [Jones ed., I, 347]. 
42Ibid., p. 275 [Jones ed., I, 354], 
43 Al-Tabari, Ta'rikh, I, 1463. 
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Sa'd ibn Mu'adh, appointed to decide their fate, ordered 
that their warriors be killed, their children enslaved, and 
their property divided.44 

10. The expedition of Banu I-Mustaliq—Reference to the 
apportionment of the captives from Banu 1-Mustaliq; the 
Prophet's marriage to Juwayriya bint al-Harith;45 account 
of the Lie, Al-Ifk, during this expedition.46 

11. Truce of al-Hudaybiya—The Prophet sets out in the 
year of al-Hudaybiya to visit the Ka'ba, and not seeking a 
fight, takes along camels for sacrifice; the number of those 
accompanying him; his arrival at al-Hudaybiya and negoti­
ations with Quraysh; the call for cessation of hostilities, the 
truce and treaty for four years providing "that anyone can 
enter into alliance with anyone else, so long as there is no 
treachery or bad faith. . . ."; the Prophet makes Banu Ka'b 
party to the pact, and Quraysh does likewise with their al­
lies of Banu Kinana; the remainder of the provisions and 
the postponement of the Muslim entry into Mecca until the 
following year.47 

12. The expedition to Mu'ta—Its date, organization of 
its leadership, and number of participants; the Muslim ar­
rival at Ma'an, the approach of Heraclius, the numbers of 
his troops, and his confederates; the steadfastness of the 
Muslims after the conference;48 return of the Muslims, at-

44 Ibn Hisham, III, 252f. [Wiistenfeld ed., I, ii. 690]; al-Baladhuri, Futuh 
al-buldan, p. 35 [de Goeje ed., p. 22]; Abu "Ubayd, Kitab cd-amwAl (Cairo, 
A.H. 1353), p. 129; al-Tabari, Ta'rikh, I, 1494. 

45 Ibn Hisham, III, 307 [Wiistenfeld ed., I, ii, 729]; al-Tabari, Ta'rikh, I, 
1517. Also see Ibn Hisham, IV, 295 [Wiistenfeld ed., I, ii, 1002], for another 
account by tUrwa about the Prophet's marriage to Juwaynya. 

46 Ibn Hisham, III, 309ff. [Wiistenfeld ed., I, ii, 73 IfF.]. There is a refer­
ence to the Affair of the Lie in al-Tabari, Ta'rikh, I, 1518. 

47 Al-Baladhuri, Futiih al-buldan, p. 49 [de Goeje ed., p. 36]; Abu 'Ubayd, 
AmwAl, pp. 157, 158; al-Tabari, Ta'rikh, I, 1534. 

48 Ibn Hisham, IV, 15ff. [Wiistenfeld ed., I, ii, 791ff.]; al-Tabari, Ta'rikh, 
I, 1610. 
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titude of the people and young boys towards them, and the 

Prophet's praise for their courage.49 

13. The conquest of Mecca—An account reporting some 
of the terms of the truce of al-Hudaybiya, and Quraysh's 

violation of them through their role in the fighting between 

their tribal ally, Bakr, and the Prophet's ally, Khuza'a;50 

Hatib ibn Abi Balta'a writes to Quraysh of the Prophet's 

intention to set out in their direction.51 

'Urwa gives a detailed account of the conquest of Mecca 
in a letter he sent to 'Abd al-Malik. In it he clarifies the 

reason for the campaign, its organization, the Quraysh rep­
resentatives (Abu Sufyan and those accompanying him) who 

came to the Prophet, the Muslim entry into Mecca, the 

fighting led by Khalid against the ahabtsh, and his victory 
over them, along with some other individual details.52 

14. The expedition of Hunayn—The Prophet remains in 

Mecca about two weeks; the tribes of ThaqIf and Hawazin, 
as soon as they receive word of Muhammad's campaign 
against Mecca, unite their forces, fearing that the campaign 
will continue against them; their subsequent arrival at WadI 
Hunayn; the Prophet meets them, puts them to flight, seizes 
as booty the animals they had brought with them, and takes 
the women and children as captives;53 a Hawazin delega­

tion accepts Islam after the expedition to al-Ta'if, and the 
Prophet releases their children and women.54 

15. The expedition to al-Ta'if—The Prophet sets out for 

al-Ta'if after Hunayn; ThaqIf fights the Muslim force be-

49 Ibn Hisham, IV, 24 [Wiistenfeld ed., I, ii, 797f.]; al-Tabari, Ta'rikh, I, 
1617. 

50 Ibn Hisham, IV, 32 [Wiistenfeld ed., I, ii, 803f.]; al-Tabari, Ta'rikh, I, 
1619. 

51 Ibn Hisham, IV, 40f. [Wiistenfeld ed., I, ii, 809f.]. 
52Ibn Hisham, IV, 60 [Wiistenfeld ed., I, ii, 825f.]; al-Tabari, Ta'rikh, I, 

1634ff. 
53 Al-Tabari, Ta'rikh, I, 1654. 
54 Ibid., I, 1770. 
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sieging the fortress; the people in the surrounding area ac-
cept Islam; the siege lasts for two weeks; the Prophet re-
turns to al-Ji'rana, where the prisoners taken at Hunayn 
had been left; after releasing them he returns to Medina; a 
Thaqif delegation comes to Medina and pays homage to the 
Prophet.55 

16. Letters from the Prophet to various places—A letter 
to the people of Hajar;56 letter to al-Harith ibn 'Abd Kulal, 
Shurayh ibn 'Abd Kulal, and Nu'aym ibn 'Abd Kulal;57 

his letter to al-Mundhir ibn Sawa;58 his letter to the people 
of Yemen;59 his letter to Thaqif;60 his letter to the people 
of Ayla;61 his letter to Khuza'a;62 his letter to Zur'a ibn 
Dhl Yazan;63 his letter to 'Abd Allah ibn Jahsh 6 4 

17. Final days of the Prophet's life—He gives orders to 
make preparations for the campaign of Usama ibn Zayd; 
beginning of his illness; he urges the Muslims to carry out 
Usama's mission;65 intensification of his illness, his death, 
and his age;66 reference to the rebellion of al-Aswad al-'Ansi, 
who is defeated and killed in the Prophet's lifetime.67 

18. Personal matters—A letter to 'Abd al-Malik relates 
the death of Khadlja and the Prophet's marriage to 'A'isha.68 

55 Ibid. 
56 Al-Baladhuri, Futuh al-buldan, p. 60 [de Goeje ed., pp. 79f.]; Abu 'Ubayd, 

Amwal, p. 199. 
57 Abu 'Ubayd, Amwal, p. 13. 
58Ibid., p. 20. 
59Ibid., p. 27. 
60 Ibid., p. 190. 
61 Ibid., p. 200. 
62 Ibid. 
63 Al-Baladhuri, futuh al-buldan, p. 81 [de Goeje ed., pp. 69f.]; Abu 'Ubayd, 

Amwal, p. 201. 
64 Al-Tabari, Ta'rikh, I, 1273. 
65 Ibn Hisham, IV, 299f. [Wiistenfeld ed., I, ii, 1006ff.]; al-Tabari, Tankh, 

I, 1808f. 
66 Ibn Hisham, IV, 304f. [Wiistenfeld ed., I, ii, 1011]; al-Tabari, Ta'rikh, 

I, 1814; Husaynlya ed., II, 447, 454 [de Goeje ed., I, 1824, 1835]. 
67 Al-Tabari, Ta'rikh (Husaynlya), II, 431 [de Goeje ed., I, 1798], 
68 Al-Tabari, Tankh, I, 1770.' 
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In a letter to aJ-WaJid, 'Urwa explains that the Prophet 
married neither the sister of al-Ash'ath nor a woman of 
Kinda; he did marry a woman of Banu Jawn, but divorced 
her before consummating the marriage.69 

'Urwa did not limit his interest to the magshazi, but rather 
took up the period of the Rashidun as well. This is clear from 
some of the quotations which have come down to us from 
him. To form a general idea of his studies we can briefly refer 
to them here: 

1. tUrwa mentions Abu Bakr's decision to carry out Usa-
ma's mission, despite the apostasy (ridda) of the tribes and 
the critical situation of the Muslims.70 He relates the story 
of the apostasy of the tribes briefly, yet adequately and com­
prehensively,71 and provides details on the Ridda in al-Ya-
mama because of the great danger it posed.72 He also tells 
of Mutammam ibn Nuwayra coming to Abu Bakr to seek 
satisfaction for his brother's death, ask that the captives be 
released, and complain about Khalid ibn al-Walld; rUrwa 
then speaks of Abu Bakr's refusal to accept 'Uraar1S advice 
that he dismiss Khalid.73 

2. Abu Bakr fits out the armies and sends them to Syria, 
explaining the route each leader is to take;74 account of 
Ajnadayn, the date of the battle, the Muslim victory, and 
the names of some of those who were killed.75 

3. AI-'Abbas and Fatima's request that Abu Bakr grant 
them their inheritance from the Prophet—Fadak and the 
Prophet's share of Khaybar; Abu Bakr's refusal; the request 
by the wives of the Prophet that Abu Bakr grant them their 

69Ibid., Ill, 2458. 
70 Al-Tabari, Tarikh (Cairo: Matba'at al-Istiqama, 1358/1939), II, 461 

[de Goeje ed., I, 1848]. 
71 Ibid., II, 475 [de Goeje ed., I, 1871]. 
72 Al-Baladhuri, Futiih al-buldan, p. 99 [de Goeje ed., p. 89], 
73 Al-Tabari, Tankh,'I. 2085; II, 503. 
74Ibtd., I, 2085. 
75Ibtd., I, 2125. 
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inheritances from the Prophet's share of Khaybar and Fa-
dak, and the view of 'A'isha.76 

4. Abu Bakr gives up trade to devote his attention to the 
affairs of the Muslims, and is allotted a stipend from the 
treasury (bayt al-mal);77 illness of Abu Bakr and the date of 
his death.78 

5. Reference to the battle of al-Yarmuk;79 another to the 
battle of al-Qadisiya.80 

6. A report on rUmar ibn al-Khattab's journey to Ayla 
on his way to Jerusalem.81 

7. A report on the Battle of the Camel.82 

It is hardly possible for us to formulate any idea of 'Urwa's 
view of history based on his accounts concerning the period 
of the Rashidun, for he goes into relative detail only on the 
Ridda, and except for this topic offers us only tidbits and 
passing references. From his akbbar on the Ridda, we notice 
that he follows the same method he used in the Maghazt, and 
since we find more material extant from this latter work we 
can derive from it an approximate idea of 'Urwa's writing. 

In his Maghazi we find 1Urwa touching upon the begin­
ning of Qur'anic revelation, on the beginning of Muham­
mad's call, and on the two Hijras to Abyssinia and Medina. 
He then covers some of the activities of the Medinan period, 
such as the expedition of cAbd Allah ibn Jahsh, the great 
battle of Badr, the conflict with Qaynuqae, the Battle of the 
Ditch, the conflict with Banu Qurayza, the truce of al-Huday-

76Al-Baladhuri, FutAh al-buldAn, p. 44 [de Goeje ed., p. 30]; al-Tabari, 
Ta'rikh, I, 1825. 

77Abu 'Ubayd, Amwal, p. 211. 
78Al-TabarI, Ta'rikh, I, 2128, 2130. 
79Ibid., I, 2348. 
soIbid., I, 2251. 
81 Ibid., I, 2522. 
s2Ibid., I, 3208. cUrwa also gives a report on the killing of his brother 

Mus'ab and the role of 'Abd al-Malik ibn Marwan in the affair; ibid., II, 
811. 
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biya, the expedition to Mu'ta, the conquest of Mecca, the 
expeditions to Hunayn and al-Ta'if, some of the letters sent 
by the Prophet, and his final days. Some of his accounts pro-
vide replies to queries of the Umayyad court, while others are 
narratives he related to his students. 

It appears that his accounts were little more than basic 
sketches in varying degrees of detail. While some amount to 
nothing more than passing references, others provide us with 
continuous narratives, as in his discussions of Badr, al-Huday-
biya, and the conquest of Mecca. We note that he presents 
[only scattered notices] on the battle of Uhud,83 [yet he care-
fully notes the dates of such other expeditions as those of Ibn 
Jahsh, the Ditch, Banu Qurayza, Banu 1-Mustaliq, al-Huday-
biya, Hunayn, and Mu'ta.84 We can] see that 'Urwa covered 
the maghazi in the course of his studies, and that rather than 
limit himself to the military campaigns, he treated other as-
pects of the sira ranging from the beginning of revelation to 
the death of the Prophet. A reference to the Maghazi of 'Urwa 
appears in al-Sakhaw!,85 and Hajji Khalifa corroborates this 
in saying, "It is said that the first to compose a book on (the 
maghazi) was TJrwa ibn al-Zubayr."86 All we can deduce from 
the selections available to us is that 'Urwa did discuss the 
maghazi; we cannot distinguish in his accounts any clear plan 
for the sirafi 

'Urwa was a trustworthy scholar of hadith, and in his ac-

83 See al-Tabari, Ta'rikh (Istiqama), II, 194f. [de Goeje ed., I, 1397; also 
al-Waqidl, Maghazi (Jones ed.), I, 286f.; Ibn Kathir, Al-Bidaya wa-l-nthaya, 
IV, 46, 49], 

84 [Ibn Sa'd, III, ii, 6; Ibn Kathir, Al-Bidaya wa-l-nihdya, III, 249; IV, 
156, 164, 322.] 

KAl-I'lan bi-l-tawbikh, p. 88. [Cf. also Ibn Kathir, Al-Bidaya wa-l-nibaya, 
IV, 55f.] 

86 Kasbf al-zunun, II, 1747. 
8 [On the Maghazi of 'Urwa ibn al-Zubayr, see now Maghazi Rasiil Allah 

li-XIrtva ibn al-Zubayr, compiled and edited by Muhammad Mustafa 1-A'zamI 
(Riyad, 1981); also Salwa Mamduh Mursi, "'Urwa ibn al-Zubayr wa-bidayat 
madrasat al-maghazl," M.A. thesis (Jordan University, 1979).] 
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counts he adhered to the method of his colleagues. His social 
position and connections enabled him to take accounts di­
rectly from their sources, thus in some of his accounts we find 
mention of the tsnad,&? while in others he provides none at 
all.88 It appears that in his written replies to tAbd al-Malik, 
'Urwa incorporated a number of hadiths into a single contin­
uous narrative, and that for such accounts he provided no 
isnad. And let us recall that tUrwa was among the foremost 
of the tabi'iin, that rules on the isnad had not yet crystallized, 
and that it was deemed a reliable course of action to take an 
account—particularly a historical one—direcdy from a tahi'. 

Alongside oral narratives, tUrwa also paid heed to written 
documents, quoting many of the letters, cited above, which 
the Prophet sent to various places—this is an important aspect 
of 'Urwa's approach to historical writing. Similarly, he cites 
the Qur'anic verses pertaining to the events he describes, as 
in his discussion of the Hijra,89 his explanation of the Mus­
lims' frame of mind as they set out for Badr,90 and his expo­
sition on the conflict with Qaynuqat.91 Likewise, he explains 
for Ibn Abi Hunayda, the secretary of al-Walid, the historical 
circumstances behind the Qur'anic verse, "O ye who believe, 
when believing women come to you as emigrants . . . (it is to 
God) to judge among you, and God is knowing and wise." 
He elucidates an important aspect of this passage, the emigra­
tion of certain women, desirous of converting to Islam, from 
Mecca to Medina after the negotiations at al-Hudaybiya, and 
the Prophet's position concerning them 92 This attests to the 
early connection between history and Qur'anic exegesis; 

87Al-Tabaii, Ta'rikh, I, 1147, 1154, 1185, 1237, 1331, 1454, 1534, 1808, 
1809, 1813, 1825, 1835, 2128, 2251. 

isIbid., 1,1140, 1167, 1173, 1199,1296,1360, 1463,1518,1610, 1617, 
1654, 1670, 1836, 2085, 2125, 2307, 2522. 

s9Ibid., I, 1224. 
90Ibid., I, 1284. 
91 Ibid., I, 1360. 
92 Ibn Hisham, III, 340f. [Wiistenfeld ed., I, ii, 754f. The verse is Siirat 

al-Mumtahana (LX), 10.] 
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eventually it became common practice to cite Qur'anic verses 
as evidence in maghazi writings. 

The worth of an account depended on the reliability of the 
narrator, or raw, who transmitted it. iUrwa took material 
from the most trusted authorities. His best-known source, and 
the one from whom most of his hadith derive, was 'A'isha, 
the importance of whose hadiths was well known to him.93 

He also gives reports on the authority of the Zubayrids,94 and 
of such others as Usama ibn Zayd,95 'Abd Allah ibn 'Amr 
ibn al-'As,96 and Abu Dharr.97 This emphasis on the hadith 
scholar accounts for the presence of only a faint folkloric echo 
in what he reported. For example, he relates on the authority 
of 'A'isha that "when the Negus died it was said that there 
would always be light on his tomb."98 In this case we see 
TJrwa's concern for accuracy in his account, since he exercises 
caution and says kana yutahaddathu, "it was said." Another 
example we find when he tells of the Muslims' capture and 
questioning of the Quraysh water-bearers before Badr, saying, 
"They alleged (za'amu) that the Prophet said . . ., etc."99 

In his accounts tUrwa does quote some poetry, albeit little, 
recited by participants in the events concerned, such as the 
verses spoken by Waraqa ibn Nawfal when he saw Bilal being 
tortured in the burning heat,100 and by Abu Bakr and Bilal 
when they were afflicted by fever after the Hijra.101 Poetry 
being a fundamental element of both culture and narrative, it 
appears that this was characteristic of the Medinan milieu. And 

93 See al-Dhahabl, Tamjim, p. 46. Cf. also al-Tabari, Tankh, I, 1147, on 
the beginning of revelation; I, 1334ff., on the Hijra; I, 1262, 1547, on some 
of the marriages of the Prophet. 

94Al-Tabari, Tankh, I, 2348, 3207; II, 811. 
95 Ibn Hisham, II, 236, 237 [Wustenfeld ed., I, i, 412, 413], 
96Al-TabarI, Tarikh, I, 1185. 
97Ibid., I, 1154. 
98 See Ibn Hisham, II, 51 [Wustenfeld ed., I, i, 271f.], on the story of 

those who mocked the Prophet. 
99 Al-Tabari, Tankh, I, 1288. 
100Aghani, III, 15 [Bulaq ed., Ill, 14]. 
101 Al-Baladhuri, Futiih al-buldan, p. 25 [de Goeje ed., pp. Ilf.]. 
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as Abu I-Zinad said of him, "I never saw anyone who related 
more poetry than tUrwa."102 

TJrwa's style is a lucid and direct one, vigorous and smooth, 
and far removed from exaggeration or effort to influence the 
reader's opinion. He sometimes leads into an event with an 
introduction which places it in its historical context and pro­
duces a continuous, uninterrupted narrative. We see him doing 
this in his discussion of the battle of Badr, which he prefaces 
by calling attention to the beginning of hostilities between the 
Muslims and Quraysh,103 and also in his account of the Hijra 
to Abyssinia, which he introduces by recalling the develop­
ment of relations between the Muslims and Quraysh since the 
beginning of the Prophet's call.104 He gives a similar intro­
duction for his account of the Hijra to Medina.105 It is note­
worthy that the continuity of his discussion, in both its vitality 
and its fluid style, proceeds without interruption in his written 
essays. 

We can see from the foregoing that historical studies began 
with very close ties to the study of hadith, even derived from 
it, and that in both form and structure the style of the histor­
ical account was that of the hadith. It can be said that 'Urwa 
offered us a vital realistic image, without exaggeration, of 
Muslim experiences and accomplishments. It appears that the 
historical conception behind such study was to set out the 
important historical circumstances and events in the lives of 
the Prophet and the early Muslims, and involved a recognition 
of the importance of both the sira and the experience of the 
umma. By the same token, we sense from the queries set by 
the Umayyad court that interest in the maghazl was not Iim-

102 Al-Dhahabi, Tarajim, p. 46. When it was said to 'Urwa, "What a great 
amount you recite, O Abu 'Abd Allah!" he replied, "What is mine compared 
to that of A isha? No subject ever passed her way without her reciting 
poetry about it." 

103 Al-Tabari, Tarikh, I, 1284. 
104ZW., I, 1180f. 
105 Ibid., I, 1224f. 
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ited to the learned, but rather was representative of a more 
general social and cultural appeal. 

'Urwa's work was extremely important, for by gathering so 
many historical hadiths into the maghazi, laying part of the 
groundwork for historical studies, and articulating a historical 
conception of considerable influence, he placed the study of 
history on its own firm and independent foundations. As one 
might expect, neither the course followed by historical re­
search, nor its structure, are clear at this early stage. But what 
cUrwa began al- Zuhri brought to fruition, in a way which 
now calls for our attention. 

II. 

The primary role in the rise of the historical school of Me­
dina belongs to Abu Bakr Muhammad ibn Muslim ibn tUbayd 
Allah ibn 'Abd Allah ibn Shihab al-Zuhri, for it was he who 
placed it on solid foundations and elaborated its approach to 
the study of history. Studying him is thus important from this 
point of view; and from another, it enables us to establish 
whether the origins of the maghazi go back to the folkloric 
qisas tales, as some believe,106 or to the serious studies under­
taken by hadith scholars and their students. 

The date of al-Zuhrfs death is almost certain, since the sources 
consistendy give it as 17 Ramadan 124/742.107 As one might 
expect, the date of his birth is disputed. According to various 
reports it was A.H. 50, 51, 56, or 58;108 but both al-Zubayr 

106 See EJ\ IV, 441 (G. Levi Delia Vida). 
107 Al-Bukhari, Al-Ta'rikh al-kabir, I, i, 221; Ibn Qutayba, Ma'arif, p. 239 

['Ukasha ed., p. 472]; Ibn al-Jawzi, Safivat al-safiva, II, 79; al-Yafi'i, Mir Ht 
al-jamn, I, 260; al-Dhahabi/Fischer, p. 435. Both al-Dhahabi (Tarajim, p. 
73) and Ibn Kathir (Al-BiMya- wa-l-nihaya, IX, 344) give the alternative dates 
of A.H. 123 and 125, but confirm 124. Cf. also Aghrni, VI, 106. 

108 Ibn al-Jawzi, Safivat al-safiva, II, 79; Ibn Khallikan, WafayAt al-a'yan 
(Cairo, A.H. 1310), I, 452 ['Abbas ed., IV, 178]; al-Dhahabi, Tamjtm, p. 
73; idem, Tadhkirat al-huffaz, I, 102; Ibn Kathir, Al-BiMya wa-l-nihaya, IX, 
344 (al-Waqidi making it A.H. 58). 
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ibn Bakkar109 and al-Waqidl, in one of his reports,110 state 
that he lived to the age of 72, making it probable that he was 
born about 51/671.111 

Al-Zuhri studied under some of the foremost scholars of 
hadith, four of whom—Sa'id ibn al-Musayyab,112 Aban ibn 
'Uthman,113 'Ubayd Allah ibn 'Abd Allah ibn 'Utba,114 and 
'Urwa ibn al-Zubayr—he held in special esteem and regard 
and very frequently quoted. He considered them the "four 
seas" of knowledge,115 and it is reported that he mastered 
their learning and added to it studies of his own.116 

Al-Zuhri was renowned for his strong memory—a very im-
portant asset in his day—and tried to fortify it by taking honey 
syrup.117 More important to us is his concern to record his 
notes and the hadith he heard on slates (alwah) and sheets 
(.suhuf) in order to aid his memory. Indeed, his contempo-
raries were acutely aware of this point and considered his habit 
of setting material down in writing to be a fundamental rea-
son for his ascendancy in learning over the other men of his 
age. One account has it that he used to write down everything 
he heard, and according to another he used to write down 

109 Ibn Kathlr, Al-Bidaya wa-l-nihaya, IX, 344. 
110 Al-Dhahabl/Fischer, p. 435. 
111 For general information on al-Zuhrl, see Ibn Sa'd, IV, i, 92; V, 158; 

Ibn Qutayba, Ma'arif, p. 239 ['Ukasha ed., p. 472]; Abu Nu'aym, Hilyat 
al-awliya, I, 370f.; Ibn al-jawzl, Safivat al-saftva, II, 78; Ibn Khallikan, Wa-
fayat al-a'yan, I, 451 ['Abbas ed., IV, 178]; Ibn al-Athlr, Al-Kamil ft 
l-ta'rikh, II, 119 [Tornberg ed., V, 195]; al-Dhahabl, Tarajim, pp. 64ff.; 
idem, Tadhktrat al-huffaz, I, 105; Ibn Kathlr, Al-Bidaya wa-l-nihaya, IX, 340ff.; 
[Horovitz, "Biographies," II, 33ff.; EI\ IV, 1239ff. (J. Horovitz); Petersen, 
'All and Mu'amva, pp. 36f.; Rosenthal, Muslim Historiography, pp. 130ff.; 
Abbott, Studies, I, 17ff.; II, 21ff.; GAS, I, 280ff.; Azmi, Studies, pp. 278f.]. 

112 He attended Sa'Id's sessions for 6-10 years. See al-Dhahabl, Tarajim, 
p. 67; [Abu Zur'a, Ta'rikk I, 411, 412], 

113 See al-Bukhari, Al-Ta'rikh al-kabir, I, i, 451. 
114 See Aghani, VIII, 92, 93. 
115 Ibid., VIII, 93; [Abu Zur'a, Ta'rikh, I, 407], 
U6Ibid., VIII, 92; Ibn Hajar, Tahdhib al-tahdbib, VII, 65. 
117 Al-Dhahabl, Tarajim, p. 70. Cf. also al-Bukhari, Al-Ta'rikh al-kabir, I, 

i, 221; Ibn al-Jawzi, Safivat al-safiva, II, 77f. 
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traditions (sunan) of the Prophet and "what came down con-
cerning his Companions."118 

For his studies on the maghazl al-Zuhri depended primarily 
on 'Urwa ibn al-Zubayr. He studied with him, apparentiy for 
a fairly long time, regarded him with particular esteem, and 
referred to him as "an inexhaustible sea."119 Al-Bukhari refers 
to al-Zuhrfs composition of a work on the maghazl in saying, 
"We were told by . . . Musa ibn 'Uqba from Ibn Shihab, who 
said, 'These are the maghazl of the Aposde of God,' and then 
related the hadlth,"120 Al-Sakhawi further reports that al-Zuhri 
reported the maghazl from 'Urwa.121 Hajjl Khalifa spoke of 
the Maghazl of al-Zuhri, and said, "And among them (i.e., 
maghazl works) was the Maghazl of Muhammad ibn Muslim 
al-Zuhri."122 We might additionally note that in those parts 
of al-Zuhrfs Maghazl that have come down to us, the ac-
counts of cUrwa figure as the primary source. He also fre-
quently quotes Sa'Td ibn al-Musayyab,123 'Ubayd Allah ibn 
'Abd Allah ibn 'Utba,124 and many others as well.125 

118 Al-Sam'anI, Kitab al-ansdb, published in facsimile by D. S. Margoliouth 
(Leiden, 1912), p. 281; al-Dhahabl, Tamjim, p. 68; Ibn Hajar, TahdMb al-
tahdhib, VII, 68; Ibn Kathlr, Al-Bidaya wa-l-nihaya, IX, 342; [and much ear-
lier, Abu Zur'a, Ta'rikh, I, 412], 

119 Al-Bukhari, Al-Ta'rikh al-kabir, IV, 32; Abu Nu'aym, Hilyat al-aw-
liyd', III, 360; al-Dhahabl, Tarajtm, p. 45; Ibn Hajar, Tahdbib al-tahdhib, 
VII, 65. 

120 Al-Bukhari, Sabih (Cairo, A.H. 1296), V, 14. 
121 Al-I'ldn bi-l-tawbikh, p. 88; see also Ibn Sayyid al-Nas, 'Uyiin cd-athar, 

I, 81. 
122 Kashf al-zuniin, II, 1747. 
123 Al-WaqidI, Maghazi (the complete but unpublished text edited by Pro-

fessor Jones from the British Museum manuscript), pp. 151, 219, 421, 436, 
562, 828, 869, 1025 [Jones ed., I, 103, 110, 111, 250; II, 477, 491, 505, 
621, 696, 715, 865; III, 890, 945]; al-Baladhuri, Ansab al-ttshraf, V, 25, 27, 
67, 96 ['Abbas ed., IV, i, 512, 514, 556, 590]; al Tabari, Ta'rikh, I, 1815. 

124 Al-WaqidI, Maghazi (Jones MS), pp. 383, 519, 657, 816 [Jones ed., II, 
435, 576, 695, 717, 871; III, 890]; al-Tabari, Ta'rikh, I, 1834. 

125 E.g., Ibn Ka'b ibn Malik (al-Waqidl, Maghazi, Jones MS, pp. 162, 208 
[Jones ed., I, 184, 236; II, 509, 535]; Ibn Sayyid al-Nas, XSyun al-athar, I, 
231), Anas ibn Malik (al-Tabari, Ta'rikh, I, 1829), Muhammad ibn Jubayr 
ibn Mut'im (al-Waqidi, Jones MS, p. 381 [Jones ed., I, 110; II, 795]; Ibn 
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It seems that in Medina al-Zuhri undertook a wide-ranging 
study of the hadith of the Prophet and his Companions, aided 
in this endeavor by his social position, his strong memory, 
and his reliance on writing. Rather than limit his studies and 
queries to hadith scholars, he questioned anyone who might 
have known hadith materials or other accounts and who had 
a reputation for being trustworthy. To this end he used to 
attend sessions and visit people in their homes. Al-DhahabI 
says, "Ibrahim ibn Sa'd said, Ί once said to my father, "In 
what respects did al-Zuhri surpass the rest of you?" He re­
plied, "He used to come to the sessions by the front way 
rather than from the back, and there would remain in the 
session not a single man, old or young, whom he had not 
queried. He would also come to the house of one of the An-
sar, and again, there would remain not a soul, old man or 
young, aged woman or younger, whom he had not queried. 
He even tried to ask questions of young ladies in their private 
quarters."' "126 

An investigation of his great reputation as a jurist and scholar 
of hadith is not what concerns us here;127 rather we will con­
fine our inquiry to his work as a historian. It will suffice for 
us to recall some of what was said concerning him. He was 
"the depository of the learning of the seven jurists" and "had 
no equal among men," as Malik ibn Anas said. tUmar ibn 
'Abd al-tAzIz said that "there remained no one more learned 

Sayyid al-Nas, XJyiin al-athar, I, 30), Ibn 'Abbas (al-Tabari, Ta'rikh, I, 1569; 
Ibn Sayyid al-Nas, XJyun al-athar, II, 145), 'Abd Allah ibn 'Amr ibn al-'As 
(Ibn Hisham, I, i, 412), Abii Salama ibn 'Abd al-Rahman ibn 'Awf (al-
Waqidi, Jones MS, p. 754 [Jones ed., II, 865; III, 1103]; al-Tabari, Ta'rikh, 
I, 1019; Ibn Sayyid al-Nas, XJyiin al-atbar, I, 142), Malik ibn Aws al-Ha-
dathan (al-Waqidi, Jones MS, pp. 249, 363 [Jones ed., I, 413]). 

126 Al-Dhahabi, Tarajitn, p. 69. 
127 Ibn al-Jawzi, Sajwat al-safiva, II, 77ff.; Abu Nu'aym, Hilyat al-awliya, 

III, 360f.; al-Dhahabl, Tarajim, pp. 68, 70; idem, Tadhkirat al-huffaz, I, 104, 
105; Ibn Kathir, Al-Bidaya wa-l-nihaya, IX, 342, 343; Horovitz ["Biogra­
phies," II, 33ff.], Al-MaghAzt al-iila. 
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than he on Islamic practice (.mnna)," and Ibrahim ibn Sa'd 
related from his father that al-Zuhri gathered together knowl-
edge which no one before him had ever collected. 'Abd al-
Rahman ibn Abl 1-Zinad said that in his father's opinion, al-
Zuhri was "the most learned of all men."128 This serves to 
indicate his enormous prestige and influence. 

Al-Tabari summarizes the role of al-Zuhri the historian by 
saying, "Muhammad ibn Muslim al-Zuhri was foremost in 
knowledge of the maghazi of the Apostle of God—may the 
blessing and peace of God be upon him—and akhbar about 
Quraysh and the Ansar, a great transmitter of narratives about 
the Apostle of God—may the blessing and peace of God be 
upon him—and his Companions."129 We will now turn to his 
historical studies, beginning with the Maghazt. 

It appears that al-Zuhri's studies dealt with the life of the 
Prophet, beginning with certain events preceding the rise of 
Islam, some of them concerning the Prophet, then continuing 
on to his life in Mecca and later Medina. Al-Sakhawi (d. 902/ 
1497) states that Hajjaj ibn Abl Manf (d. after 216/831) 
transmitted the magfhazi on the authority of al-Zuhri,130 and 
Hajjl Khalifa confirms that al-Zuhri did write a book on this 
subject.131 Al-Zuhri used the term sira132 as well as ma-
ghazi,133 but the former does not appear as a title for his work. 

Of al-Zuhri's Maghazi we have only selections, found pri-
marily in the works of Ibn Ishaq, al-Waqidi, al-Tabari, al-
Baladhuri, and Ibn Sayyid al-Nas. The pages below attempt 

128 See al-Bukhari, Al-Ta'rikh al-kabir, I, i, 621; [Abu Zur'a, Ta'rikh, I, 
411]; Ibn al-jawzl, Safivat al-safwa, II, 77; al-Yafi'I, Mir at al-janan, I, 261; 
al-Dhahabi, Tarajim, pp. 68, 72; Ibn Kathlr, Al-Bidaya wa-L-nihaya, IX, 342. 

129 Al-Tabari, Al-Muntakhab min kitab dhayl al-mudbayyal (Cairo, A.H. 1336), 
p. 97. 

U0Al-I'lan bi-l-tawbikh, p. 88. 
131 Kashf al-zuniin, II, 1747. 
li2Aghani, XIX, 59. 
133 Al-Tabari, Muntakhab, p. 97. 
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to place these selections within their historical framework so 
that we may formulate an approximate idea of the structure 
of this maghazl work:h 

I . THE PRE-ISLAMIC ERA 

1. The day (Friday) on which Adam was created, the day 
he entered Paradise, and the day he was expelled from it; 
an account of various dates from Adam's fall to earth until 
the call of the Prophet.134 

2. An account of Noah, the propagation of his sons and 
descendants on the earth, and its division among them.135 

3. Chronology of the descendants of Ishmael (i.e., the 
Arabs), beginning with the fire of Abraham, to the Year of 
the Elephant, and ending with the establishment of the Hijra 
dating system.136 

4. Akhbar on some of the Prophets;137 God's call to Moses, 
His mention of Muhammad and his umma to him;138 Moses 
and Khadir;139 the sickness of Job;140 account (from Ka'b 
al-Ahbar) of Abraham's vow to sacrifice his son Isaac, and 
Satan's effort to thwart the plan.141 

These fragments indicate al-Zuhrfs interest in narratives on 
past prophets. We do not know whether they were actually 
part of his Maghazl, but this seems unlikely. 

h [Cf. also al-San'ani, Al-Musannaf, edited by Habib al-Rahman Al-A'zaml 
(Beirut, 1390-92/1970-72), III, 31 Iff. This very long section reports the 
Maghazi of al-Zuhri in the recension of Ma'mar ibn Rashid and adds much 
to our knowledge.] 

134 Al-Tabari, Ta'rikh, I, 112. 
135 Ibid., I, 200f. 
136 Ibid., I, 1253. 
137 Abu Nu'aym, Hilyat al-awliyd', III, 372; Ibn Kathlr, Al-Biddya wa-

l-nihaya, IX, 348. 
138 Abu Nu'aym, Hilyat al-awliya', III, 375. 
139 Al-Bukhari, Sahih, I, 27; al-Tabari, Ta'rikh, I, 419. 
140 Abu Nu'aym, Hilyat d-awliya, III, 374. 
141 Al-Tabari, Ta'rikh, I, 293. 
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5. Some accounts concerning Amina bint Wahb when 
she was pregnant with the Prophet;142 the death of 'Abd 
Allah ibn 'Abd al-Muttalib while staying with his maternal 
uncles in Yathrib.143 

6. Al-Sakhawi144 mentions that Yunus ibn Yazid (d. 159/ 
775) transmitted from al-Zuhri the mashdhid al-Nabi, or the 
events the Prophet witnessed prior to Islam, such as the 
rebuilding of the Ka'ba and the Hilf al-fudulAl-Zuhri re-
jects the claim that Muhammad participated in the war of 
al-Fijar,145 and this account in essence confirms the testi-
mony of al-Sakhawi. 

7. Khadlja bint Khuwaylid concludes an agreement with 
Muhammad ibn 'Abd Allah for him to lead her caravan to 
Syria; their marriage and Muhammad's age at the time.146 

8. Al-Zuhri also gives accounts on the signs, dalail, of 
Muhammad's prophethood, among them accounts of an 
angel warning Chosroes,147 and of a soothsayer relating a 
warning from his master about the end of paganism. Simi-
larly, he attributes to 'Umar ibn al-Khattab a report con-
cerning one of these supernatural phenomena.148 

I I . ERA OF MUHAMMAD'S PROPHETIC MISSION 

A. The Meccan Period 
1. The beginning of Qur'anic revelation—the first signs, 

"true vision" (al-ruyd al-sadiqa), devotions (tahannuth) in 
142 Ibn Sayyid al-Nas, 'Uyun al-athar, I, 25. 
i43Ibid.; Ibn al-Athir, Al-Kamilfll-ta'rikh, II, 6 [Tornberg ed., II, 6], 
144 Al-I'lan bi-l-tawbikh, p. 88. 
1 [A famous pact concluded between a number of Quraysh clans, probably 

about A.D. 605. The specific details concerning this pact are much disputed; 
see EP, III, 389 (C. Pellat).] 

145 Ibn al-Athlr, Al-K&milfi l-ta'rikh, I, 443. 
146 Al-Tabari, Ta'rikb, I, 1154; Ibn Sayyid al-Nas, 'Uyun al-athar, I, 47, 

50. 
147 Al-Tabari, Ta'rikh, I, 1014. 
148 Ibid., I, 1145. 
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seclusion, descent of first revelation (nuzul al-wahy); the 
Prophet's agitation and his return to Khadlja, who takes 
him to Waraqa ibn Nawfal, Waraqa's words; how the 
Prophet first knew that God had chosen him for His mis-
sion;149 the first and last verses of the Qur'an to be re-
vealed;150 interruption of revelation for a time, and the 
Prophet's anxiety over this;151 the first Muslims.152 

2. An idea of the Quraysh attitude towards the Prophet's 
preaching and other activities;153 he tries during festivals to 
spread his message among such other tribes as Kinda and 
Banu 'Amir ibn Sa'sa'a, but without success.154 

3. The Night Journey (Al-Isra ) and Muhammad's ascent 
through the seven heavens (.Al-Mi'raj).155 

4. The Hijra to Abyssinia—the first to emigrate; attitude 
of the Negus towards the Muslims; Quraysh sends a dele-
gation to persuade the Negus to hand over the Muslims; 
failure of the delegation; other details concerning the Ne-
gus.156 

5. The Quraysh boycott of Banu Hashim and Banu Abd 
al-Muttalib (al-Zuhri under a collective isnad);157 death of 
Abu Talib.158 

149 Ibn Hisham, I, 249 [Wiistenfeld ed., I, i, 150f.]; al-Bukhari, Sahih, I, 
115; al-Tabari, Ta'rikh, I, 1147f., 1154; Ibn Sayyid al-Nas, XSyun al-athar, 
I, 84f. 

150 Al-Tabari, Ta'rikh, I, 1155; Ibn al-Nadlm, Fihrist, p. 25; Ibn Sayyid 
al-Nas, 'Uyun al-athar, I, 88. 

151 Al-Tabari, Ta'rikh, I, 1155; Ibn Sayyid al-Nas, 'Uyun al-athar, I, 85. 
152 Al-Tabari, Ta'rikh, I, 1167; Ibn Sayyid al-Nas, 'Uyun al-athar, I, 91. 
153 Ibn Hisham, I, i, 203. See Ibn Sayyid al-Nas, 'Uyun al-athar, I, 11 If. 
154 Ibn Hisham, I, i, 282, 283; al-Tabari, Ta'rikh, I, 1205f., 1213. 
155 Ibn Hisham, II, 41 [Wiistenfeld ed., I, i, 266]; al-Bukhari, Sahlh, TV, 

99, 116, 130; Ibn Sayyid al-Nas, 'Uyun al-athar, I, 142, 145, 148. 
156 Ibn Hisham, I, i, 217fF., 222f.; Ibn Sayyid al-Nas, 'Uyun al-athar, I, 

115, 126, 292. 
157 Ibn Sayyid al-Nas, 'Uyun al-athar, I, 126f. 
158 Ibid., I, 131f. 
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6. The pledge of al-'Aqaba—text of the pledge; begin-
nings of Islam in Medina.159 

B. The Medinan Period 
1. Discussion of the Hijra to Medina and the affair of 

Suraqa ibn Jasham;160 the Muslims await the Prophet; cir-
cumstances and date of his arrival; building of the mosque 
of Medina;161 effect of the city's weather on the Muhajirun 
and the affliction of some of them by fever.162 

2. The expedition of 'Abd Allah ibn Jahsh; number and 
identity of the participants;163 the Prophet's view of the 
attack on the caravan.164 

3. Some information on the Jews' view of the Prophet;165 

attitude of 'Abd Allah ibn Ubayy (rude and hostile);166 

reorientation of the qibla towards the Ka'ba;167 fasting en-
joined as a religious obligation, and the date for this; zakdt 
al-fitr also enjoined.168 

4. Expedition of Badr—al-Zuhri's account appears under 
a collective isnad;169 other details pertaining to Badr: the 
vision of 'Atika bint 'Abd al-Muttalib about the Quraysh 

159 Al-Bukhari, Sahib, IV, 243; al-Tabari, Ta'rikh, I, 1213; Ibn Sayyid al-
Nas, 'Uyitn al-athar, I, 157f. 

160 Ibn Hisham, I, i, 23 If. 
161 Al-Tabari, Ta'rikh, I, 1250, 1256; Ibn Sayyid al-Nas, Vyun al-athar, 

I, 185f. See also al-Bukhari, Sahib, IV, 245f., 256ff.; V, 43. 
162 Ibn Hisham, I, i, 414f. 
163 Al-Tabari, Ta'rikh, I, 1273. 
164 Al-WaqidI, Maghazi (Cairo), p. 10 [Jones ed., I, 18]; Ibn Sayyid al-

Nas, 'Vyun al-athar, I, 229. 
165 Ibn Hisham, I, i, 393f. 
166 Ibid., I, ii, 591. 
167 Ibn Sayyid al-Nas, 'Uyitn al-athar, I, 221, 236. 
168 Ibid., I, 239. [The zakat al-fitr is an obligatory charitable donation of 

provisions to be made at the end of the fasting month of Ramadan. See EI\ 
TV, 1204 (J. Schacht).] 

169 Al-Tabari, Ta'rikh, 1291fF.; Aghani, IV, 170ff. [Bulaq ed., IV, 17ff.]. 
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caravan;170 Ima' ibn Rahda offers Quraysh ten camels and 
indicates his willingness to render further assistance; cUmayr 
ibn Wahb, a Quraysh spy, reports on the discipline of the 
Muslims and advises Quraysh to avoid a fight, but although 
'Utba ibn Rabfa supports this, Abu Jahl interrupts and 
rejects the advice, and the encounter with the Muslims be­
gins; Abu Jahl's curse upon seeing the Muslims; the Prophet 
sees Quraysh approaching, his prayers and curse upon 
them;171 other details,172 including mention of the first 
Muslim martyr and the first martyr from each Muslim group; 
the Prophet inspects the field of batde; the numbers of those 
killed among the Muslims and Quraysh; the time when the 
Quraysh prisoners were brought forth, and the Prophefs 
inclination to deal leniently with them.173. 

5. The raid of al-SawIq and its date.174 

6. Deterioration of relations with the Jews and the out­
break of conflict with them; al-Aws kill Ka'b ibn al-Ash-
raf;175 al-Aws and al-Khazraj compete to gain the Prophet's 
favor, and al-Khazraj kill the Jew Ibn AbI I-Huqayq;176 

fearfulness of the Jews, and the implementation of the fa­
mous kit&b.177 

7. The conflict with Banu Qaynuqat as a result of the 
revelation of the verse, "And if thou fearest treachery from 

170 Al-Tabari, Ta'rikh, I, 1212. 
171 Al-WaqidI, Maghazi (Cairo), pp. 43, 45f., 50, also the Jones MS, pp. 

52f., 56f., 131; al-Tabari, Ta'rikh, I, 1322f. 
172 Al-WaqidI, Maghazi (Cairo), pp. 62, 82, and the Jones MS, p. 101. 
173Ibid., pp. 89, 109, IlOf., and the Jones MS, pp. 107f. [For al-Waqidl's 

quotations from al-Zuhri on Badr, see now Jones' edition of the Maghazi, I, 
34f., 59f., 60, 62ff., 70, 91ff, 103, 110, IlOf., 116, 119, 144, 145f., 152f., 
156.] 

174 Ibid., p. 142, and the Jones MS, pp. 159f. [Jones ed., I, 181f.]. 
l7sIbid., pp. 144f., and the Jones MS, p. 162 [Jones ed., I, 184ff.]. 
176Al-TabarI, Ta'rikh, I, 1378f. 
177Al-Waqidi, Maghazi (Cairo), p. 151 [Jones ed., I, 191f.]. 
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a people, cast them out in like measure"; details on the 
campaign, its date, and the treatment of Banu Qaynuqa'.178 

8. Other raids and expeditions—the raid to Qararat al-
Kudr against Banu Sulaym and Ghatafan 22 months after 
the Hijra;179 the dispatch of an expedition against Banu 
Sulaym in Buhran 27 months after the Hijra.180 

9. Battle of Uhud—al-Zuhrfs account under a collective 
isnad;lsl Muslim deliberations on whether to stay in Me-
dina or set out to meet Quraysh;182 opinion of 'Abd Allah 
ibn Abl Salul (Ibn Ubayy);183 withdrawal of the "hypo-
crites" (munafiqun) and the numbers of the Muslims; the 
fighting, circulation of the rumor that the Prophet had been 
killed, then one of the Muslims sees him after the battle;184 

Ubayy ibn Khalaf, of Quraysh, tries to kill the Prophet, but 
Muhammad outfights and kills him;185 details on the mar-
tyrdom of Hamza ibn 'Abd al-Muttalib;186 the Prophet in-
spects the field of battle.187 

10. Expulsion of Banu l-Nadlr, a Jewish tribe, from Me-
dina—circumstances of the affair, its date, and the condi-
tions Muhammad imposed; the possessions of Banu l-Nadlr 

178Ibid., pp. 139ff., and the Jones Ms, pp. 156ff. [Jones ed., I, 177ff.]; al-
Tabari, Ta'rikh, I, 1360. [The relevant verse is from Surat al-Anfal (VIII), 
58.] 

179 Al-WaqidI, Maghazi (Cairo), p. 143, and the Jones MS, p. 124 [Jones 
ed., I, 182], 

180 Ibid., p. 159 [Jones ed., I, 196f.]. 
181 Al-WaqidI, Maghazi (Jones MS), p. 185 [Jones ed., I, 199ff.|; al-Tabari, 

Ta'rikh, I, 1384ff.; Ibn Sayyid al-Nas, Uyun al-athar, II, 2ff. 
182 Al-WaqidI, Maghazi (Cairo), pp. 164ff., and the Jones MS, pp. 185f. 
183 Ibn Hisham, I, ii, 591. 
184 Al-WaqidI, Maghazi (Cairo), pp. 184ff., and the Jones MS, p. 208; al-

Tabari, Ta'rikh, I, 1406; Ibn Sayyid al-Nas, 'Uyun al-athar, II, 5, l l f . 
185 Al-Waqidi, Maghazi (Cairo), pp. 185f., and the Jones MS, p. 219; al-

Tabari, Ta'rikh, I, 1406f. 
186 Al-WaqidI, Maghazi (Cairo), p. 212. 
187 Ibn Hisham, I, ii, 576; al-Waqidl, Maghazi (Cairo), p. 239 [for the 

Uhud accounts from al-Zuhri, see the Jones ed., I, 209, 236, 250, 286, 310]; 
Ibn Sayyid al-Nas, 'Uyun al-athar, II, 21. 
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and their variety; the Prophet divides the booty seized from 
them among the Muslims.188 

11. Battle of the Ditch—al-Zuhri's account under a col-
lective isnad\1S9 difficulty of the Muslim position; the Prophet 
negotiates with some of the groups besieging Medina, the 
Ansar viewpoint opposed to any bargaining; the sole Qur-
aysh attempt to break the Medinan line of defense, and its 
failure;190 the Prophet uses the conspiracy of Banu Qurayza 
against the Muslims as a means of provoking suspicions 
among his enemies; the storms and the end of the siege.191 

12. The attack on Banu Qurayza (the third Jewish tribe 
of Medina) immediately after the Battle of the Ditch,192 and 
the terms to which they submitted;193 other details.194 

13. Dispatch of an expedition against Banu Lihyan (al-
Zuhri in a collective isndd).195 

14. The "Affair of the Lie" (Hadith al-ifk).196 

15. The expedition of Zayd ibn Haritha against Umm 
Qirfa.197 

16. The truce of al-Hudaybiya—intentions of the Prophet; 
number of Muslims who set out from Medina with him 

188 Al-Waqidi, Maghazi (Jones MS), pp. 158ff., 331ff. [Jones ed., I, 180, 
378]; Yahya ibn Adam, Kitab al-kharaj, edited by Ahmad Muhammad Shakir 
(Cairo, A.H. 1347), p. 33; al-Baladhuri, Futuh al-buldan, pp. 18, 20; al-Ta-
bari, Ta'rikb, I, 1451; Ibn Sayyid al-Nas, TJyun al-athar, II, 48. 

is? Al-Waqidi, Maghazi (Jones MS), pp. 387ff. [Jones ed., II, 441f.]; al-
Tabari, Ta'rikb, I, 1462; Ibn Sayyid al-Nas, 'Uyun al-athar, II, 58ff. 
' i9o Al-WaqidI, Maghazi (Jones MS), pp. 421ff. [Jones ed., II, 477ff.]; al-

Tabari, Ta'rikh, I, 1473. 
191 Al-Waqidi, Maghazi (Jones MS), pp. 431f., 436 [Jones ed., II, 486f., 

491], See also al-Tabari, Ta'rikh, I, 1475f. 
192 Al-Tabari, Ta'rikh, I, 1485; Ibn Sayyid al-Nas, 'Uyun al-athar, II, 68. 
193 Al-Baladhuri, Futuh al-buldan, p. 22. 
194 Ibn Sayyid al-Nas, 'Uyun al-athar, II, 73. 
195 Al-Waqidi, Maghazi (Jones MS), pp. 480ff. [Jones ed., II, 535ff.]. 
196 Al-Bukhari, Sabih, V, 54, 55f.; al-Tabari, Ta'rikh, I, 1517ff.; Ibn Sayyid 

al-Nas, 'Uyun al-athar, II, 387ff. 
197 Al-Waqidi, Maghazi (Jones MS), p. 508 [Jones ed., II, 565]; Ibn Sayyid 

al-Nas, 'Uyun al-athar, II, 105f. 
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(also the number of camels for sacrifice);198 the Prophet 
determines the line of march, the Muslims stop at al-Hu-
daybiya; the Prophet indicates a desire for conciliation with 
Quraysh; reaction of Quraysh and their point of view; the 
Khuza'a, on friendly terms with the Muslims, convey the 
tatter's position to Quraysh;199 movement of messengers 
between the two parties, most of them from the Quraysh 
side, and their impressions of the Muslims; the Prophet 
speaks in a diplomatic tone, stresses his good intentions, 
and proposes a truce; Suhayl ibn 'Amr finally arrives to 
negotiate for Quraysh, argument over certain words, the 
final text of the pact and names of the witnesses; other de-
tails, including the reluctance of some of the Companions 
to slaughter the sacrificial animals at al-Hudaybiya; al-Zuh-
ri's comment on the importance and consequences of the 
truce of al-Hudaybiya.200 

17. Conquest of Khaybar—circumstances and date of the 
conquest; the agreement with Khaybar and its legal impli-
cations; viewpoint of Abu Bakr and 'Umar on this;201 an 
incident on the way to Khaybar;202 disposal of Fadak; ex-
pedition of Mu'ta;203 some minor expeditions.204 

198 Ibn Hisham, III, 322 [Wiistenfeld ed., I, ii, 740]; al-Tabari, Ta'rikh, I, 
1529; Ibn Sayyid al-Nas, XJyiin al-athar, II, 113. 

199 Ibn Hisham, III, 324f. [Wiistenfeld ed., I, ii, 742f.]; al-Waqidi, Ma-
ghdzi (Jones MS), pp. 519, 529f. [Jones ed., II, 576f., 586£f.]; al-Tabari, 
Ta'rikh, I, 1531, 1537; Ibn Sayyid al-Nas, 'Uyun al-athar, II, 115. 

200 Ibn Hisham, I, ii, 740ff., 747ff.; al-Waqidi, Maghdzi (Jones MS), pp. 
565ff., 572f. [Jones ed., II, 621ff., 631ff.]; al-Tabari, Ta'rikh, I, 1549f.; Ibn 
Sayyid al-Nas, 'Uyun al-athar, II, I15ff., 121, 122. 

201 Ibn Hisham, I, ii, 779; al-Waqidx, Maghazi (Jones MS), pp. 634, 657 
[Jones ed., II, 695, 696, 697, 715]; al-Baladhuri, Futiih d-buldan, p. 26; Ibn 
Sayyid al-Nas, 'Uyun al-athar, II, 136, 137. 

202 Al-Tabari, Ta'rikh, I, 1575. 
203 Ibn Hisham, IV, 25 [Wiistenfeld ed., I, ii, 766f.]; al-Baladhuri, Futiih 

al-buldan, p. 59; Ibn Sayyid al-Nas, 'Uyun al-athar, II, 138. 
204 Raid of al-Qadlya, al-Waqidi, Maghdzi (Jones MS), pp. 670ff. (al-Zuhri 

in a collective isnad) [Jones ed., II, 731]; raid of Ibn Abl l-'Awja' al-Sulaml, 
ibid., p. 680 [Jones ed., II, 741]—Both of these expeditions occurred in A.H. 
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18. Conquest of Mecca—al-Zuhrl explains the role of 
Khuza'a as allies and spies for the Prophet,205 their formal 
alliance with him after al-Hudaybiya, and how the aggres-
sion of Bakr and its ally Quraysh against Khuza'a created 
the immediate cause for the campaign;206 Abu Sufyan goes 
to Medina to negotiate, but fails; the Prophet's preparations 
for the campaign;207 he leaves a deputy in Medina and leads 
the campaign himself; date of the campaign, numbers in the 
army, and the Prophet's triumphant entry into Mecca;208 

the rubbing out of the images found inside the Ka'ba, and 
other decisions; the length of time the Muslims stayed in 
Mecca after the conquest.209 

19. Subsequent campaigns—the expedition against Ha-
wazin; Muslim confidence in their great numbers; story of 
Dhat Anwat;210 confusion of the Muslims during the battle, 
the Prophet's appeal to the Ansar and their response, critical 
period in the fighting and the Prophet's prayer, the vic-
tory;211 division of the spoils and release of the captives;212 

the expedition against Tabuk—al-Zuhri in a collective is-
nad;2U individual details;214 the jizya imposed on Ayla, 
Adhruh, Adhri'at,215 Tabala, and Jurash;216 the expedition 

7; a raid on Dhat al-Atlah in A.H. 8, Ibn Sayyid al-Nas, Vyun al-athar, II, 
152; [al-Waqidi, Maghazl, Jones ed., II, 752f.]. 

205 Ibn Hisham, I, ii, 747ff. 
206 Al-Tabari, Ta'rikh, I, 1620; Ibn Sayyid al-Nas, Vyiin al-athar, II, 120. 
207 Al-Waqidl, Maghazl (Jones MS), p. 731 [Jones ed., II, 795f.]. 
208 Ibn Hisham, I, ii, 810; al-Bukhari, Sahih, V, 90; al-Waqidl, Maghazi 

(Jones MS), p. 818 [Jones ed., II, 889], giving the date of the conquest; al-
Tabari, Ta'rikh, I, 1628. 

209 Al-Waqidi, Maghazi (Jones MS), pp. 766, 795 [Jones ed., II, 834, 864, 
865], also see pp. 765ff. [II, 834]; al-Tabari, Ta'rikh, I, 1565f. 

210 Ibn Hisham, I, ii, 844; al-Waqidl, Maghazi (Jones MS), pp. 818, 819 
[Jones ed., II, 890f.]; Ibn Sayyid al-Nas, 'Uyun al-athar, II, 191f. 

211 Al-Waqidl, Maghazi (Jones MS), pp. 826ff. [Jones ed., II, 898ff.]; al-
Tabari, Ta'rikh, 1661, 1662; Ibn Sayyid al-Nas, Uyiin al-athar, I, 191. 

212 Al-Waqidl, Maghazi (Jones MS), pp. 869f. [Jones ed., II, 945ff.]. 
213 Al-Tabari, Ta'rikh, I, 1692. Cf. also al-Bukhari, Sahih, IV, 99fF., 104f. 
214 Ibn Hisham, I, ii, 798; Ibn Sayyid al-Nas, Vyun al-athar, II, 218. 
215 Al-Baladhuri, Futuh al-buldan, p. 68. 
216 Ibid., p. 59. 
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against Dumat al-Jandal, and imposition of the jizya upon 
it.217 

20. Letters and embassies—the visit of Kinda's delega-
tion;218 the Prophet sends a letter to Heraclius with Dihya 
al-Kalbi, details on the subject; al-Zuhri also tells a story 
about Heraclius' vision and his secret inclination towards 
Islam, and quotes a bishop to confirm this;219 the Prophet 
sends a letter to Chosroes, who tears it up, the Prophet's 
comment upon hearing the news;220 Chosroes asks Badhan, 
governor of Yemen, to go to the Prophet and demand that 
he either repent or be killed; Badhan exchanges letters with 
the Prophet, and the correspondence ends with Badhan and 
the abna (Persians)i accepting Islam when the Prophet's 
prediction concerning the end of Chosroes is fulfilled.221 

21. Incidents of unrest—Khalid ibn al-Walld sent against 
Banu 1-Harith in Najran and their acceptance of Islam;222 

Tamlm refuses to pay the alms tax (sadaqa), they are sub-
dued by the Muslims and their delegation comes to Me-
dina.223 

22. Personal details concerning the Prophet—references 
to his marriages,224 and clarification of some of his names.225 

23. Reference to the Farewell Pilgrimage (.Hijjat al-wada) 
and some information concerning it;226 perparations for the 
campaign of Usama ibn Zayd.227 

217 Ibid., p. 63. 
218 Al-Tabari, Ta'rikh, I, 1739. 
219 Al-Bukhari, Sabih, IV, 2ff.; al-Tabari, Ta'rikh, I, 1565f. 
220 Al-Tabari, Ta'rikh, I, 1572. 
) [On the alma, see p. 123, n. b below.] 
221 Ibn Hisham, I, 71f. [Wiistenfeld ed., I, i, 46f.]. 
222 Ibn Sayyid al-Nas, 'Uyim al-athar, II, 244f. 
223 Al-Waqidl, Maghazi (Jones Ms), pp. 896ff. [Jones ed., Ill, 973ff.]. 
224 Al-Bukhari, Sabih, V, 17; al-Tabari, Ta'rikh, I, 1776. 
225 Al-Tabari, Ta'rikh, I, 1788. See also al-Bukhari, Sahih, IV, 162; Ibn 

Sayyid al-Nas, Vyiin al-athar, I, 30. 
226 Al-Waqidl, Magkazi (Jones Ms), pp. 1001, 1005f. [Jones ed., Ill, 1092, 

1097f.]. 
227Ibid., p. 1025 [Jones ed., Ill, 1118], 
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24. Last illness of the Prophet—he senses that the end is 
near, alludes to this in an address from the minbar, and 
urges the dispatch of Usama's campaign; al-'Abbas asks 'All 
ibn Abi Talib to accompany him to ask the Prophet who 
should succeed him, but 'All declines; other details;228 the 
Prophet observes the Muslims in the mosque during his last 
days on earth, and delegates Abu Bakr to lead them in 
prayer;229 the last charge of the Prophet and his passage 
into eternity, date and Muhammad's age;230 impact of his 
death; burial of the Glorious Prophet's mortal remains.231 

It is clear from this summary review that al-Zuhri provided 
the sira with its first distinct framework and clearly sketched 
out the lines it would follow, leaving his successors to fill out 
this framework in detail only. His plan for the Maghazi (or 
Sira) begins with some materials relevant to the life of the 
Prophet before his mission began, and within this probably 
gave his genealogy.232 After referring to some of the signs of 
the impending prophethood, he passes on to the beginning 
of Qur'anic revelation. He then discusses the period of Mu­
hammad's prophetic career, recounting some of the most im­
portant aspects of the Meccan period, the Hijra, the raids and 
expeditions, such other activities as the embassies and dele­
gations, and finally the Prophet's illness and death. 

It appears that al-Zuhri generally observed the chronologi­
cal sequence of events. He gives some dates, such as the date 
of the Hijra, possibly the dates for the battles of Badr, Uhud, 
and the Ditch (since his accounts for these appear under col­
lective isnads), and the dates for such expeditions as Qararat 

228 [Ibn Hisham, I, ii, 1000, 1006, 1007, 1008, IOlOf.]; al-Bukhari, SaM), 
IV, 45; V, 137, 139f., 140f.; al-Tabari, Tarikh, I, 1800, 1809, 1810; Ibn 
Sayyid al-Nas, 'Uyiin al-athar, II, 336f. 

229 Ibn Hisham, I, ii, 1008ff.; al-Tabari, Ta'fikh, I, 1813. 
2,0 Al-Bukhari, Al-Ta'rikb al-kabir,I, i, 8; al-Tabari, Ta'rikh, I, 1814, 1834f. 
231 Ibn Hisham, IV, 305f. [Wiistenfeld ed., I, ii, 1012f.j; al-Bukhari, Sabih, 

IV, 163; al-Tabari, Tarikh, I, 1831. 
232 See al-Tabari, Ta'rikh, I, 1116; also pp. 113-14 below. 
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al-Kudr, Banu Sulaym, Qaynuqa', Banu l-Nadlr, and Khay-
bar, the conquest of Mecca, the arrival of the delegation of 
Kinda, and the death of the Prophet.233 This concern for 
providing dates served to stabilize al-Zuhri's framework for 
the sir a. 

Al-Zuhri's approach is basically that of a scholar of ha-
dith.234 His concern was to acquire 'ilm, or hadith materials, 
of which historical hadith were a part. 'Ilm, in his view, fills 
social and spiritual needs, in addition to being an act of faith.235 

Consequently, the one who knows it gains nobility and lofty 
social status.236 

Al-Zuhri's method of verifying hadith materials and other 
accounts relies on the isnad.237 His attitude towards the isnad 
is that of a committed hadith scholar of his day: he sometimes 
considers it sufficient to cite the account of one of the tabi'un, 
and allows greater leeway with historical hadiths. But al-Zuhri 
did make an important contribution when he adopted the col-
lective isnad, collecting numerous accounts into a smooth, un-
interrupted story preceded by a list of the authorities from 
whom the original accounts were taken. In this way he took 
an important step towards continuous historical narrative.238 

Moreover, al-Zuhri makes many references to Qur'anic verses 
pertaining to the narratives he presents.239 Indeed, the ac-

233 See above, pp. 103-lOff. 
234 Al-Dhahabl/Fischer, p. 431; Ibn Kathir, Al-Bidaya wa-l-nihaya, IX, 343. 
235 Al-Dhahabi (Tarajim, p. 72) quotes al-Zuhri as saying, "Security lies in 

adherence to the stmna." Cf. Ibn Hisham, I, 79 [Wiistenfeld ed., I, i, 51]; 
also al-Dhahabl, Tarajim, p. 78, where al-Zuhri says, 'There is no way to 
serve God more virtuously than through learning ('ilm)," 

236 There is a saying attributed to him and to 'Urwa ibn al-Zubayr, "Learn 
'ilrn, and through it become the masters of your people"; al-Bukhari, Al-
Ta'rikh al-kabir, I, i, 32; al-Dhahabl, Tarajim, p. 45. 

237 'Amr ibn Dinar said, "I never saw anyone more precise in transmitting 
hadith than al-Zuhri"; al-Dhahabl/Fischer, p. 431. 

238 See al-Tabari, Ta'rikh, I, 1517; Ibn Sayyid al-Nas, 'Uyun al-athar, II, 
96. 

239 See al-Waqidl, Maghazi (Jones MS), pp. 156f., 562ff. [Jones ed., I, 177; 
II, 621ff.]; Ibn Sayyid al-Nas, 'Uyun al-athar, II, 96ff., 121. 
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counts of al-Waqidi quoted from al-ZuhrI clearly demonstrate 
that the study of the Qur'an, which is full of references to 
Muslim affairs in Medina, was another factor in the emer­
gence of historical studies.240 

In al-Zuhrfs accounts we can see activities attributed to di­
vine inspiration, and also activities based on human initiative, 
particularly in the details of military campaigns.241 The con­
cept of divine foreordainment had not yet become the domi­
nant one, and in fact, al-Zuhri's judgment on the truce of al-
Hudaybiya implies endorsement of an action which in its own 
time did not meet with the approval it deserved.242 

It can be said that al-Zuhri's accounts generally provide re­
alistic, balanced information on the events they describe, and 
do so in a style which can be described as candid, unaffected, 
and concise.243 In them there are few of the attempts to glo­
rify or exaggerate which are so common among historians of 
later times. We do sense, however, that the first indications of 
this tendency are already present in his work.244 But on the 
whole, al-Zuhri's historical data is drawn from hadlth\ popular 
qisas tales he regarded as material for entertainment and en­
joyment.245 

It appears that other materials did seep into his historical 
akhb&r, but only to a limited extent. The presence of these 
materials indicates the beginnings of developments which only 
emerged after the age of al-Zuhri. There is something of a 

240 See al-Waqidi, Maghazi (Jones MS), pp. 562ff., 572f. [Jones ed., II, 
621ff., 631ff.]; Ibn Sayyid al-Nas, "Uyiin al-athar, I, 222. 

241Al-Waqidi, Maghazi (Jones MS), pp. 421f. [Jones ed., II, 486f.]; al-
Tabari, Ta'rikh, I, 1473. 

242 Al-Tabari, Ta'rikh, I, 1594. 
243 See Ibn Hisham, I, ii, 844, on Dhat Anwat. 
244 See al-Tabari, Ta'rikh, I, 1154, 1360, 1485. 
245 Al-Dhahabi, Tarajim, p. 73, where the author says, "Al-Zuhri used to 

relate hadiths and then say, Tell me your poetry and stories, for the ear is 
weary, but the soul is still eager.' " See also p. 74; and Ibn Kathir, Al-Bidaya 
wa-l-nihiiya, IX, 343. 
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trace of popular qisas lore in certain places, such as his account 
of Heraclius' view of the new faith,246 the warning heard by 
Chosroes,247 the story of the soothsayer warned by Satan,248 

and details on what happened to Suraqa.249 Similarly, al-Zuhrfs 
interest in akhbar about past prophets and in the ahl al-kitdb250 

left a faint echo of the Isrd'iliydt in his writing, and in such 
passages Ka'b al-Ahbar figures as a source.251 He also quotes 
fragments of verse from time to time in his akhbar,252 and this 
is to be expected when we recall that people were generally 
veiy fond of poetry, which was a fundamental element of cul-
ture. Al-Zuhri himself was extremely fond of poetry253 and 
renowned for his wide knowledge of it;254 but there is only a 
limited amount of it in his Maghazi, and his citation of it 
provides no indication of any trace of the style of the ayydm 
tales. 

The historical studies of al-Zuhri were not limited to the 
maghazi, but included genealogy and early Islamic history as 
well. He was well known for his knowledge of genealogy 255 

Khalid al-Qasri asked him to set Arab genealogy down in 
writing, so he began with the genealogies of Mudar, but never 

246 Al-Tabari, Ta'rikh, I, 1565f. 
247 Ibid., I, 1014. 
248 Ibid., I, 1145. 
249 Ibn Hisham, I, i, 331f. 
250 Ibn al-jawzl, Sajwat al-safwa, II, 88: "When he related accounts about 

the prophets and the ahl al-kitab, you said he excelled in nothing but 
that. . . ." Cf. also Abu Nu'aym, Hilyat al-awliya, III, 362; Ibn Kathlr, Al-
Bidaya wa-l-nihaya, IX, 342. 

251 See al-Tabari, Ta'rikh, I, 112, 200f., 293. It seems, however, that such 
akhbar as these were not part of al-Zuhrfs Maghazi. 

252 See al-Waqidl, Maghazi (Cairo), p. 94, and the Jones MS, pp. 569ff. 
[Jones ed., II, 586f.]; al-Tabari, Ta'rikh, I, 1652f. 

253 Al-DhahabI, Tarajim, p. 73; Ibn Kathlr, Al-Bidaya wa-l-nihaya, IX, 343. 
254 See Aghani, IV, 49. 
255 Abu Nu'aym, Hilyat al-awliya, III, 361; al-Dhahabl/Fischer, p. 343. 

Also see Ibn Hisham, I, 7f. [Wustenfeld ed., I, i, 5]; Ibn al-Jawzi, Sajwat al-
safwa, II, 78, saying, "When he related accounts about the bedouins and 
genealogies, you said he excelled in nothing but that." 
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finished the work.256 Mus'ab al-Zubayrl cites him in his book 
Nasab Quraysh,257 and this corroborates Qurra ibn Abd al-
Rahman's statement that he wrote a book on the genealogy 
of his people (i.e., Quraysh).258 

Al-Zuhri also dealt with the period of the Rashidun caliphs, 
for the great events which played a fundamental role in the 
development of the urnma, as also in Medinan tradition, were 
still live issues when al-ZuhrT studied them. He provides de-
tailed information on the election of Abu Bakr and explains 
the effect the election had.259 He then gives Abu Baler's first 
address, as well as an idea of his conduct as caliph.260 After 
this he presents 'All's view of the election, then his later oath 
of allegiance, and the request of Fatima to inherit Fadak.261 

Of the events associated with the era of 'Umar ibn al-Khat-
tab, he deals in detail with the establishment of the diwan (i.e., 
of the army), its organization and the stipends paid,262 and 
most probably with the shura.263 He also gives 'Ulnar's age 
and some of his speeches.264 He then discusses the caliphate 
of 'Uthman in detail. First he takes up the collection of the 
Qur'an,265 and then presents a minutely detailed discussion 
of the fitna—his account of this is important because it rep-
resents the Medinan point of view on the subject. In al-Zuh-
rFs account, 'Uthman appears as a ruler popular for the first 

256 Aghani, XIX, 59. 
257 Nasab Quraysh, p. 3. 
258 Al-DhahabI, Tarajim, p. 68, where Qurra ibn 'Abd al-Rahman is quoted 

as saying, "Al-Zuhri had no book other than a book on the genealogy of his 
people." [This statement is also cited in Abu Zur'a, Ta'rikh, I, 410.] 

259 Al-Tabari, Ta'rikh, I, 1820ff.; Ibn Hisham, I, ii, 673fF. On the outburst 
of emotion arising from the death of the Prophet, see al-Tabari, Ta'rikh, I, 
1816f. 

260 Ibid., I, 1828f., 2142f. 
261 Ibid., I, 1825ff., and on the death of Abu Bakr, I, 2128. 
262 Al-Baladhuri, Futuh al-bulddn, pp. 450ff., 455. 
263 See al-Baladhurl, Ansab al-asbrif, V, 21 ['Abbas ed., IV, i, 507], 
264 Al-Tabari, Ta'rikh, I, 2731, 2757f.; also see I, 2798. 
265 Ibn al-Nadlm, Fihrist, p. 24. 
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six years of his caliphate, after which complaints began to ap-
pear and accumulate.266 Al-Zuhrf gives a detailed account of 
the criticisms directed against 'Uthman,267 his efforts to re-
spond to them,268 the pernicious influence of Marwan ibn al-
Hakam,269 the dangerous divisions within Medina,270 the 
gathering clouds, the storm, and the end of 'Uthman,271 the 
reaction among the major personalities in Medina, and finally 
the election of 'All.272 He then presents the attitude of Talha 
and al-Zubayr towards the new caliph, their consultations with 
'A'isha, the departure of the three for Basra, their negotia-
tions with 'All prior to the fighting, and finally the Battle of 
the Camel.273 After this he takes up the conflict between 'All 
and Mu'awiya, the battle of Siffin, the arbitration between 
the two contenders, and Mu'awiya's occupation of Egypt274 

Finally, he reports on al-Hasan's relations with the Kufans and 
his negotiations with Mu'awiya, and ends with the abdication 
of al-Hasan.275 

Al-Zuhri apparendy did not deal with the Umayyad period. 
It is reported, however, that al-Walld ibn 'Abd al-Malik asked 
him about the lifespans of the Umayyad caliphs,276 and simi-
larly, that he wrote down for his grandfather the ages of these 
caliphs and the period each of them ruled 277 Al-Tabari also 

266 Al-Baladhuri, Futiih al-buldan, p. 462; idem, Ansdb al-ashrdf, V, 25 
['Abbas ed., IV, i, 512],' 

267 Al-Baladhuri, Ansdb al-ashrdf, V, 26, 27, 38, 39, 88f. ['Abbas ed., IV, 
i, 512ff., 526, 527, 579ff.]. 

268 Ibid., V, 26, 27f., 89 ['Abbas ed., IV, i, 512ff., 581], 
269Ibid., V, 62, 67ff. ['Abbas ed., IV, i, 551, 556ff.]. 
270 Ibid., V, 26, 88ff. ['Abbas ed., IV, i, 513, 579ff.]. 
271 Ibid., V, 62, 67ff., 85, 91, 97 ['Abbas ed., IV, i, 551, 556ff, 577, 583, 

590]; al-Tabari, Ta'rikh, I, 2871; II, 305ff. 
272 Al-Baladhuri, Ansdb al-ashrdf V, 69ff., 91f. ['Abbas ed., IV, i, 559f., 

583f.]. 
273 Al-Tabarl, Ta'rikh, I, 3069, 3102f., 3185ff. 
274 Ibid., I, 3241f., 3341ff., 3390ff. 
275 Ibid., II, 1, 5ff. 
276 Ibid., II, 149. 
277 Ibid., II, 428. 
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quotes al-ZuhrI—and this is his last citation from him—on 
the duration of the caliphate of al-Walid ibn cAbd al-Malik.278 

This part of al-ZuhrFs studies demonstrates that interest in 
the experiences of the umma was another factor of importance 
in the rise of historical writing. The principle of ijma\ the 
emergence of political factions and the controversy among them 
over events of the past (especially the fitna), the question of 
whether succession to the caliphate should be elective or he­
reditary, problems of administrative organization (especially 
of taxation),279 and the Aiwan—all these issues called for clar­
ification through historical study. Al-Zuhri offers us the Medi-
nan version of events, and these accounts generally show the 
umma to be in the right. We understand from him, for ex­
ample, that the Prophet did not nominate anyone to succeed 
him in leadership of the Islamic community, which decided 
for the principle of elective, not hereditary succession. The 
umma elected Abu Bakr, and even cAli, at first unhappy with 
the outcome, willingly pledged homage to him later on. Al-
Zuhri presents Abu Bakr and cUmar to us as paragons of 
righteousness. 

The problem of the fitna, however, is enormously compli­
cated, and the complaints against cUthman were to some ex­
tent justified by his actions. But al-Zuhri does not portray him 
in the same dark colors that other accounts do. It is clear from 
his reports that Medina was internally divided during the fitna. 
cAli ibn Abi Talib at first adopted the attitude of an advisor, 
then withdrew and stood aside during the storm, though he 
was shocked when it ended with the murder of cUthman. 
cAli was then elected as caliph because his status and qualifi­
cations made him the obvious candidate. In discussing the 
rebellion of Talha and al-Zubayr, the accounts offered by al-
Zuhri side with cAli and cast a slight shadow on the revolu-

27gIbid., II, 1269. 
279 See al-Baladhuri, Futtih cd-buldm, pp. 19f., 59, 68, 80, 384. 



The Historical School of Medina 117 

tionaries. In the confict between 'All and Mu'awiya, 'All's 
case appears to be the just one, although Mu'awiya is made 
to appear more astute. Al-ZuhrI nevertheless reports that al-
Hasan renounced the caliphate in favor of Mu'awiya, and with 
this terminates the story. These observations demonstrate that 
al-Zuhri was not influenced by political partisanship, and tried 
to offer a portrayal of the events as they were viewed in Me­
dina. Here a few words must be said concerning al-Zuhri's 
relations with the Umayyads.280 

Al-Ya'qubi states that during the conflict with Ibn al-Zu-
bayr 'Abd al-Malik ibn Marwan tried to prevent the Syrians 
from going on the pilgrimage, and in order to support his 
position attributed to al-Zuhri a hadith endorsing pilgrimage 
to the al-Aqsa mosque in Jerusalem.281 The hadith is dubious 
in itself, and likewise, al-Zuhri was only a young man at the 
time (ca. A.H. 72-73) and not famous as he was later. The 
sources report that al-Zuhri journeyed to Damascus and by 
coincidence happened to meet 'Abd al-Malik, who had a per­
sonal legal problem. The caliph did not know him, but was 
impressed by his learning and acumen during their encounter, 
and so rewarded him by paying his debts and presenting him 
with a gift. He then advised him to continue his studies, and 
with that al-ZuhrI returned to Medina.282 This account shows 
that he was still a young scholar at the time, and similarly, 
one would hardly expect the caliph to advise him, during the 
conflict with Ibn al-Zubayr, to return to Medina if he was as 
important as al-Ya'qubfs account makes him out to have been. 

280 See al-Dhahabi, Tarajim, p. 72. Goldziher1S remarks on this in Muham-
medanische Studien, II, 35f., 37f., 40[= Muslim Studies, II, 44f., 46f., 48f.] 
are not very critical. 

281 Al-Ya'qubi, Tarikh, II, 311. 
282 Ibn Qutayba, Ma'arif, p. 239 ['Ukasha ed., p. 472]; al-Dhahabi, Ta­

rajim, p. 70; Ibn Kathir, Al-Bidaya wa-l-nihaya, IX, 340f., adding that 'Abd 
al-Malik granted al-ZuhrI a stipend (rdtib) in accordance with the latter's 
request. See also Ibn Sa'd, VII, ii, 157; Ibn Qutayba, Ma'drif, p. 228 ['Uka-
sha ed., p. 447]. 



100 The Rise <f Historical Writing Among the Arabs 

And on the other hand, there is an account reported from al-
Zuhri which indicates that he was critical of 'Abd al-Malik 
during the period of the struggle with Ibn al-Zubayr.283 We 
must accordingly reject the account of al-Ya'qubl and instead 
accept al-Zuhri's own report in which he says, "I came to 
Damascus during the rebellion of Ibn al-Ash'ath,"284 about 
A.H. 80, i.e., seven or eight years after the revolution of Ibn 
al-Zubayr.k 

Though he did make occasional and intermittent visits to 
the Umayyad court, al-Zuhri's studies probably kept him in 
Medina most of the time. Later he moved to Adama, in south-
ern Palestine near the border of the Hijaz, and from there 
made trips to the Hijaz and to Damascus (the Umayyad court) 
"for academic purposes" (li-'ilmihi).2S5 'Umar ibn 'Abd al-
'Azlz held him in high regard,286 and it is most likely that he 
came to take up residence in Damascus in the days of Yazid 
ibn 'Abd al-Malik and Hisham. The former appointed him as 
a qadi, and he was on very good terms with Hisham, who 
made him his son's tutor, indicating the increasing authority 
of the Islamic perspective. Hisham also asked him to dictate 
hadith for the benefit of his sons,287 and likewise later told 

283 Al-Baladhuri, Ansab al-ashraf, XI, 163. 
284 Al-Bukhari, Al-Ta'rikh al-kabir, IV, 93. [Cf. also Abu Zur a, Ta'rikh, 

I, 408, 583f.] 
k [On this famous controversy, in which Duri's position is now generally 

accepted, see Horovitz, "Biographies," II, 35ff.; Johann Fuck, "Die Rolle des 
Traditionalismus im Islam," ZDMG, XCIII (1939), pp. 23f.; Muhammad 
'Ajjaj al-Khatlb, Al-Sunna qabla l-tadmn (Cairo, 1963), pp. 501ff.; Werner 
Caskel, Der Febendom und die Wallfahrt nach Jerusalem (Koln and Opladen, 
1963), pp. 25f.; S.D.F. Goitein, "The Sanctity of Jerusalem and Palestine in 
Early Islam," in his Studies in Islamic History and Institutions (Leiden, 1968), 
pp. 135fF.; M. J. Kister, " 'You Shall Only Set Out for Three Mosques': a 
Study of an Early Tradition," Le Museon, LXXXII (1969), pp. 173ff.; Azmi, 
Studies, pp. 289ff.] 

285 Ibn al-jawzl, Sajwat al-sajwa, II, 79; al-Dhahabl, Tarajim, p. 70; Ibn 
Kathir, Al-Bidaya wa-l-nihaya, IX, 34If. 

286 Ibn al-jawzl, Safivat al-safwa, II, 78. See also Ibn 'Abd al-Hakam, Fu-
tuh Misr, p. 104. 

287 Al-Dhahabl, Tarajim, pp. 70f.; Ibn Kathir, Al-Bidaya wa-l-nihaya, IX, 
342. 
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two secretaries to accompany him, attend his classes, and write 
down his hadith materials, which they did for the period of a 
year.288 This probably explains the presence of so many of his 
works in the library of the Umayyad court. However, from a 
fierce argument which transpired between him and Hisham, 
we can see that al- Zuhri had not fallen under the influence of 
the Umayyads. Hisham asked him who was meant in the 
Qur'anic verse, "whichever of them takes upon himself the 
greater part of it."1 and al-Zuhri replied, "It was tAbd Allah 
ibn Ubayy." "You lie!" Hisham cried, "It was 'All!" Al-Zuhri 
replied, "I lie?! May you have no father! By God, even if a 
herald were to cry out from heaven that God had permitted 
lying, still I would not lie."289 Such was al-Zuhri the scholar. 

Al-Zuhri's contribution to historical studies was not limited 
to his view of history and his study of early Islamic history. 
He also rendered a great service to historical writing by set­
ting his hadith materials down in writing. In his house, his 
books surrounded him on every side.290 The Umayyad library 
contained numerous loads of "books" (dafatir) of his learning 
written for Hisham ibn tAbd al-Malik.291 There is a statement 
attributed to him, "We disliked writing (al-kitab) until the 
authorities (al-umara) compelled us to do so; then I decided 
not to prevent any Muslim from doing likewise,"292 but this 
appears to echo the views of hadith scholars of later times. 

288 Abu Nu'aym, Hilyat al-awltya, III, 361. 
1 [I.e., the greater responsibility for the slandering of 'A'isha, referred to 

in Surat al-Niir (XXIV), 11.] 
289 AJ-Dhahabi, Tamjim, p. 72. 
290 Al-Yafi'I, Mir at cd-janan, I, 261; [also al-FasawI, Kitab al-ma'rifa wa-

l-ta'rikh, edited by Akram Diya' al-'Umari (Baghdad, 1974), I, 620ff.]. 
291 Abii Nu'aym, Hilyat al-awliya, III, 361, 363; al-Dhahabl, Tamjim, p. 

72; Ibn Kathir, Al-Bidaya wa-l-nihaya, IX, 344. 
292 Al-Dhahabi, Tarapm, p. 69; Ibn Kathir,Al-Bidaya wa-l-nihaya, IX, 341. 

In Abu Nu'aym (Hilyat al-awliya, III, 363) we read, "We had no desire to 
write down anything from al-Zuhri, until Hisham compelled al-Zuhri to do 
so. He then wrote for Hisham's sons, and then the people began to write 
down hadith/''' Al-Zuhri also said, "We disliked writing (al-kutub) until the 
authorities (al-sultdn) compelled us to do so; then we did not want to prevent 
other people from doing likewise." 
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The truth of the matter is that al-Zuhri had been accustomed 
to writing down his hadith materials and other accounts ever 
since his days as a student.293 The following report, which is 
contemporary, regards his habit of setting his learning down 
in writing as a matter of course. According to al-Layth, "I 
said to Ibn Shihab, Ό Abu Bakr, if only you would make 
these books available to the people, record them, and thus free 
yourself [for other work].' He replied, 'No one has spread this 
learning as I have, or offered it as I have.' "294 Al-Zuhn granted 
writing a certain value when he said, "There is no difference, 
God willing, between reading a scholar's book and hearing 
him."295 cUbayd Allah ibn TJmar reported, "I used to see al-
Zuhri give [someone] a book which he neither recited [to the 
students] nor had recited to him [by the students]; someone 
would say, 'May we transmit this on your authority?' and he 
would reply, 'Yes,' "296 Malik ibn Anas was fully aware of al-
Zuhrfs role when he said, "Ibn Shihab was the first to set 
'ilm down in writing."297 Such writing cleared the path for 
others to follow. 

It is cle-.r from the above that al-Zuhri established the out­
lines and structure for writing the biography of Muhammad, 
and played an important role in stabilizing the hadiths and 
accounts of Medina. If TJrwa ibn al-Zubayr was the forerun­
ner of historical writing, then it was al-Zuhri who founded 

293 See pp. 96-97 above. 
294 Al-DhahabI, Tamjim, pp. 72ff. 
295 Ibn Kathir, Al-BidAya wa-l-nibaya, IX, 344 [and much earlier, Abfl Zur'a, 

Ta'rikh, I, 415. This sentence could also be interpreted as meaning, 'There 
is no difference, God willing, between reading a scholar's book out loud to 
him (al-qiraa) and hearing him recite it himself (Olsatmc)." On this sense 
of the terms, which result in important differences for the interpretation of 
the passage, see G4S, I, 58f.] 

296Al-DhahabI, Tarajim, pp. 69, 70. [Cf. al-Khatlb al-Baghdadl, Ta'rikh 
Baghdad, I, 266. On this practice, the munawala, see GAS, I, 59; Abbott, 
Studies, II, 35; Azmi, Studies, p. 286, with further references.] 

297 Ibn al-jawzl, Safivat al-sajwa, II, 78; Abu Nu'aym, Hilyat cd-awliya, 
III, 260. 
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the historical school of Medina. We can say with certainty that 
the foundations for the maghUzi were laid by his serious stud­
ies, and were not engendered by the qisas tales of storytellers 
like Wahb ibn Munabbih, as some have believed. His stu­
dents, such as Musa ibn tUqba and Ibn Ishaq, traveled in the 
path he had laid out; and although Ibn Ishaq, at the expense 
of historical balance, took much of his material from popular 
qisas lore and the Isra Iliyat, the accounts of al-Zuhri remained 
the fundamental core of his Sira. 

It is also clear from the studies of al- Zuhri that interest in 
the experiences of the umma was a further motive for histor­
ical study. And here we feel that the simple basic steps taken 
by tUrwa were completed and brought to fruition at the hands 
of al-Zuhri. 

Finally, his writing down of his learning helped to establish 
historical studies on a firm foundation, and served to preserve 
the earliest historical sources. 



CHAPTER THREE 

The Beginnings of Historical Folklore: 

Wahb ibn Munabbih 

The study of Wahb ibn Munabbih takes us beyond the scope 
of an investigation of historical writing among the Arabs." But 
as some researchers in the past have placed him within these 
domains,1 and some have stressed his importance in the sira,2 

we are compelled to examine him here in order to show, in 
no uncertain terms, that he is not to be regarded as one of 
the maghazi authors, and that his field and his influence lie 
within the domain of qisas and the Isra UiyAt. 

Wahb ibn Munabbih was born in Yemen in Dhimar, two 
days' journey from San'a'. There is disagreement on the dates 
of his birth and death. The sources place his death variously 
between A.H. 110 and 114, but it seems that the latter date is 
more likely, as his nephew 'Abd al-Samad ibn Ma'qil con­
firms that he died on 11 Muharram 114/732.3 Al-DhahabI 
states that he was born in the caliphate on cUthman, and this 
causes us to view favorably the account reporting that he died 
at the age of eighty, which would place his birthdate in 34/ 
654-55.4 

* [Wahb ibn Munabbih has more recently been studied in a number of 
important contributions by Raif Georges Khoury. See his "Der Heidelberger 
Papyrus des Wahb b. Munabbih," ZDMG, Supp. I.xvii (1969), pp. 557ff.; 
"Un Ecrit inedit attribue a Wahb b. Munabbih: la RisAlafi stmt an-nabi" Al-
Mashrig, LXIV (1970), pp. 591fF.; and particularly his Wahb b. Munabbih, 
with extensive bibliography; also GAS, I, 305fF.] 

1 Horovitz, ["Biographies," I, 553ff. = ] Al-Maghazi al-Hlii, pp. 27ff. 
2 EP,  IV, 441 (G. Levi DeUa Vida). 
3 See al-Bukharl, Al-Ta'rikh al-kabir, IV, ii, 164; Ibn Qutayba, Ma'Anf, p. 

233 ['Ukasha ed., p. 459]; Yaqiit, Mu'jam al-udaba, VII, 232; al-Yafu, 
Mir'Ht al-janan, I, 250; al-Dhahabi/Fischer, p. 442. 

4 Ibn Hajar, Tahdhib al-tabdhib, XI, 168. 
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Wahb was one of the abm';b his father Munabbih, from 
Herat in Khurasan, had been sent to Yemen during the reign 
of Chosroes Anushirvan and converted to Islam in the lifetime 
of the Prophet. Wahb grew up in Yemen and was known for 
his ascetic tendencies. As al-Dhahabi says, "Wahb remained 
forty years without cursing any living thing, and twenty years 
without performing any ablution between the evening prayer 
and the morning prayer the next day."5 The sources very fre­
quently extol him for his piety and asceticism. He was at first 
a Qadarite, but then abandoned this doctrine, so it is said, 
after reading the books of past prophets. There is, however, 
one reference to his continued adherence to anti-predestinar-
ian doctrine up until the last days of his life.6 He was also a 
firm believer in dreams.7 

Wahb held the position of qadi under tUmar ibn tAbd al-
tAzIz.8 Yaqut claims that he died while in office in San'a',9 

but this is impossible. He was imprisoned in his last years, 
and eventually flogged for reasons which remain uncertain.10 

He seems to have been a fierce-tempered man fanatically de­
voted to his Yemenite heritage.11 

From this it is clear that Wahb was far removed from the 
school of Medina, a Yemenite who differed in approach from 
the scholars of hadith. From all appearances, he was a com-

b [The abna were Yemenites descended from Persian troops sent into the 
area in pre-lslamic times. For details, see Ibn Khallikan, Wafayat al-a'yan, 
VI, 35f.; Noldeke, Geschichu der Perser undAraber, pp. 220ff.; EP, I, 102 
(Κ. V. Zettersteen); Khoury, Wahb b. Munabbih, pp. 189f.] 

5 AI-Dhahabl/Fischer, p. 439 [also Ibn Sa'd, V, 396. The implication here 
is that Wahb's continent life style rendered superfluous any further ablution 
for the morning prayer.] 

6 Yaqut, Mu jam al-udaba, VII, 232; al-Dhahabi/Fischer, p. 440; Ibn Ha-
jar, TahiMb al-tahdbib, XI, 168; also Ibn Hisham, Kitab al-tijan, pp. 47f. 
[Cf. Khoury, Wahb b. Munabbih, pp. 206, 270ff., 314, concerning Wahb's 
writings and views on this subject.] 

7 Al-Dhahabi/Fischer, p. 440; Ibn Kathxr, Al-BidAya wa-l-nihaya, IX, 293. 
8 Al-Yafi'I, Mirat al-janan, I, 248f. 
9Mujam al-udaba, VII, 232. 
10 Al-Dhahabl/Fischer, p. 442; Ibn Hajar, Tahdhib al-tahdhib, XI, 168. 
11 Al-Dhahabi/Fischer, p. 440. 
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piler of akhbar and qisas: Yaqut calls him an "akbbari and teller 
of tales",12 Ibn Khallikan describes him as a "narrator of akh-
bar and qisas"13 and al-Dhahabi confirms them when he says, 
"Wahb was an akhbari and a highly learned storyteller."14 For 
these reasons we find that he was a topic of criticism and 
controversy, for while some regarded him as a reliable au­
thority, others were critical of him.15 

Wahb took his materials from both oral accounts and books. 
He claimed to have read a wide collection of prophets' books, 
works which according to the various sources numbered 30, 
32, 70-some, 92, and 93. Given the widely erratic numbering 
of these books and the sources to which they are attributed, 
we cannot lend any credence to such accounts.16 At any rate, 
however, Wahb was renowned for his familiarity with books 
of the ancients. Ibn al-'Imad states, "He was intensely inter­
ested in the books of the ancients and narratives and tales of 
the nations,"17 works which his brother reportedly used to 

12Mu'jam al-udaba, VII, 232. 
13 Wafayat al-ayim, II, 238 ['Abbas ed., VI, 35]. 
14 Al-Dhahabi/Fischer, p. 438. 
15 See Ibn Sa'd, V, 395ff; Ibn Hajar, Tahdhib al-tabdhib, XI, 167. Al-'Ijli 

said that he was a trustworthy tabi \ and Abu Zur'a, al-Nasa'I, and Abii 
Hayyan also considered him trustworthy (thiqa). Yaqut deemed him "one of 
the best of the tdbi'un, a trustworthy veracious man" [Mu'jam al-udaba, 
VII, 232], Al-Dhahabi (Fischer, p. 438) said, "He transmitted from Ibn 'Ab­
bas, Jabir . . . and others." 

16Ibn Sa'd, V, 395; Ibn Qutayba, Ma :arif.] p. 233 ['Ukasha ed., p. 459]; 
Ibn Hajar, Tabdhtb al-tabdhib, XI, 167. Isma'Il . . . I heard Wahb saying, "I 
have read 92 books, all of which had been sent down from heaven: 72 in the 
churches and in general circulation, and 20 known only to a few." Yaqut 
{Mu'jam al-udaba, VII, 232) has him saying, "I have read 70-some books 
of the prophets," and in the Tijdn (p. 2) he states, "I have read 93 of the 
books revealed to the prophets," and offers details: "two rolls (sahifa) sent 
down to Adam, 50 to Seth, son of Adam, 30 to Idris, two to Noah, 40 to 
Hud, two to Salih, 20 to Abraham, 50 to Moses, the Psalms revealed to 
David, the Gospel revealed to Jesus, and the Qur'an (al-Furqan) revealed to 
Muhammad." Al-Sakhawi, Al-Tldn bi-l-tawbikb, p. 48, "I have read 30 books 
revealed to 30 prophets"; al-Dhahabi (Fischer, p. 439); Abu Nu'aym, Hilyat 
al-awliya, \ I, 24: "I have read 90-some . . . 91." 

17 Ibn al-'Imad, Shadharat al-dhahab, I, 150. 
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buy for him. As Ibn KathIr says, "He was learned in the books 
of the ancients."18 Likewise, Yaqut mentions that "Wahb 
transmitted much material from the ancient works known as 
the IsraUiyat."19 

From the accounts ascribed to him it is evident that Wahb 
fairly accurately transmitted fragments of the Old Testament 
which were later quoted by al-Tabari in his Tafiir, and also 
reported fragments of the Psalms; certain of his narratives also 
indicate knowledge of the Talmud.20 As Horovitz points out, 
he gave the names and personalities of the Book of Genesis in 
accordance with the Hebrew text, and also noted the devia­
tions in the Syriac translation.21 There are a number of pas­
sages which indicate his knowledge of Hebrew, and possibly 
also Syriac.22 He apparently drew information on the birth 
and life of Jesus from the Gospels and other Christian writ­
ings.23 Moreover, his data on the origins of Christianity and 
its spread in Yemen are related to the Syriac text of the Letter 
of Simeon, with the embellishments demanded by popular folk­
lore.24 Much of his information seems to have been drawn 
from folktales circulating among the Christians and Jews. Al-
Dhahabi mentions that he was "intensely interested in the 

lsAl-Bidaya wa-l-nihaya, IX, 276. 
19Mujam al-udaba, VII, 232. 
20 'All, "Mawarid ta'rlkh al-Tabari," I, 193. 
21 ["Biographies," I, 557 = ] Al-Maghazi al-ΰΐά, p. 33. 
22 The following examples appear in the Tijan, p. 21: "Qaynan, a Hebrew 

name which in the Arabic language means 'purchaser" (mushtan)"; "Mahlil, a 
Hebrew name which in the Arabic language means 'glorified' (mamdiih), and 
which in the Syriac version of the Bible is given as Malall, which in Arabic 
means 'anointed of God' (maslh Allah)." [For this last example, Krenkow5S 

edition of the Kitab al-tijan must be emended to read musabbih Allah, "praiser 
of God," to accord with the sense of the Syriac. For further examples, see 
Khoury, Wabb b. Munabbih, I, 215f.; also cf. Ramzi Baalbaki, "Early Arab 
Lexicographers and the Use of Semitic Languages," forthcoming in Berytus, 
on the knowledge and use of other Semitic languages in early Islamic times.] 

23 Al-Tabari, Tafiir, I, 102; cf. Genesis 10:21ff. And on the birth and life 
of Jesus, see al-Tabari, Tafttr, III, 77, 147; XVI, 43. 

24 See Axel Moberg1S introduction to his The Book of the Himyarttes (Lund, 
1924). 
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Ism illy at.As we shall see below, he also made use of many 
popular Yemenite tales. 

Some of Wahb's information, however, shows points of 
variance from the scriptural texts. Ibn Qutayba noted the dis-
crepancies between his information on the beginning of Cre-
ation and the Book of Genesis, and Ibn Qutayba's collation 
of Wahb's data indicates that the latter added material to the 
passages he took from the Old Testament and other texts.0 

Parts of this material derive from exegesis of Qur'anic verses, 
from the Ism illy at, and from Wahb's own reflections on the 
books of the ahl al-kitab.26 That Wahb's accounts contradict 
each other is obviously a factor pointing to the conclusion 
that they suffered either corruption or interpolation in later 
times.27 Al-Sakhawl regards his accounts as impermissible to 
historians 28 And we should also note that Wahb was not above 
making claims to learning he did not possess, such as his abil-
ity to read a Greek inscription in the mosque of Damascus for 
al-Walid ibn 'Abd al-Malik 2 9 

A number of works on the pre-Islamic period are attributed 
to Wahb, although there is disagreement concerning their ti-
des.11 Ibn Sa'd states that Wahb composed a book entitled 
Ahadlth al-anbiya wa-l-'ubbad wa-ahadith Bani Isra'il, "Ac-
counts of the Prophets and Saints, and of the Israelites."30 Ibn 
al-Nadlm refers to AUMubtada' and attributes it to Wahb's 
grandson 'Abd al-Mun'im,31 and Ibn Qutayba makes men-

25 Al-Dhahabl/Fischer, p. 438. 
c [Cf. further on this, Lecomte, "Citations," pp. 34fF.; idem, Ibn Qutayba, 

pp. 77, 192ff.] 
26 See Ibn Qutayba, Maarif, pp. 8f., 9fF. ['Ukasha ed., pp. 14f., 17ff.]. 
27Horovitz, ["Biographies," I, 557 = ] Al-Maghazi al-uld, p. 32. 
2SAl-I'lan bi-l-tawbikh, p. 48. 
29 Al-Mas'udi, Muruj al-dhahab, edited by Barbier de Meynard and Pavet 

de Courteille (Paris, 1861-77), V, 361f. [ed. Charles Pellat (Beirut 1966-79), 
III, 366], 

d [Cf. Khoury, Wahb b. Munabbih, I, 210fF.] 
30 Ibn Sa d, VII, ii, 97. 
31 Fihrist, p. 138. 
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tion of a Qisas al-anbiya\ "Tales of the Prophets," and a. Mub-
tada' al-khalq, "Beginning of Creation," also called Al-Mabda', 
or Al-Mubtada ?2 Al-Mas'udi also refers to the Mubtada'.33 

HajjI Khalifa probably has parts of the same work in mind 
when he attributes to Wahb a Qisas al-akhyar, "Tales of Right­
eous Men," and a Qisas al-anbiya, "Tales of the Prophets," 
and likewise when he speaks of a Kitab al-isra iltyat.34 Rosen­
thal considers this last work and the Kitab al-mubtada' to be 
one and the same.35 From this and from the selections which 
have come down to us, it appears that Wahb dealt with the 
beginning of Creation and tales of the prophets and holy men. 
No book has survived on any of the subjects mentioned in 
the tides given by later authorities, but some of his work has 
reached us as quotations cited in al-Tabari (both the Qur'an 
commentary and the history), Ibn Qutayba, Ibn Ishaq, and 
others. Whereas his accounts in al-Tabari for the most part 
come to us from Isma'il ibn 'Abd al-Karim ibn 'Abd al-
Samad ibn Ma'qil (this Ma'qil was the brother of Wahb) and 
hence from Wahb, we have the Kitab al-tijan in the recension 
of 'Abd al-Mun'im (d. A.H. 228) ibn Idris, a descendant of 
Wahb through his daughter. 

There is no question that the accounts and tales of Wahb 
became a kind of inheritance, as it were, for his family, which 
tried to circulate them, and perhaps also to add to them through 
the work of 'Abd al-Mun'im ibn Idris and Isma'il ibn 'Abd 
al-Karim ibn Ma'qil ibn Munabbih (d. A.H. 210), both of 
whom probably resorted to fabrication in order to glorify 
Wahb's name.36 But on the other hand, Wahb did become a 

32 Ibn Qutayba, Ma'artf p. 6 [1Ukasha ed., p. 9]; Ibn Hajar, TabMb al-
tabdhib, XI, 168. 

uMumj al-dhabab, I, 127 [Pellat ed., I, 73; cf. also II, 292]. 
34Kashfal-Zuniin, edited by Gustav Fliigel (Leipzig and London, 1835-

58), IV, 518, no. 9436; V, 40, no. 9826 [Istanbul ed., II, 1328, 1390]. 
xHistory of Muslim Historiography, p. 265, n. 2 [2nd ed., p. 335, n. 2]; 

Becker, Papyri Schott-Reinhardt I, pp. 8ff. 
36 "tAbd al-Mun'im ibn Idris, the famed storyteller, fabricated stories, bought 
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prominent authority on the Isralllyat, and as we sense a cer-
tain discrepancy in the accounts ascribed to him in such pri-
mary sources as al-Tabari, Ibn Qutayba, and al-Mas'udi, it is 
probable that there were others who added to or altered his 
stories.37 

Let us now attempt to reconstruct a provisional outline for 
the Mubtada' of Wahb by comparing the first part of the 
Kitab al-tijan with the accounts attributed to Wahb in the 
history and Qur'an commentary of al-Tabari, and in Ibn Qu-
tayba's Kitab al-ma'arif:e 

1. Age of the earth, and the creation of the heavens, earth, 
and seas in seven days;38 the story of Adam and Eve in the 
Garden (al-Janna);39 Adam's fall to earth, and his knowl-
edge that his progeny will populate it, and that God will 
create in Mecca "the house of sacred refuge" (al-bayt 
haraman aminan);40 the sons of Adam.41 

2. Noah, his sons, the propagation of his descendants 
upon the earth, and the peoples and languages ascribed to 
them42 

3. Wahb follows the Torah in his tales of the prophets, 
especially those of the Israelites, and also elucidates some 
Quranic references. He mentions Isaac, son of Abraham, 
the story of Jacob, son of Isaac, the tribes descended from 

books, including biographical works, transmitted the stories they contained, 
and attributed it all to his illustrious grandfather Wahb"; see Ibn Hajar, Tah-
dhib al-tahdhib, I, 315; idem, Lisem al-mizan, II, 73. In Ibn Sa'd, V, 395, we 
find the hadith, "In my community there will be two men, the first of them 
Wahb, to whom God will grant (yahabu) wisdom," a manifest forgery in-
tended to glorify Wahb. 

37 See EI1, IV, 1085 (J. Horovitz). 
* [Cf. Khoury, Wabb b. Munabbih, pp. 222ff.] 
38 See al-Tabari, Tafsir, XII, 4; idem, Ta'rikh, I, 36ff.; Ibn Qutayba, Ma'arif 

(al-Sawi), pp. 8f. ['Ukasha ed., pp. 14f.]. 
39 Al-Tabari, Tafsir, VII, 106; VIII, 184f.; idem, Ta'rikh, I, 106. [The 

Tijan devotes a long discussion to the question of whether al-Janna here 
means paradise or a place somewhere on earth.] 

40 Al-Tabari, Ta'rikh, I, 130f. 
41 Ibn Qutayba, Ma'arif, p. 10 ['Ukasha ed., pp. 17f.]. 
42Ibid., pp. llff. ['Ukasha ed., pp. 21ff.]; al-Tabari, Ta'rikb, I, 211. 
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him,43 the story of Moses and Aaron, Moses in the Sacred 
Valley, Moses and his staff and Pharaoh's magicians, the 

sacred cow of the Israelites, and the death of Moses.44 

4. Succession of the Israelite prophets; tribulations suf­
fered by the Israelites and their deliverance by the prophet 
Ezekiel;45 proliferation of sin among the Israelites, and the 
story of the Ark of the Covenant, the sakina/ and their role 
in the victory of the Israelites; loss of the Ark, followed by 
a 400-year period of tribulation until the appearance of the 

prophet Samuel and the return of the Ark; Samuel bestows 
his blessing on Saul, who becomes king but fails to carry 
out God's will, so the blessing passes to David, who kills 
Goliath and becomes king; details on David;46 Solomon 
and his relationship with BilqIs;47 the two sons of Solomon 
and those who came after them up until the time of Jere­
miah and the destruction of Jerusalem at the hands of Neb­
uchadnezzar.48 

5. Later Israelite prophets;49 birth and miracles of Jesus, 
his summons to his aposdes for the Last Supper, Jesus' 
prophecy concerning his apostles.50 

43 Ibn Qutayba, Ma'arifl pp. 16f. ['Ukasha ed., pp. 35ff.]. 
44 See Ibn Qutayba, Ma'arif, p, 20 ['Ukasha ed., p. 43f.]; al-Tabari, Ta'rikh, 

I, 471ff., also 504; idem, Tafiir, I, 281f.; II, 373f., 385f., 388; XVI, 107f., 
118f., 136, 139, 140, 141. 

45 Al-Tabari, Tankh, I, 535f., 539. 
f [The sakina, a divine presence which may take a number of perceptible 

forms, is associated with the Ark of the Covenant in Siirat al-Baqara (II), 
248. See Ignaz Goldziher, Abhandlungen zur arabischen Philologie (Leiden, 
1896-99), I, 177ff.; EI1, IV, 78 (B. Joel); Arthur JefFery, The Foreign Vocab­
ulary of the Qur an (Baroda, 1938), p. 174.] 

46 Al-Tabari, Tankh, I, 544ff., 551ff., 560ff., 571ff.; idem, Tafiir, II, 390, 
392, 396, 398f. 

47 Al-Tabari, Tafiir, XIX, 81f., 86, 88, 90, 91, 96f. [idem, Tankh, I, 572, 
584ff. This is the famous story of Solomon and the Queen of Sheba; see EP, 
I, 1219f. (E. Ullendorff).] 

48 Al-Tabari, Tafiir, III, 20, 22ff.; [idem, Ta'rikh, I, 658ff.;] Ibn Qutayba, 
Ma'Anf, pp. 20ff. ['Ukasha ed., pp. 46fF.]. 

49 Ibn Qutayba, Ma'arif, pp. 22ff. ['Ukasha ed., pp. 49ff.]. 
so Al-Tabari, Tafiir, VI, 205; XVI, 49, 161, 192, 195, 203, 390. 
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Wahb usually presents the qisas al-anbiya in a form which 
accords in its general outiines with what we find in the liter-
ature and lore of the ahl al-kitab. In the Kitab al-tijan we find 
Arabic folktales on the beginning of paganism,51 'Ad, and the 
city of Iram.52 Similarly, Ibn Qutayba quotes him on the story 
of Abraham, Nimrod, Abraham's emigration, the story of Ish-
mael,53 and likewise on the Seven Sleepers and on Shu'ayb 
and Madyan.54 Ibn Khallikan defined the scope of his interests 
when he said, "He was a man knowledgeable on akhbar of 
the ancients, the creation of the world, the affairs of the 
prophets—may the blessing and peace of God be upon them— 
and the lives of kings."55 It seems that Ibn Khallikan had in 
mind his narratives on the kings of Yemen, in addition to the 
materials we have mentioned above. 

Yaqut said that Wahb ibn Munabbih wrote a book entitled 
Kitab al-muluk al-mutawwaja min Himyar wa-akhbarihim wa-
qisasihim wa-quburihim wa-ash'arihim, "The Crowned Kings 
of Himyar, Their Narratives and Tales, Tombs and Poems."56 

Ibn Khallikan saw this work and described it as being "a use-
ful book."57 In all probability this book was the foundation 
for the Kitab al-tijan fi mtduk Himyar wa-l-Taman, "The Book 
of Crowns, concerning the Kings of Himyar and Yemen," 
which Ibn Hisham transmitted as a work ascribed to Wahb 
and handed down through 'Abd al-Mun'im ibn Idrls. 

The greater part of the Kitab al-tijan deals with the story 
of the southern Arabs, their past history, the glorious deeds 
of their kings, and their migration. The book displays a mov-

51 Kitab al-tijan, pp. 203ff., 207ff. 
521 bid., pp. 39ff. 
53 Ibn Qutayba, Ma'drif pp. 15f. ['Ukasha ed., pp. 30ff.]. 
54 Ibid., pp. 19, 35 ['Ukasha ed., pp. 41f., 54], 
55 Wafayat al-a'yan, II, 238 ['Abbas ed., VI, 35]. 
56Mu'jam al-udaba\ VII, 232. [Cf., on this work, Krenkow, "The Two 

Oldest Books on Arabic Folklore," II, 55ff, 204ff.; Khoury, Wahb b. Mu-
nabbih, I, 286ff.] 

57 Wafayat al-a'yan, II, 238 ['Abbas ed., VI, 35]. 
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ing folkloric style similar to the qisas of pre-Islamic times, and 
thus is a pseudo-literary work consistent in both verse and 
prose with the style of the ayyam tales. It offers up popular 
and glorious Yemenite legend, the goal of which seems to 
have been to paint a magnificent portrait of the Arabs of the 
south, confronting the general predominance of the Arabs of 
the north, and reflecting the form taken by the boasting which 
transpired between the two sides. The book thus proclaims, 
"Himyar on the earth was like the lamp shining in the dead 
of the night."58 We hear that the Arabs of the south were 
familiar with monotheism (tawhid) before other peoples,59 and 
that during the wars of al-Sa'b Dhu 1-Qarnayn, he used to 
summon his foes "to either the sword or the faith."60 We find 
that the Yemenites regarded the Ka'ba as sacred, and that 
some of their kings performed the pilgrimage to it.61 Their 
kings also made great conquests all over the world.62 Also 

58 Kitab al-tijm, p. 62. 
59 It is explained, for example, that Ya'rub was the successor (khalifa) to 

the prophet Htid and "took up God's work after him"; Tijan, p. 16. Al-Sa'b 
Dhu 1-Qarnayn resembled Solomon in that "livestock, grazing animals, birds, 
vermin, and even wild beasts were all subject to his command" (p. 46), and 
even the wind obeyed him (pp. 86f.). Al-Sa'b is described as an unsent prophet 
(nabi gbayr mursal), as also is Luqman (pp. 35, 70). [On the distinction 
between a nabi and a rasul, see Krenkow, p. 62.] 

60Kitab al-ttjan, p. 101. Al-Khair served as his guide during his con­
quests. [It should be noted here that the Ttjan takes Dhu 1-Qarnayn to be an 
ancient Yemenite hero and specifically excludes (p. 110) identification of this 
figure with Alexander the Great, who in the Qur'an and in Islamic tradition 
is usually referred to as Dhii 1-Qarnayn.] 

6lIbid., p. 35. 
62 For example, 'Abd Shams ibn Yashjub, named Saba', conquered Ba­

bylonia, Armenia, and Syria, reached the Nile, and founded Misr, the capital 
of Egypt (pp. 47f.). In the east, Himyar reached so far as even to extend 
beyond Gog and Magog to the land of the rising sun; he also conquered 
Syria, Abyssinia, Egypt, and the Maghrib as far as the Atlantic Ocean (pp. 
52f.). In the west, al-Sa'b Dhti 1-Qarnayn conquered black Africa, Abyssinia, 
and Spain, and in the east he overran Armenia, Samarqand, Bab al-Abwab 
[Darband in the eastern Caucasus], and Gog and Magog, built the wall be­
tween them and other peoples, conquered India and China, and finally reached 
the Spring of Life (pp. 86fF.). 
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attributed to the Yemenites is precedence in the use of the 
Arabic script,63 and in the composition of poetry in Arabic, 
an art which the Arabs of the north copied from them later 
on.64 The work further stresses their knowledge of the sci­
ences (al-hikma),65 their skill and preeminence in craftsman­
ship, and that the rest of mankind learned these skills from 
them.66 

It is clear from this that the book glorifies the Yemenites 
and accords them the preeminent position in monotheism, 
military conquests, language, literature, science, and crafts­
manship. It is difficult to demarcate the role Wahb played in 
all this, but in any case he must have had a powerful influ­
ence.67 And we must note that the book contains tales which 
go back to Ibn Ishaq (through his students, such as al-Bakka'i 
and Abu cAbbad al-Hamdanl),68 Abu Mikhnaf,69 Muham­
mad ibn al-Sa'ib al-Kalbl,70 iUbayd ibn Sharya,71 Ka'b al-
Ahbar,72 and other later authorities.73 A great part of the book 
comes with no mention of any source, and probably some of 
this, or most of it, derives from Wahb ibn Munabbih. 

Wahb did compose a book on the maghazi, a work to which 
Hajji Khalifa refers.74 Becker discovered a fragment of his 
Maghazl as it appears in a papyrus copied in a.h. 228. This 
fragment is in the recension of cAbd al-Mun'im ibn IdrIs and 

6iIbid., p. 54. 
64Ibid., p. 35. 
65Ibid., pp. 70, 73, 74. They were also the first to make stoning the pun­

ishment for adultery and to cut off the hand of the thief. 
66Ibid., p. 162. 
67See al-Tha'alibl, Lataif al-ma'arif, p. 26 [Cairo ed., pp. 37f.], where 

Wahb vehemently defends the Yemenites. 
6sKitab al-ttjan, pp. 65f., 75, 115, 128, 251. 
69Ibid., pp. 125, 180, 183. 
70 Ibid., pp. 132, 212, 213, 240. 
71 Ibid., pp. 66, 209. 
72 Ibid., pp. IlOfF. 
73Ibid., pp. Ill, 135, 164, 233. 
74 Kashf al-zunun, II, 1747. [Cf. Khouty, Wahb b. Munabbih, I, 274ff.] 
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begins, "Muhammad ibn Bahr Abu Talha told me: 'Abd al-
Mun'im ibn Idris told us, from his father, from Abu 1-Yas, 
from Wahb ibn Munabbih."75 The following subjects are dis­
cussed: the second pledge of al-'Aqaba, discussion of Quraysh 
in the DAr al-nadwa, the Hijra and the Prophefs arrival in 
Medina, the expedition against Banu Khath'am. The narra­
tives go back to Wahb without isnad, and in them we find 
poems recited by the pagans who took part in the events, and 
patterned after the style of the ayyam. We cannot tell whether 
Wahb neglected the isnad entirely, since the author of the Hil-
yat al-awliya has quoted two fragments from Wahb—the first 
concerning the conquest of Mecca,76 and the second on the 
death of the Prophet77—in which he gives the isnad with the 
indication that the account has come via 'Abd al-Mun'im ibn 
Idris. The style of the two fragments is the very essence of the 
popular folkloric style with a clear legendary stamp. 

The important fact here is that the Maghazi of Wahb ibn 
Munabbih is neither referred to in the books on the sira, nor 
regarded as a serious work. Its approach is entirely different 
from that of the school of Medina. Wahb ibn Munabbih was, 
as we have seen, a storyteller, or qass, who in his Mubtada' 
and in his narratives on Yemen set forth folktales and legends 
which he cited as if they were history. In this way he intro­
duced the folkloric element into the discipline of history, as is 
clear from the accounts quoted from him, for the pre-Islamic 

75 Becker, Papyri Schott-Reinhardt I, pp. IfF.; Adolf Grohmann, From the 
World if Arabic Papyri (Cairo, 1952), p. 4. [On pp. 115ff. of his Ilm al-
ta'rikh, Duri gives the Arabic text of parts of this papyrus. For an English 
translation of these lines, see Genrude Melamede, "The Meetings at al-'Ak-
aba," Le Monde Oriental, XXVIII (1934), pp. 17ff.; for the full text, with a 
German translation, see Khoury, Wahb b. Munabbih, I, 117ff. Cf. also the 
remarks and emendations proposed by M. J. Kister in his "Notes on the 
Papyrus Account of the 'Aqaba Meeting," Le Museon, LXXVI (1963), pp. 
403ff.; idem, "On the Papyrus of Wahb b. Munabbih," BSOAS, XXXVII 
(1974), pp. 545ff.] 

76 Abu Nu'aym, Hilyat al-awliya, IV, 79. 
77Ibid., IV, 73. 
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THE FAMILY OF WAHB78 

Hammam Wahb 

Wahb 

al-Aswar 

Sij (Sayj) 

I 
Kamil 

Munabbih 

Ma'qil Ghaylan 'Abd 'Umar 
Allah 

'Abd (daughter) 'Abd 'Abd 'Abd 
Allah 

Sinan 

Idris 

al-Rahman al-Samad al-Karim 

Isma'Il 
(A.H. 2 1 0 ) 

'Abd al-Mun'im 
(A.H. 2 2 8 ) 

period, in Ibn Ishaq, al-Ya'qubi, Ibn Qutayba, al-Tabari, and 
al-Mas'udl. In like manner, he had a powerful influence on 
the qisas al-anbiya', as in the works of al-Kisa'I and al-
Thaalibi.g 

78 See Victor Chauvin, La Recension egyptienne Acs MUle et une nuits (Brus-
sels, 1899) [also Khoury, Wahb b. Munabbih, p. 201], 

s [Al-Kisa'I, Qisas al-anbiya\ edited by I. Eisenberg (Leiden, 1922); al-
Tha'alibl, Qisas al-anbiya' (Cairo, A.H. 1286).] 
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It would seem that the storytellers, whether popularizers or 
preachers, at times influenced the tone in which the sira was 
written in later periods by introducing a certain tendency to­
wards exaggeration and fanciful imagination. But they are not, 
in any case, to be regarded as historians, nor did they produce 
any historical approach to the writing of the sira. It is obvious 
that the popular folktale on the sira and on the early Muslims 
is in its style an extension of the pre-Islamic folktale, and this 
is what aroused the disapproval of the maghazi school of 
Medina. It can thus be said with certainty that the outlines 
and contents of the sira were not products of the storyteller's 
craft, but rather the work of maghazi-oriented hadith scholars 
and others who followed their methodology in Medina. 

The role of Wahb ibn Munabbih thus lies in the fact that 
he was the first to establish a framework, albeit a folkloric one, 
for the history of prophethood from the beginning of Crea­
tion until the appearance of Islam. Some later historians bor­
rowed from, or were influenced by, this structure or the ma­
terial it contained. 



CHAPTER FOUR 

Origins of the Historical School 

of Iraq: Its Rise and Development 

Until the Third Century A.H. 

Arab historical writing is an integral part of Arab culture, 
and it can only be understood in terms of other cultural activ­
ities and developments.* To study it in isolation leads only to 
a confused and incomplete understanding of its origins and 
development. 

Historical writing among the Arabs began after the rise of 
Islam. Activities of the Jahiliya, such as the ayyam tales and 
genealogy, indicate one aspect of Arab interests and the be­
ginnings of a narrative style, but they do not embody any 
conception of history. 

In their earliest stages, historical studies followed two gen­
eral perspectives in separate paths: the perspective of the ha-

Mth scholars, and the perspective of the tribes, which was in 
a sense the continuation of earlier tribal activities. These two 
perspectives reflect two fundamental currents in early Islamic 
society, the Islamic and the tribal, which had an influence on 
various aspects of life. The activities of the two perspectives 
each took shape in a particular center. Medina, the cradle of 
Islam, was the primary center for the perspective of the hadtth 

scholars, while Basra and Kufa, settlements of the tribal gar-

a [The Arabic text of this chapter is based on a paper read by Professor 
Duri at a London conference on the historians of the Middle East and pub­
lished as 'The Iraq School of History to the Ninth Century—a Sketch," in 
Historians of the Middle East, edited by Bernard Lewis and P. M. Holt (Lon­
don, 1962), pp. 46ff.] 
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risons and centers of tribal tradition, were the primary foci for 
the tribal perspective. All three cities were centers of cultural 
life in early Islamic times. 

The Islamic perspective is not the subject of our inquiry 
here. It suffices for us to state that it began among the hadith 
scholars who, beginning with tUrwa ibn al-Zubayr, devoted 
special attention to the life of the Prophet, rapidly advanced 
to the study of early Islamic history, and founded a school of 
maghazi historians. In addition to this, tales and stories about 
the Prophet and the conquests were being told and circulated. 
These tales, or qisas, did not lead to the establishment of any 
historical perspective, but in later times they did provide ma­
terial which seeped into the works of some historians, Ibn 
Ishaq in particular. Such tales remained, however, the object 
of suspicion and caution among serious historians. The ear­
nest intent and critical approach of the Medinan school is ap­
parent in its emphasis on chains of authorities and in its crit­
icism of ruwHt. By the end of the first century A.H., the general 
lines of the stra had been laid out and its basic accounts col­
lected. Many popular tales crept in at a later time, with the 
shift from simple and factual narrative accounts towards those 
bearing elements of glorification and a certain degree of ex­
aggeration. The idea of writing down accounts appeared at a 
relatively early time; the use of writing had already been es­
tablished by al-Zuhri by the end of the first century A.H., and 
from that time onwards accounts were taken either orally or 
from written sources. 

The tribal perspective on the study of history began as a 
result of the interest in the activities and affairs of the tribes. 
In both style and approach it was a direct continuation of the 
ayyam tales (and also of the accounts of genealogies), but now 
directed at the new ayyam, the battles and conquests of Islam. 

Arab culture was basically oral. It relied on poetry for its 
documentation and found verse to be the best means of pre-
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serving its heritage. There are references to registers and doc­
uments in the hands of the kings of al-Hira and the Himyar-
ites in Yemen, and to some Yemenite family records and written 
genealogies later used by some historians, but these are excep­
tional cases.1 Narratives were related primarily in tribal social 
gatherings (majalis), and in general were viewed as the collec­
tive property of the family or tribe. Certain individuals, such 
as narrators of poetry or tribal elders (mash&yikh), were its 
principal transmitters. At first these narratives and accounts 
had no isnads naming specific authorities, but rather remained 
a part of general culture and the common concern of all. Such 
oral accounts as these, full of poetry, circulated in early Islamic 
society just as they had in pre-Islamic times.2 Kufa and Basra, 
as great tribal centers in direct and continuous contact with 
the arid steppe lands, became active centers for circulating these 
accounts and narratives.b 

On the other hand, the rise of Islam and the settlement of 
the tribes in the garrison towns gathered the tribes together 
into a single area, fostered new topics of interest among them, 
and introduced them to the basic skills of reading and writing. 
We have ample evidence of the use of writing, to aid the 
memory or to preserve accounts, before the end of the first 
century A.H. and during the first half of the second.3 Thus 
accounts in written form began to appear alongside oral ones. 

At the dawn of the second century A.H., we hear of the 
presence of elders (ashydkh) and narrators (ruwdt) learned in 

1 See Ibn Hisham (Cairo ed.), I, 321 [Wustenfeld ed., I, i, 191]; al-Tabari, 
Ta'rikh (Cairo ed.), II, 123 [de Goeje ed., I, 770]; al-Hamdani, I kill, I, 5; 
X, 3Of., lllf. 

2 See al-Jahiz, Ii ay an. III, 366; al-Suyutl, Muzhir, I, 248f.; II, 355. 
b [Pellat provides an important account of these developments in Basra in 

his Le Milieu basrien, pp. 123ff.] 
3 Ibn al-Nadlm, Fihrtst, pp. 9f., 132-,Agbani [IV, 52], IV, 253; Ibn Hajar, 

Tahdhib al-tabdhib, II, 216. [Cf. Nabia Abbott, The Rise of the North Arabic 
Script and Its Kur'anic Development (Chicago, 1939), pp. 45fF.; also her Stud­
ies, I, 5fF.; II, 5ff.] 
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the genealogies and exploits of their tribes, and also of the 
existence of "books" containing genealogies, poetry, and 
probably prose narratives, akhbar, of certain tribes. These works 
had probably been collected by some of the ruwat, but still 
were regarded as the collective property of the tribe. The poet 
al-Tirimmah (d. 105/723-24) refers to the kitab of Tamlm, 
and Hammad al-Rawiya (d. 156/773) had access to the kutub 
of Quraysh and Thaqif.4 From these ruwat and in these books, 
there was abundant historical material for historians of later 
times. 

Around the middle of the second century A.H. we encoun-
ter ruwat, akhbariyiln, genealogists, and philologists as schol-
ars who left behind historical works or a wealth of historical 
accounts. This period was one of pioneering scholars in var-
ious fields who began collecting poetry, akhbar, and hadith. 
Abu 'Amr ibn al-cAla (d. 154/770) and Hammad al-Rawiya 
collected poetry, akhbar, and materials on pre-Islamic Arab 
genealogies, primarily from tribal ruwat and monographs, and 
made use of writing to preserve some of the work they pro-
duced.5 From this period also derive the first collections of 
hadith, compiled in various provinces, and the first works on 
the sira which have come down to us. This is indicative of a 
phase of cultural development—the collecting phase—in which 
history had a role to play. The akhbariyiln and the scholarly 
ruwat are thus our first historians. 

4 [Al-Tirimmah, Diwan, edited bv F. Krenkow (London, 1927), p. 148, 
no. 28]; Aghrni [IV, 45; V, 174],' IV, 237; VI, 94; Ibn 'Abd al-Barr, Al-
Inbdh 'aid qabd'tl al-ruwdt (Cairo, A.H. 1350), pp. 43ff. [Cf. also Ignaz 
Goldziher, "Some Notes on the Dlwans of the Arab Tribes," JRAS (1897), 
pp. 325ff.; also in his Gesammelte Shnften, IV, 119ff.; F. Krenkow, "The Use 
of Writing for the Preservation of Ancient Arabic Poetry," in A Volume of 
Oriental Studies Presented to Edward G. Browne, edited by T. W. Arnold and 
Reynold A. Nicholson (Cambridge, 1922), pp. 261ff.] 

5 See Ibn Sa'd, VII, ii, 42; al-Jumahi, Tabaqat fuhul al-shu'ard', edited by 
Ahmad Muhammad Shakir (Cairo, 1952), p. 40; Aghrni [III, 100f.], Ill, 
312; Mukhtdrdt Ibn al-Shajari (Cairo, A.H. 1306), pp. 123, 127, 136; al-
Suyutl, Muzhir, II, 304. 
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Just as in the historical writing on the sira we find prede­
cessors to Ibn Ishaq—such as al-ZuhrI—on whom he to a 
great extent relies, so we notice that the akhbariyiin very fre­
quently quote certain ruwat. For example, of the more than 
sixty ruwat from whom Sayf ibn tUmar took material (as pro­
vided to us in al-Tabari), we find that this scholar is particu­
larly dependent on two, TTalha ibn al-A'lam and Muhammad 
ibn tAbd Allah, each of whom he quotes more than a hundred 
times. Other examples are Hisham ibn al-Kalbfs dependence 
on Ibn Abi Salih for information on ancient prophets, and al-
Mada'ini's dependence on Abu I-Dhayyal and al-Mufaddal al-
Dabbi for information on Khurasan. One can see that these 
ruwat were interested in general events or public affairs, not 
just in the narratives on a particular tribe as had earlier been 
the case, and in this way they took an important step forward. 
In the same category we can place some of the genealogists 
who in their writings transcended the limits of a single tribe, 
although along with these there continued to be ruwat for the 
particular tribes. 

The akhbariyun were thus the first historians in the tribal 
perspective. They differ from the ruwat who related accounts 
of specific events, in that they sought to gather accounts rel­
evant to a subject or event and compile them into a continu­
ous written work. Among these akhbanyun were Abu Mikhnaf 
(d. 157/774), 'Awana ibn al-Hakam (d. 147/764), Sayf ibn 
'Umar (d. 180/796), and finally the doyen of the akhbariyun, 
al-Mada'ini (d. 225/839). 

These akhbariyun displayed an interest in the affairs of the 
umma alongside their special concern for the affairs of Iraq. 
We thus notice among them the conception of the unity and 
continuity of the experiences of the Islamic community, and 
similarly, we perceive the idea of the intrinsic unity of Arab 
history. We thus find Sayf ibn 'Umar linking the Ridda wars 
to the conquests. 'Awana ibn al-Hakam covers Islamic history 
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in the first century A.H.: the Rashidun caliphs, the Ridda, the 
conquests, the fitna, and the history of Iraq and Syria up to 
the caliphate of tAbd al-Malik. Abu Mikhnaf deals with early 
Islamic history up to the battle of Siffin, then continues with 
events in Iraq up to the end of the Umayyad period. As for 
al-Mada'ini, he ranges over all of Arab history—political, lit­
erary, and social—beginning with the JahilIya and continuing 
until the dawn of the third century A.H. 

The focus of interest is thus the umma, not the tribe. Sim­
ilarly, we can see other historical views in the works of the 
akbbanyim. We notice the conflict between the concept of di­
vine foreordainment (jabr) in public affairs, as promoted by 
the Umayyads, and the concept of free will and human re­
sponsibility, as espoused by the opposition factions.0 cAwana 
ibn al-Hakam presents the Umayyad point of view in some of 
his accounts: YazId attributes Umayyad authority to the will 
of God,6 and 'Uthman predicts that political power will pass 
to cAbd al-Malik and his sons.7 On the other hand, we find 
Abu Mikhnaf expressing another viewpoint, especially when 
we carefully examine the information he has to offer on the 
rebellion of al-Husayn and the movement of the Tawwabun. 

Refleaed in these historical works is the concept of the state, 
which from the Umayyad angle emphasized the rights of the 
imam and the fealty and obedience owed to him, as opposed 
to the tribal or factional view which placed other loyalties 
(regional, tribal, etc.) above those due to the state. The rebel­
lions against the Umayyads are not regarded as illegitimate, 
even though they are not glorified or explained in favorable 

c [On the concepts of qadar and jabr, see Ignaz Goldziher, Introduction to 
Islamic Theology and Law, translated by Andras and Ruth Hamori (Princeton, 
1981), pp. 81ff.; Julian Obermann, "Political Theology in Early Islam: Hasan 
al-BasrPs Treatise on Qadar," JAOS, LV (1955), pp. I38ff.; EP, IV, 368ff. 
(Josef van Ess); Cook, Early Muslim Dogma, pp. 105ff.] 

6Al-Tabari, Ta'rikh, II, 381. [Cf. p. 155 below.] 
7 Al-Baladhuri, Ansab al-ashraf, V, 220. 
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terms. And even when Mu'awiya's revolt against rAli is crit­
icized, as is the case in the Kitab Sifftn of Nasr ibn Muzahim, 
this criticism is founded on factional considerations, not on 
any conception of the state.8 The surviving works of the akh-
bariyun accordingly show great moderation, for these histori­
ans did not sink to the level of sheer partisanship in their 
writing and were not representatives of only a single point of 
view. Some of the extreme accounts in their works may have 
been omitted during the selection process undertaken by the 
later historians (such as al-Tabari and al-Baladhurl) who pre­
served their works for us. But it is more likely that the expla­
nation for this goes back to the importance attached to the 
r iwaya and khabar  as  opposed  to  personal  judgment  (ray) ,  
and to the spirit of historical discipline enjoined by the way 
in which hadlth scholars and other learned men viewed the 
sources at their disposal. 

Factional, regional, and tribal partisanship also had their 
effects on historical writing. Thus we see both tAlid9 and Iraqi10 

inclinations in Abu Mikhnaf, particularly where he cites the 
account, "I witnessed the time when people were saying, The 
first disgrace to befall Kufa was the death of al-Husayn ibn 
'All, the killing of Hujr ibn 'Adi, and the summons of Zi-
yad.' "u He also reveals a certain tendency to glorify the tribes, 
and in his narratives on Siffin we find a clear emphasis on 
noble tribal deeds. Sayf explains the role of the tribes in the 
conquest of Iraq and stresses the part played by TamIm.12 

'Awana's sympathies are considered to be 'Uthmani: he clearly 
gives Umayyad accounts and sometimes reports from within 

8 See al-Tabari, Ta'rikh, II, 3f., where the imam of error is preferred over 
no imam at all. 

9 See al-Tabari, Tankb, I, 2337, 3276; II, 182fF., 307f. 
10Ibid., I, 322If. 
nIbid., II, 145. 
12 Ibid., I, 2068f., and the importance of al-Qa'qa' ibn 'Amr al-Tamiml. 
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the Umayyad family.13 Nevertheless, some of his accounts re­
flect a viewpoint opposed to the Umayyads.14 

The akhbariyun made great wide-ranging efforts to collect 
accounts and narratives. We thus find them making use of 
family accounts, tribal accounts in Iraq, and a great number 
of individual reports. They had to complement these accounts 
with those of other provinces involved in the events they stud­
ied, and so we find accounts from Syria, Medina, and Arabia. 
This much is clear from the works of the akhbariyun. Abu 
Mikhnaf quoted accounts from the tribal elders of al-Azd, Nu-
mayr, Muharib, and Tamlm, and also cited family accounts.15 

He gives accounts from persons who participated in the events 
themselves, and in addition, a great number of individual re­
ports.16 His sources on SifSn, Muslim ibn 1AqiPs arrival in 
Iraq, and the tragedy of Karbala' were mainly Kufan ones, 
but he did supplement them with Syrian and Medinan ac­
counts.17 Sayf ibn iUmar also relies on Kufan accounts, es­
pecially for the conquests, and rounds them out with some 
Medinan and Syrian reports. On the Ridda he is dependent 
on accounts from Kufa, Arabia, and Medina; among his Me-
dinan ruwat are Hisham ibn 'Urwa and Musa ibn 'Uqba. In 
many reports he goes back to those who participated in the 
events under discussion.18 tAwana ibn al-Hakam relied on 
family accounts, accounts from his own Kalb tribe and others, 
a great number of individual reports, and many Syrian and 
Umayyad accounts.19 In addition, the akhbariyim used official 
documents—letters and treaties—probably obtained from 

13 See al-Baladhurl, Ansab al-ashmf, IVB, 31 ['Abbas ed., IV, i, 286, 320]; 
al-Tabari, Ta'rikh, II, 13. 

14 Al-Baladhuri, Ansab al-ashmf, V, 369; al-Tabari, Ta'rikh, I, 1837. 
15 Al-Tabari, Ta'rikh, I, 3261, 3302, 3303, 3309. 
16 See al-Tabari, Ta'rikh, I, 3202f. 
17Ibid., II, 279, 376, 410ff., 479. 
lliIbU., I, 1786, 1797, 1931ft., 1947f. 
19 See al-Baladhurl, Ansab al-asbraf, V, 132ff., 140; al-Tabari, Ta'rikh, II, 

785, 791ff. 
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government diwam or from persons who held personal cop­
ies.20 

The akhbari could rely heavily on the accounts of his own 
province (as in the case of Abu Mikhnaf) or tribe (e.g., Sayf 
ibn 'Umar), but he could not ignore opposing or contradic­
tory reports.21 By this time the hadith scholars' method of 
source criticism had become fairly widespread and had influ­
enced the akhbariyun. Thus we see that the critical method of 
the latter consisted of scrutinizing the ruwAt and assessing the 
value of the accounts they had transmitted. Sayf, for example, 
says, "This story on the affair of al-Ubulla and its conquest is 
contrary to what the biographical authorities (ahl al-siyar) know, 
and contrary to the traditional accounts."22 Abu Mikhnaf says, 
in reference to an event pertaining to the tragedy of Karbala', 
"But what al-Mujalid ibn SatId, al-Saq'ab ibn Zuhayr al-Azdi, 
and other hadith scholars told us is in keeping with the general 
consensus of hadith scholars. They said. . . ."23 

The tales of the majalis, however, and the poetry pertaining 
to these stories, did make their way into the writings of the 
akhbariyun. This is particularly true of Nasr ibn Muzahim, 
who quotes large amounts of fabricated poetry and in his Siffin 
clearly follows the style of the majalis tales, which in the role 
they play are a continuation of the ay yam.24 We can also per­
ceive a certain trace of the folkloric qisas style in such other 
akhbariyun as Sayf ibn cUmar, Abu Mikhnaf,25 and 'Awana. 
These authors wrote in a smooth direct style, and sometimes 
portrayed events in a graphic and vivid manner. When they 

20 See al-Tabari, Ta'rikh, I, 2820. 
21 See al-Tabari, Ta'rikh, II, 182, 202, 323, concerning Abu Mikhnaf; and 

al-Baladhuri, Ansab al-ashraf, IVB, 31 ['Abbas ed., IV, i, 286, 320]; V, 369; 
al-Tabari, Ta'rikh, I, 1833, on 'Awana. 

22 Al-Tabari, Ta'rikh, I, 2025. 
13Ibid., II, 314. 
24 See al-Khatib al-Baghdadi, Ta'rikh Baghdad, XIII, 482f.; al-TusI, Fihrist 

kutub al-sht'a, edited by A. Sprenger et al. (Calcutta, 1855), p. 347. 
25 Al-Tabari, Ta'rikh, I, 2058, 2071f., 2101f.; II, 3, 8ff. 
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write about battles we find them quoting poetry, speeches, 
and dialogue throughout their narratives. The story is usually 
told in continuous form in their writings, and in them we 
sometimes sense the stylistic tone of the ayymn tales. 

The akhbariyun furthermore represent a phase of transition 
from an earlier period when the isnad was entirely lacking to 
the strict method of the hadith scholars in citing the chain of 
transmitters, for the akhbariyun display a great deal of free­
dom, and sometimes carelessness, in their use of the isnad. We 
thus find broken chains of authorities, cases where only the 
first name of the mm is mentioned (e.g., "from tUmayr ibn 
So-and-So (fidm) al-'Abd?), or barren statements like "it was 
said," "on the authority of a man (or elder) from . . . ," or 
"on the authority of scholars who know." During the second 
century A.H. we find that a single account is usually given for 
each point or subject, and that reports follow each other in 
succession to bring the story or narrative to completion. This 
practice persists until we come to al-Mada inl, who gives more 
than one report on the same subject and provides us with a 
more balanced and impartial picture of it. AkhbAr and nwayat 
were for the most part taken from oral transmission, but it is 
probable that some sources were written ones, as appears from 
such expressions as qala, "he said," and haddathani, "he told 
me," in reference to the same source. 

It would be appropriate here to mention that philologists 
also played a role in the shaping of a more strictly critical 
method of research through their studies on poetry and their 
efforts to separate genuine from fabricated poetry.d Likewise, 
they helped to collect and sift historical accounts, and in so 
doing introduced the method of internal criticism of source 
materials and established it alongside that of external criticism 
of the sources and the ruwat. In writing, their approach was 

d [Cf. further, Abbott, Studies, III, 25ff.] 
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similar to that of the akhbariyiin in that they too collected the 
materials pertaining to a subject or event and compiled them 
into "monographs" (kutub). 

Genealogists rendered their services to historical studies by 
providing the genealogies with some information on the lives 
of the personalities involved (especially in Mus'ab al-Zu-
bayri). Here it is clear that social requirements, tribal conflicts, 
and political divisions among the tribes were the factors which 
stimulated interest. These studies provided for the notables of 
the tribes what the tabaqat works provided for the scholars of 
hadith, although to a much lesser extent from the standpoint 
of actual material produced. The controversy and cultural con­
flict with the Shu'ublya, on the one hand, and the ever-broad-
ening ranks of the mawalt, on the other, led genealogists and 
philologists to broaden the scope of their studies and com­
pelled them to emphasize the unity of Arab cultural history 
and the interrelationship of its various periods. The sources 
primarily used by genealogists and philologists were poetry 
and tribal accounts of events or subjects mentioned in poetry, 
or those which cited poetry in their texts to confirm their 
authenticity. Their studies were thus intermingled or inter­
related with those in the field of historical studies. 

Genealogical studies began within the limits of a single tribe. 
Then in the second century A.H. there appeared genealogists 
who collected tribal accounts and narratives from the geneal­
ogists of the various tribes and from poetry, particularly the 
naqaid, or polemic verse. Representative of these scholars 
were Muhammad ibn al-Sa'ib al-Kalbl (d. 146/763) and Abu 
I-Yaqzan al-Nassaba (d. 190/804). In the same period, phi­
lologists and grammarians began to gather Arabic poetry from 
tribal "books" and from the ruwat. Some limited their interest 
to genealogy and grammar, but others devoted wide-ranging 
attention to the field of Arab history in their studies (e.g., the 
works of Hisham ibn Muhammad al-Kalbl and Abu tUbayda 
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Ma'mar ibn al-Muthanna). Here again we find that the trend 
moved from giving an account without isnad, to an effort to 
mention some of the ruwat, to full establishment of the isrnd 
as a critical tool. Hisham ibn Muhammad ibn al-Sa'ib al-Kalbi, 
for example, gives reports from persons of the ahl al-kitab, 
from Ibn AbI Salih on the history of the prophets, from trans­
lations and registers in al-Hira, and from qisas on the history 
of the Persians and the Arab tribes, while relying on the elders 
(:mashayikh) of Kufa, Abu Mikhnaf, and tAwana for Islamic 
history. Abu 'Ubayda cites reports from his mentors Abu cAmr 
ibn al-'Ala', al-Akhfash, tIsa ibn cUmar al-Thaqafi, and Yu-
nus ibn Habib, as well as from Hisham ibn cUrwa, Wakic, 
and a number of eloquent bedouins.26 

There is a historical conception emerging behind these 
studies, the idea of the cultural continuity (in the sense of 
cultural unity) of Arab history and the important bearing it 
had on contemporary issues, particularly the claims of the Arab 
tribal aristocracy, the relationship between Quraysh and the 
other Arab tribes, the Arab attitude towards the mawali, and 
problems pertaining to the linguistic heritage and Arabic lit­
erature. These great questions broadened the horizons of the 
genealogists and philologists to include the history of other 
peoples prior to Islam. Hisham ibn al-Kalbi studied the his­
tory of the prophets and Persian history as it related to Arab 
history, while Abu cUbayda referred back to Persian narra­
tives (among his works are a Kitab akhbar al-furs, "Narratives 
on the Persians," and a Kitab al-mawali, "Book of the [non-
Arab] Clients fof the Arab Tribes]"). 

Political issues are also reflected to a certain extent in their 
writings. We find something of an inclination towards the 

26 Naqa td Jarir wa-l-Farazdaq, I, 30, 487; Abu tUbayda, Majaz Ol-Quran1 

edited by Muhammad Fu'ad Sazgin (Cairo, 1954-62), I, 400; al-Khatib al-
Baghdadi, Ta'rikh Baghdad, XIII, 252; Ibn Khallikan, Wafayat al-a'yan, II, 
138 ['Abbas ed., V, 235]; al-Suyuti, Muzhir, II, 40If. 
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'Alids in Hisham ibn al-Kalbi; Abu eUbayda, based on what 
we find in the Nnqa id, adheres to the orientation of the 
Shu'ubiya and betrays a tendency to expose Arab faults in a 
way which is not explained by the fact that he was a Khari-
jite.27 

By the dawn of the third century A.H., historical studies had 
reached a stage which led to the emergence of the great his­
torians of that century, for in the "books" which they com­
posed, the akhbariyiin, philologists, and genealogists defined 
the scope of historical study, and their own researches encom­
passed many diverse aspects of the discipline. It was in these 
studies that the concept of the unity of Islamic history emerged, 
and the idea probably took form as a historical study, with a 
strict chronological sequence, in al-Haytham ibn 'Adi's work, 
Kitab al-ta'rikh 'aid l-sintn, "History According to the Years." 
It was also in these works that the genealogical perspective of 
study developed into a historical perspective set within a ge­
nealogical framework, as in the Nasab Quraysh of al-Zubayri 
(d. ca. 233-36/844-50), and more clearly in design and scope 
in the Ta'rikh al-ashraf al-kabir of al-Haytham ibn tAdI. The 
idea of universal history also emerged, and thus Hisham ibn 
al-Kalbi covered the history of the prophets and of the north­
ern and southern Arabs prior to Islam, in addition to Islamic 
history. 

From the standpoint of methodology, attention to the isnad 
increased and some scholars began to report varying accounts 
on the same point or subject, as was the case with al-Mada'ini 
and Abu tUbayda. We also note the inclination towards use 
of written sources along with oral accounts in the works of 
al-Mada'ini, Abu tUbayda, and Hisham ibn al-Kalbi. These 
authors quoted from the works of the generation of Abu 
Mikhnaf, tAwana, Muhammad ibn al-Sa'ib al-Kalbi, and Abu 
tAmr ibn al-'Ala'. 

27 See Ghannawl, Naqa id, p. 146. 
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The third century A.H. witnessed a new phase of cultural 
development. Enormous numbers of historical accounts trans­
mitted or written down in various regions were accumulating, 
and this was the era of the rihlafi talab al-'ilm, "journey in 
search of learning," a movement initiated by hadith scholars 
to collect and classify hadith materials. The contacts made in 
the course of such travels led to reciprocal influences on mat­
ters of method and historical perspective. Use of the isnad 

henceforth became widespread and more firmly established than 
before, and the rules pertaining to it were more strictiy de­
fined. In addition, informed opinion among scholars and his­
torians was beginning to formulate definitive judgments on 
the value of previous works and the extent to which one could 
trust their authors. This was a development which enormously 
facilitated the task of collecting and criticizing accounts, and 
produced more accurate results. 

When the historians of the third century appeared—al-Ba-
IadhurI (d. 279/892), al-Ya'qubi (d. 284/897), al-Dinawari 
(d. 282/898), Ibn Qutayba (d. 270/882), and al-Tabari (d. 
310/923)—they wrote continuous histories of the Islamic 
community which differed from the "monographs" which 
preceded them. Here it will suffice for us to make some gen­
eral observations on these works. 

The historical concepts underlying the writings of these 
scholars were the unity and continuity of the experiences of 
the umma, and the universal vision of history. Al-Baladhuri 
represents the first concept, the other historians the second. 
Their motives for writing history varied. Al-Baladhuri wrote 
his history, the Ansab al-ashraf, or "Genealogies of the No­
tables," as a work woven around the Arab tribal aristocracy, 
and in so doing indicated the focus of importance in his view, 
and likewise stressed an Arab view of society. His Futuh al-

buldm, "Conquests of the Nations," expresses the fundamen­
tal mission of the Islamic community—the jihad—and fills cer­
tain juridical and administrative needs. Al-Ya'qubi wrote a 
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universal history not devoid of ShfI tendencies, and accorded 
pre-Islamic history a spiritual and cultural significance. Ibn 
Qutayba had in mind the class of secretaries (kuttab) and their 
need for a concise, comprehensive history in which numerous 
approaches were synthesized—those of the ayyam, universal 
history, and juridical considerations. Al-Dinawari, meanwhile, 
sought to demonstrate the role of Iraq and Iran in his univer­
sal history, and in doing so found justification for this ap­
proach in the history of the Sasanian and tAbbasid periods. 
As for al-Tabari, he sought to elucidate the will of God in his 
history, and to make the work a guide, complementary to his 
great Qur'an commentary, to the activities of the umma. 

In this century we find the critical method of the hadith 
scholars becoming more thoroughly applied. Al-Tabari was a 
hadith scholar who strictly adhered to the method of his peers, 
as is apparent from his emphasis on isnads and his aversion to 
criticism of the substance of accounts. Ibn Qutayba criticizes 
his sources to the extent of referring back to the Torah in 
order to verify the material Wahb ibn Munabbih offers on the 
beginning of Creation and the prophets, and takes from his 
sources only what could be verified as accurate. Al-Ya'qubl 
maintains a critical attitude towards his sources, especially those 
pertaining to pre-Islamic times; he scrutinizes the sources for 
the Islamic period as well, but considers it sufficient to refer 
to them in his introduction since their chains of authorities 
are already well known. Al-Baladhuri follows a middle course, 
quoting earlier historians and naming them in each instance, 
but as their chains of authorities are well known, omitting the 
isnad except in instances where providing one seemed neces­
sary. 

Al-Baladhuri and al-Tabari both provide divergent accounts 
on the same subject, and there is litde in them and in the other 
historians that is partisan or prejudicial. Likewise, the way 
these two authors compare the materials offered by earlier his-
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torians is of great assistance in providing a balanced picture 
of events. 

These historians undertook special wide-ranging studies on 
historical, geographical, and literary topics, added their work 
to the legacy of the akhbariyiin, and used written materials 
(after reading them to a teacher, or shaykh) along with oral 
accounts. At times they also consulted documents and official 
registers. In their histories they synthesized the approaches of 
the genealogists, akhbariyun, and philologists, and also de­
rived great benefit from the school of Medina. The emergence 
of these historians signaled the end of the phase of the akh-
b&tiyiin, for it was they who laid down the lines for historical 
writing among the Arabs, and consolidating their views and 
conceptions of history. 



CHAPTER FIVE 

Motives for the Writing of History 

and the Historical Views Embodied in 

the Works of the First Historians 

The factors which led to the writing of history among the 
Arabs are related to cultural developments on the one hand, 
and to general currents and perspectives in Arab society on 
the other. 

Originally we find that the pre-Islamic Arab interest in ayyam 
and genealogies, as well as their prose and verse accounts per­
taining to these subjects, were closely associated with the so­
cial views predominant among them on hasab and nasab. As 
one might expect, these accounts, in keeping with the pre­
vailing cultural order, were oral ones. Qisas and akbbar, trans­
mitted as the collective property of the family or tribe, were 
in general circulation in the social milieu and were not the 
exclusive work of particular individuals. Such narratives were 
a part of general culture, and the concerns which they repre­
sented continued to endure after the rise of Islam. 

Islam set forth the idea of the wmma, or community, a con­
cept which took root in Medina and then gradually began to 
establish itself in Iraq. Islam also motivated the tribes to settle 
in the garrison towns and encouraged the introduction of basic 
literary skills into cultural life. 

Historical studies among the Arabs began in two independ­
ent schools, the Iraqi school in Kufa and Basra and the Hijaz 
school in Medina. For each there were factors contributing to 
its rise and growth, and both had their own views of history. 
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In Iraq, the following factors were responsible for the rise 
of historical studies. The ancient interest in the exploits and 
splendid military achievements of the tribes continued into 
Islamic times, and gradually there emerged among the tribes 
a partisan spirit, or 'asabiya,, for the province in which they 
had settled, a sentiment which manifested itself in their feel­
ings of loyalty to these centers. This was closely linked to the 
question of the Islamic conquest and the insistence of the tribes 
on maintaining their right to benefit from the revenues of the 
countries they had conquered, or more simply put, the pre­
rogatives of the Iraqi tribes in Iraq. Likewise, this partisan 
spirit was related to the feeling of the people of Iraq, who 
held the leadership of the Islamic world in the time of the 
fourth caliph, that they were more worthy of preeminence 
than others. 

There was also the question of the imamate, or the cal­
iphate, and the emergence of political factions. Thus we find 
that many Iraqis felt, for historical reasons, that the Iraqi cause 
was related to that of the tAlids. Also at issue was the concept 
of the state, or the sense of state in the form instituted and 
advocated by the Umayyads, and opposed by the provinces 
and the tribes. And also involved was the clash between the 
principle of qadar, or freedom of the will and human respon­
sibility in public affairs, and the principle of jabr, or accept­
ance of prevailing public circumstances as foreordained by God. 
The Umayyads embraced and advocated the principle of jabr, 
while the opposition factions proclaimed the principle of free­
dom and the responsibility of man for the prevailing state of 
affairs. 

On the other hand, there took shape among the Arabs an 
awareness of their own importance and a realization that in 
Islam they were participants in a universal mission. This 
awareness was related to the establishment of the Arab Islamic 
empire and had an influence on the Arab attitude towards the 
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mawali. Moreover, the concept of the umma exerted its own 
influence in causing the interest in akbbar and qisas to tran­
scend the limits of the tribe to include society as a whole, and 
in this way opened the door to historical study. In like man­
ner, the sympathies and interests of the Iraqis, opposed to the 
Umayyad political order, comprised another factor affecting 
the path historical study would follow. All of these issues 
manifested themselves in the study of history, and the role 
they played appears in the concern over such events as the 
Ridda, the conquests, the shum, the fitna, and such related 
events as the battles of the Camel and Siffin. 

The works of the akhbariyun, the first historians in Iraq, 
articulated the prevailing views in Iraq on the issues men­
tioned above. We find Sayf ibn 'Umar dealing with the Ridda 
and the conquests in this manner. His narratives on the con­
quests proclaim the glorious deeds of the tribes in a way which 
to a great extent obscures their role in the Ridda, and simi­
larly, the image he proffers of the Ridda is, as one might 
expect, not a dark one. Abu Mikhnaf covered the Ridda, the 
conquests, the shiim, the fitna, Siffin, and then the affairs of 
Iraq up to the end of the Umayyad era. Devotion to Iraq (or 
partisan spirit for the province) is reflected in his akbbar; like­
wise, he proclaims the justice of cAlfs cause and places 
Mu'awiya and his followers in the wrong. He links the cause 
of tAli to that of Iraq and considers them one, but does this 
without associating himself with the 'Alid faction.1 Similarly, 
he highlights the glorious deeds of the tribes in his narratives 
on the conquests and Siffin. Nasr ibn Muzahim offers a Shi'I 
approach in his Siffin. The factional influence is clearly evident 
in his narratives, and he unequivocally asserts the boastful deeds 
of the tribes. 

'Awana ibn al-Hakam was probably 'Uthmani in his sym-

1 See the example cited on p. 142, n. 11 above. 
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pathies, i.e., he stood closer to the Umayyads. We see him 

setting forth Umayyad accounts, and find him displaying a 

certain indulgence even with Yazld, concerning whom he quotes 

the statement of Sukayna, "We never saw a disbeliever in God 

better than Yazid."2 Although he cites the judgment of Jabir 

ibn tAbd Allah deeming the pledge of fealty sworn to 
Mu'awiya to have been a "mistaken oath of allegiance," he 

presents the struggle during the fitna as a conflict between the 

"faction" (shi'a) of tUthman and the "faction" of tAli. tAwana 

gives free rein in his akhbar to the Umayyad point of view by 

emphasizing fate and divine decree. He cites an account relat­
ing how Yazid ibn Mu'awiya addressed tAli ibn al-Husayn, 
a survivor of the tragedy of Karbala', and explained to him 
that his father had not heeded the Qur'anic verse, "Say: Ό 
God, dominion is thine. Thou givest dominion to whomever 
thou wiliest, and seizest dominion from whomever thou wili­
est. Good is in your hand, and indeed, thou art powerful over 
every thing.' "3 

At any rate, the akhbimyun generally stressed human re­
sponsibility for the course of events and did not approve of 
the concept of jabr in public affairs. In the narratives on the 
Tawwabun we find a powerful illustration of this perspective. 
Moreover, the concept of the state as the Umayyads tried to 
consolidate it, and the stress laid on obedience and loyalty to 
its ruling head, found no endorsement in the monographs of 
the akhbAriyiin. Instead, we find sympathy in their works for 
the revolutions and uprisings, or at the very least, an interpre­
tation favorable to them. Also reflected in these works are 
suspicion of the Quraysh and jealousy of their prestigious po­
sition and the special privileges they enjoyed.4 We note that 

2 Al-Tabari, Ta'rtkh, II, 381. 
iIbid. [citing Surat Al 'Imran (III), 26]. 
4 See al-Tabari, Ta'rtkh, II, 1955-56: "Quraysh will not tolerate this or 

anything like it, for they are jealous folk . . . they are a perfidious people." 
[The reference is misprinted here and could not be traced in the history of 
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the contempt of the tribes for the mawali is conspicuous in 
some writings, and find a clear example of this in the narra­
tives on the revolt of al-Mukhtar. 

By the end of the second century A.H., we can perceive 
other developments. The conflict between the Arabs and the 
mawali, friction between the Muslims and the non-Muslim 
communities under their suzerainty (abl al-dbimma), the claims 
of the Arab aristocracy, and the relationship between the Qu-
raysh and the other tribes—all of these exerted their influence 
on historical writing. It was at this time too that the concept 
of cultural continuity in Arab history emerged. Moreover, the 
gradually increasing importance of the ijma in a general sense, 
in contrast to its earlier signification of the consensus of the 
people of one particular province, provided scope for the 
expression in practice of the concept of the collective experi­
ences of the umma and the essential unity of these experiences. 

Against this background, we find al-Mada'ini ranging over 
the entire field of Arab history—political, social, and cul­
tural—both before and after the rise of Islam. Hisham ibn 
Muhammad al-Kalbi referred back to the history of the prophets 
and discussed Persian history, the history of the Arabs—both 
northern and southern—in pre-Islamic times, and then Islamic 
history, giving expression to the general concept of the uni­
tary and integrative nature of history. Abu rUbayda consulted 
Persian narratives and wrote books with such tides as Akhbar 
al-jurs, "Narratives on the Persians," and Kitab al-mawali, "Book 
of the [non-Arab] Clients [of the Arab Tribes]." Here we find 
him clearly influenced by the trend of the mawali. Al-Hay-
tham ibn tAdI wrote Al-Tankh 'aid l-sinin, "History Ac­
cording to the Years," and in this way stressed the idea of the 
unity of the umma's experiences. His work Kitab al-ashraf al-

al-Tabari. For a similar view of Quraysh, see al-Mubarrad, Al-Kamilfi l-lugha 
wa-l-adab, edited by Muhammad Abu I-Fadl Ibrahim (Cairo, 1376/1956), 
III, 165.] 
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kabtr, "Great Book of the Notables," expresses the attitude of 
the Arab aristocracy towards its privileged position in Islamic 
society, as well as the idea of cultural unity in Arab history. 

We also notice that Israiliyat and Persian accounts are not 
to be found in the works of the first generation of akbbariyun. 
They managed to creep in later on with the help of their trans­
mitters and advocates. Similarly, we find that practical prob­
lems and cultural developments had an effect on historical ideas 
and broadened their horizons. 

Turning to Medina, we perceive two factors influencing his­
torical studies: firstly, the study of the hadith and sunna of the 
Prophet, and secondly, the principle of ijma, which at first 
was only regional (i.e., the ijma' of Medina) and then became 
more widespread in later times. This led to the study of the 
biography of the Prophet and the lives of his followers, and 
to the study of the Rashidun caliphs, the issues of the shura, 
the collection of the Qur'an, and thcfitna, and perhaps some 
of the points pertaining to the early Umayyads. 

Studies on the subject of the mubtada', or the history of 
Creation and the ancient prophets, relied primarily on the books 
and lore of the ahl al-kitab. This was a subject foreign to his­
torical study; it insinuated itself into the field through the 
influence of Wahb ibn Munabbih, primarily on Ibn Ishaq, and 
comprised an element of exotica which did not meet with 
approval in the school of Medina. If Ibn Ishaq discussed the 
mubtada\ al-Waqidl, a contemporary of al-Mada'inl and Hi-
sham ibn Muhammad al-Kalbi, disregarded it and instead placed 
emphasis on the idea of the unity and integration of the ex­
periences of the umma. 

The third century A.H. witnessed a reciprocal exchange of 
influence between the schools and provinces of historical ideas, 
approaches, and methods, particularly by means of the rihla fi 
talab al-'Um, "journey in search of learning." In like manner, 
fundamental Islamic concepts which made an impression on 
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historical writing became predominant in the various prov­
inces after already having gained ascendancy in Medina. 

It is at this point that we find the concept of the integration 
of all prophethood and the unity of prophetic mission finally 
established among historians. We sense the influence of the 
'Abbasid movement on historical writers, noting that the 
movement embodied the ascendancy of the Islamic current 
over that of the tribes. Moreover, the Shu'ubiya movement 
contributed to the emphasis placed on the cultural continuity 
and unity of Arab history, and the Arab aristocracy, having 
now to share political power with the mawali, felt the need to 
justify its position. Similarly, the Persians became increasingly 
more aware of their strength after the 'Abbasid victory. The 
ijma became a general consensus, and the principle of free 
will and free choice gradually receded in both the political and 
the cultural spheres. Finally, the stage of historical studies shifted 
from the centers of the provinces to the great capital of the 
caliphate, Baghdad. 

All of these factors and perspectives found expression in the 
works of the third-century historians. In this survey it will 
suffice to give a provisional general view of some of these 
writers. In \ns Ansab al-ashmfi, al-Baladhuri expresses the idea 
of the continuity of Arab history, weaving the threads of his 
narratives around the Arab notables, and in this way indicat­
ing the focus of attention and importance in this history and 
vigorously asserting the social attitude of the Arab aristocracy. 
His Futiih al-buldan asserts the mission of the Arabs in Islam 
and their historical role—this in addition to the assistance it 
provides for resolving juridical and administrative problems. 

Al-Ya'qubi wrote a general history, the first part of which 
covers universal history up through the pre-Islamic period and 
gives this historical era a spiritual and cultural significance. 
His sympathies seem to be Shi'i, and likewise, the influence 
of his job as a secretary appears in the second part of his 
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history, which he apparently composed to make the book more 
useful. 

Ibn Qutayba synthesizes two historical concepts in his book 
Al-Ma 'anf. that of universal history and that of cultural unity 
in Arab history. He does this to fill the need of the secretarial 
class for a comprehensive history, and also to confront the 
Shu'ublva movement in the cultural sphere. Al-Dinawari wrote 
AlAkhbar al-tiwiil, a universal history stressing the role of both 
the Arabs and the Persians in history, and offered an expla­
nation in historical terms for the participation of both Arabs 
and Persians in political power in the 'Abbasid era. 

Lastly, it was al-Tabari who established in final form the 
hadith scholars' approach to the writing of history. He as­
serted the idea of the integration of all prophetic missions in 
history, and also the idea of the unity of the umma?s experi­
ences (or the ijma). History for al-Tabari was an expression 
of divine will and he wrote it accordingly. His history is thus 
the counterpart to his Qur'an commentary: just as the latter 
elucidates the will of God through His words, the former elu­
cidates the will of God through the activities of mankind. 
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Iraqi, 46, 63, 69; Kufan, 44, 
143; Medinan, 43, 44, 46, 49, 
62, 63, 66, 69, 143; oral trans-
mission of, 18, 19, 23, 32, 35, 
36, 53, 54n, 60, 63, 68, 72, 92, 
124, 137, 138, 145, 148, 149, 
151; Persian, 17, 59, 69, 156, 
157; regional, 56, 62, 144, 149; 
Syrian/Umayyad, 63, 142, 143; 
tribal, 18, 19, 43, 44, 46, 50, 51, 
56, 143, 144, 146, 147; written 
transmission of, 18, 19, 24, 25, 
27, 29, 33, 35, 36, 52, 54n, 57, 
60, 63, 68, 72, 96-97, 119-20, 
124, 137, 138, 139, 145, 148, 
149, 151; Yemenite, 16, 17, 31, 
34. See also documents, isnad, po-
etry 

historical school of Iraq, 10, 136-
51; accounts of, as collective 
property of a family or tribe, 42, 
138, 139; as center for tribal per-
spective of historical writing, 22, 
42, 60, 73, 136-37; influenced by 
critical method of hadith scholars, 
60-61, 144; motives for works of 
the, 153-57; origins of, 41-43, 
60, 136-37, 137-39, 152. See 
also akhbariyun, genealogy, phil-
ology 

historical school of Medina, 10, 23, 
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historical school of Medina (cent.) 
27, 30, 32, 34, 36, 38, 39, 95, 
114, 120, 121, 123, 133, 151, 
152; as center for Islamic per­
spective of historical writing, 22, 
60, 72, 73, 136, 137, 152; col­
lective studies of, 26, 38, 39, 76; 
development of, 40-41; its con­
vergence with the akhbariyiin, 39; 
its emphasis on the isnad, 137; its 
viewpoint on the fitna, 114-15; 
on early Islamic history, 116; mo­
tives for works of the, 157; origins 
of, 76, 136-37. See also 'Urwa ibn 
al-Zubayr, al-Znhri 

historical writing: administrative 
factors in, 29, 50, 60, 64, 74, 
116, 149; 'Alid tendencies in, 
39, 44, 47, 63, 66, 142, 148; 
and the Israiliyat^ 21, 30, 31, 
32, 34, 69, 113, 121, 122, 128, 
157; concept of continuity and 
unity in, 64, 73, 140, 147, 148, 
149, 156, 157, 158, 159; connec­
tions with Qur'anic exegesis, 26, 
29, 34, 35, 38, 79, 82, 83, 85, 
92-93, 101-102, 104-105, 110, 
111-12, 119, 126, 128; cultural 
factors in, 12, 48, 51, 57-58, 60, 
61, 65, 67, 72, 95, 136, 139, 
146, 149, 152; element of exag­
geration in, 30, 33, 35, 41, 94, 
135, 137; influence of qisas lore 
on, 23-24, 28, 30, 31, 33, 34, 
35, 38, 39, 47, 52, 112-13, 121, 
122, 131, 135, 137, 144, 147, 
154; influence of the ayyam on, 
20, 22, 31, 32, 45, 46, 48, 56, 
68, 72, 131, 133, 137, 144, 145, 
150, 152; Islamic perspective of, 
22, 43, 60, 61, 72, 118, 136, 
137, 158; links with belles-lettres, 
13; origins of, 29, 40-41, 72, 76, 
136-37, 152-54; political factors 

in, 13, 35, 36, 41, 60, 72, 74, 
116, 146, 147-48, 153; pre-Is-
lamic background of, 14-18; re­
lated to and influenced by hadith 
studies, 12-13, 23, 24, 25, 28, 
30, 32, 33, 34, 35, 39, 40-41, 
49, 51, 60-61, 69, 72, 94, 95, 
111, 112, 135, 144, 157; Shi'i 
tendencies in, 36, 47, 51, 66, 
150, 154, 158; social factors in, 
22, 29-30, 41, 50, 60, 72, 74, 
95, 146, 156; the umma as a con­
cept and topic of interest in, 26, 
28, 29, 41, 61, 64, 67, 70, 72, 
73, 74, 75, 94, 114, 116, 121, 
140,141, 149, 150, 152, 154, 
156, 157, 159; tribal perspective 
of, 22, 41, 43, 46, 53, 60, 61, 
72, 136, 140 

history: limited sense of, in Persian 
literary works, 60; in pre-Islamic 
Arabia, 15, 17, 18, 19, 136; no­
tion of, in Islam, 20-22, 74, 94; 
Persian and Iranian, 52, 53n, 57, 
58-60, 64, 65, 69, 150, 156; re­
gional, 53, 71, 72, 73; universal, 
conception of, 21, 32, 37, 41, 
61, 64, 65, 68, 73, 148, 149, 
150, 158, 159 

Hud, 124n, 131n 
al-Hudaybiya, 86, 87, 90-91, 91, 

92, 106-107, 108, 112 
Hujr ibn 'AdI, 47, 142 
Hunayn, 87, 88, 91, 108 
al-Husayn ibn 'All, 47, 141, 142 

Ibn 'Abd al-Hakam, 71 
Ibn 'Abd Rabbih, 19 
Ibn Abi l-'Awja' al-Sulaml, 107n 
Ibn Abi I-Hadid, 48 
Ibn Abi Hunayda, 92 
Ibn AbI 1-Huqayq, 104 
Ibn AbI Salih, 140, 147 
Ibn AbI Tahir Tayfur, 71 
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Ibn al-Ash'ath, 118 
Ibn al-Athlr, 19 
Ibn al-Dughunna, 81 
Ibn al-Hadraml, 84 
Ibn Hisham, 7, 36, 78, 130 
Ibn Hubayra, 67 
Ibn Ishaq, Muhammad, 7, 8, 25, 

27, 37, 38, 39, 47, 49, 66, 68, 
99, 127, 132, 134, 137, 140, 
157; and the abl al-kitab, 34, 35; 
attitude of other historians to­
ward, 35, 36, 39; citation of ge­
nealogies by, 35; citation of 
Quran by, 35; critical attitude 
of, 35-36; exaggerating tendency 
of, 33, 35; his attitude toward 
qadar, 36; influence of the qisas 
on, 32, 33, 34, 35, 121, 157; ' 
ShfI tendencies of, 36; sources 
of, 34, 36; use of poetry by, 34, 
35, 36; use of the isnad by, 34-
35, 35-36; use of the IsrailtyM 
by, 34, 121; works of, 33, 36 

Ibn Ka'b ibn Malik, 97n 
Ibn al-Kalbi, Hisham ibn Muham­

mad, 7, 15n, 46, 52, 66, 68, 146, 
148, 156, 157; sources of, 52, 
140, 147; use of qisas by, 52, 
147; works of, 51-52 

Ibn Kathlr, 7, 8, 25, 33 
Ibn al-Muqaffa', 58 
Ibn al-Nadlm, 56, 57, 126 
Ibn Qutayba, 19, 31, 56, 77, 126, 

127, 128, 130, 134, 149, 150; 
critical attitude of, 68, 126, 150; 
his consultation of the Old Testa­
ment, 68, 126; sources of, 68; 
works of, 67-68, 74, 159 

Ibn Sa'd, Muhammad, 7, 39, 77, 
126; his contribution to the 
structure of the sira, 40 

Ibn Sayyid al-Nas, 7, 8, 25, 33, 99 
Ibn al-Zubayr, see 1Abd Allah ibn 

al-Zubayr 

Ibrahim ibn al-Ashtar, 54n 
Ibrahim ibn Sa'd, 98, 99 
Ibrahim ibn al-Walld, 54n 
Idris, 124n 
al-cIjlI, 78 
ijma (consensus): its relation to 

historical writing, 21, 41, 61, 72, 
73, 74, 116, 156, 157; of a local 
area, 156, 157; of the umma, 21, 
156, 157, 158,159 

'Um (formal religious learning), 
111, 120; contrasted with ra'y, 
40-41, 73 

Ima' ibn Rahda, 104 
inscriptions, 14-15, 126 
Iram, 130 
Iraq: conquest of, 39, 43, 46, 142, 

153; government registers in, 43; 
historical writing in, 19, 44, 140; 
history of, 44, 45, 69, 141, 143, 
150, 154; study of sira in, 40. See 
also Basra, conquests, historical 
school of Iraq, Kufa 

'Isa ibn 'Umar al-Thaqafl, 147 
Isaac, 100, 128 
al-Isfahanl, Abu 1-Faraj, 19, 56 
Ishmael, 100, 130 
Ismail ibn 'Abd al-Karim ibn 

'Abd al-Samad, 127 
isnad (chain of authorities), 23, 31; 

as a critical tool, 23, 29, 35, 69, 
73, 75, 137, 147, 149, 150; bro­
ken, 145; collective, 29, 36, 38, 
63, 102, 103, 105, 106, 107n, 
108, 110, 111; criticism of, 39, 
70, 73, 145; use of, by historians, 
25, 29, 33, 34-35, 38, 44, 46, 
48, 54, 62, 63, 65, 69, 83, 92, 
111, 133, 138, 145, 148, 149 

Israiliyat (tales of the Israelites), 8, 
10,16, 21, 30, 31, 32, 34, 69, 
113, 121, 122, 125, 126, 128, 
157. See also Old Testament, 
prophets, Talmud, Torah 
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Jabir ibn 'Abd Allah, 155 
jabr (divine foreordainment, fatal-

ism), 75; attitude of historians to-
ward, 30, 46, 112, 155; pro-
moted by the Umayyads, 30, 46, 
60, 141, 153; rejected in the 
provinces, 60, 141, 153, 155. See 
also divine will, qadar 

Jacob, 128 
Jahiliya ("Age of Ignorance"), 14, 

20, 53, 56, 136, 141. See also 
Arabia 

al-Jahiz, 56 
Jamharat al-nasab (Ibn al-Kalbl), 

51-52 
Banu Jawn, 89 
Jeremiah, 129 
Jerusalem, 90, 117, 129 
Jesus, 124n, 125, 129 
Jews, 85, 103, 104, 105, 106; tra-

ditions of, their influence on his-
torical writing, 41, 125. See also 
abl al-kitab, al-Nadlr, Qaynuqa', 
Qurayza 

jihad (struggle for the cause of Is-
lam), 149 

al-Ji'rana, 88 
jizya (poll-tax on non-Muslims), 

108, 109 
Job, 100 
Jurash, 108 

Juwayriya bint al-Harith, 86 

Ka'b, 86 
Ka'b al-Ahbar, 7, 31, 100, 113, 

132 
Ka'b ibn al-Ashtar, 104 
Ka'ba, 80n, 81n, 86, 101, 103, 

108, 131 
Kalb, 45, 51, 143 
al-Kalbl, Muhammad ibn al-Sa'ib, 

51, 53, 132, 146, 148 
Karbala', 143, 144, 154 

Khadlja bint Khuwaylid, 76, 79, 
88, 101, 102 

Khadir, 100, 13 In 
Khalid ibn al-Walld, 87, 89, 109 
Khalid al-Qasri, 54n, 113 
Kharijites, 44, 49, 53n, 56, 57, 148 
khatam al-anbiya ("Seal of the 

Prophets"), 21 
Banu Khath'am, 133 
Khaybar, 89, 90, 107, 111 
al-Khazraj, 104 
khitat (residential and administrative 

districts), 53 
Khoday-ndmag, 58-59, 60 
Khuza'a, 87, 88, 106, 108 
Kinana, 86 
Kinda, 44, 89, 102, 109, 111 
al-Kisa'I, 134 
Kitab Baghdad (Ibn Abl Tahir Tay-

fur), 71 
Kitab al-buldan (al-Ya'qubl), 64 
Kitab as-israiliyat (Wahb ibn Mu-

nabbih), 127 
Kitab al-mawali (Abu 'Ubayda), 

57, 147, 156 
Kitab al-muluk al-mutawwaja. . . 

(Wahb ibn Munabbih), 130 
Kitab al-tabaqat (al-Waqidl), 39 
Kitab al-tabaqat al-kabir (Ibn Sa'd), 

39, 40 
Kitab al-ta'rikh ('Awana ibn al-

Hakam), 45 
Kitab al-ta'rikh 'aid l-sinin (al-Hay-

tham ibn 'Adi), 53-54, 148, 156 
Kitab al-tijanfi muluk Himyar wa-l-

Taman (Wahb ibn Munabbih), 
127, 128, 130 

Kufa, 69; activities of the akhbari-
yun in, 42, 43, 44, 45, 46, 47; as 
a center for tribal perspective of 
historical writing, 10, 22, 72, 73, 
136-37, 138; attitude toward jabr 
in, 60; hadith scholars in, 39; his-
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tory of, 46n, 53, 54n, 142. See 
also misr 

kuttab (secretaries), 58, 64, 68, 150 

Lakhmids, see al-Hlra 
Last Supper, 129 
Letter of Simeon, 125 
Lie, Affair of the (hadith al-ifk), 86, 

106 
life-spans, records of, 65, 110, 114, 

115. See also dating 
literary studies, 13, 51, 151 
Banu Lihyan, 106 
Luqman, 31, 131n 

Ma'an, 86 
Al-Ma'arif (Ibn Qutayba), 31, 67-

68, 128, 159 
Al-Mab'ath (Ibn Ishaq), 33 
Al-Mabda' (Wahb ibn Munabbih), 

127 
al-Mada inl, 7, 19, 46, 63, 66, 140, 

156, 157; critical method of, 
145, 148; influenced by hadith 
scholars, 49; sources of, 49, 140; 
use of the isnad by, 48; works of, 
49, 141 

Madyan, 130 
mafukhir (tribal boasts) literature, 

56. See also manaqib, shama'il 
maghazi (military expeditions of the 

Prophet), 23, 24, 94, 97, 99, 
122, 132, 137; as term for entire 
career of the Prophet, 24, 76n; 
connections with hadith studies, 
24-25, 76, 95; links with 
Qur'anic exegesis, 92-93; studies 
on the, 24, 25, 26, 27, 30-31, 
34, 121 

Al-Maghdzi (Ibn Ishaq), 33, 37; 
('Urwa ibn al-Zubayr), 90, 91; 
(Wahb ibn Munabbih), 31, 132, 
133; (al-Waqidl), 7, 37, 39; (al-

Zuhri), 28, 99-110, 113 
al-Mahdl, 54n, 67 
majlis, pi. majalis, 19,42, 45,48,138, 

144 
Malik ibn Anas, 98, 120 
Malik ibn Aws al-Hadathan, 98n 
Ma'mar ibn Rashid, lOOn 
manaqib (merits) literature, 47. See 

also mafakbir, shamatl 
al-Mansur, 54n 
al-MaqdisI, 31 
Ma'qil ibn Munabbih, 127 
Marwan ibn al-Hakam, 54n, 115 
mashahid al-Nabi, 101 
al-Mas udl, 127, 128, 134 
mathalib (tribal faults) literature, 

53n, 56, 57 
mawali (non-Arab Muslims, spec, 

clients of the Arab tribes), 56, 
57, 146, 147, 154, 156, 158 

Mecca, 48, 87, 128; career of the 
Prophet in, 27, 34, 79-82, 92, 
99, 101-103, 110; conquest of, 
28, 87, 91, 108, 111, 133 

Medina (Yathrib), 79, 81, 98, 100, 
115, 116, 117; the Prophet's ca-
reer in, 27, 37, 82-89, 90-91, 92, 
99, 103-11; Qur'anic references 
to, 112. See also historical school 
of Medina, Hijra 

al-Mirbad, 55 
misr, pi. amsdr (garrison town), 22, 

42, 43, 50, 53n, 56, 138. See also 
Basra, Kufa 

Moses, 100, 124n, 129 
Mu'awiya ibn Abl Sufyan, 45, 47, 

48, 50, 115, 117, 142, 154, 155 
al-Mubarrad, 56 
mubtada' (history of Creation and 

ancient prophets), 157 
Al-Mubtada' (Ibn Ishaq), 33, 34, 

35, 36, 37; (Wahb ibn Munab-
bih), 31, 126, 127, 128-29, 133 
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Mubtada al-khalq (Wahb ibn Mu-
nabbih), 127 

al-Mufaddal al-Dabbl, 140 
Muhajirun (Meccans who made the 

Hijra with Muhammad), 103 
Muhammad, the Prophet, 21, 22, 

23, 24, 25, 26-27, 30, 33, 34, 
37, 40, 49, 54n, 69, 72, 79-89, 
90-91, 92, 93, 94, 98, 99-111, 
120, 124n, 157; letters of, 88, 
92, 109. See also sira 

Muhammad ibn 'Abd Allah, 140 
Muhammad ibn Jubayr ibn 

Mut'im, 97n 
Muharib, 143 
al-Mujalid ibn Sa'id, 144 
mukarrib (priest-king), 14 
al-Mukhtar, 47, 156 
mundwala, 120n 
al-Mundhir ibn Sawa, 88 
Banu Murra, 85 
muruvma (bedouin virtue), 18 
Musa al-Kazim, 67 
Musa ibn 'Uqba, 32-33, 97, 121, 

143 
Mus'ab ibn al-Zubayr, 54n, 77, 

90n 
Mus'ab al-Zubayri, 28, 114, 146, 

148; his use of poetry, 53; 
sources of, 52-53; works of, 52-
53 

Muslim ibn 'Aqll, 143 
Banu 1-Mustaliq, 86, 91 
Mu'ta, 86-87, 91 ,107 
Mutammam ibn Nuwayra, 89 
al-Mu'tasim, 49, 68 
Mu'tazila, 74 

Banu 1-Nadir, 105-106, 111 
Najran, 109 
Nakhla, 89 
naqa'id (polemic verse), 50, 51, 

146. See also poetry 

Naqa'id Jarir wa-l-Farazdaq (Abu 
'Ubayda), 148 

nasab (noble family origin), 18, 152 
Al-Nasab al-kabir (Mus'ab al-Zu-

bayri), 52 
Nasab Quraysh (Mus'ab al-Zu-

bayri), 28, 52-53,' 114, 148 
Nasab Quraysh wa-akhbdruhd (al-

Mada'inl), 49 
Nasr ibn Muzahim, 7, 142, 154; as 

first ShI'I aikhbdri, 47; citation of 
speeches by, 48; his negligence in 
matters of dating, 48; influence 
of the ayyam on, 48, 144; use of 
poetry by, 48, 144; use of the is-
nad by, 48; works of, 47 

Nebuchadnezzar, 129 
Negus (of Abyssinia), 80, 93, 102 
Nimrod, 130 
Noah, 100, 124n, 128 
northern Arabs, see Arab tribes 
Numayr, 143 
Nu'aym ibn 'Abd Kulal, 88 

Old Testament: consulted by Ibn 
Qutayba, 68, 126; its relation to 
the Isrd'Uiydt, 31; used by Wahb 
ibn Munabbih, 31, 125. See also 
Isrd'Uiydt, prophets, Psalms, To-
rah 

Pharaoh, 129 
philologists, 19, 40, 42, 51, 54-57, 

139, 145-48, 151; monographs 
of the, 146, 148, 149. See also 
historical school of Iraq 

philosophy, 75 
poetry: as authenticating evidence, 

18, 53, 137, 146; fabrication of, 
8, 16, 31, 34, 35, 36, 48, 144, 
145; role of, in Arab culture, 26, 
72, 93, 113, 132, 137, 138, 152; 
in genealogies, 50; in philology, 
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55, 56, 145; in the ayyam, 18, 
19; use of, by historians, 26, 28, 
34, 35, 38, 42, 45, 46, 48, 93-
94, 113, 133, 138, 144, 145. See 
also ayymn, naqaid 

prophets, historical interest in an­
cient, 52, 68, 69, 71, 100, 124, 
125, 127, 128-29, 130, 147, 
148, 150, 156, 157, See also 
Isra Utyat, Muhammad, qisas al-
anbiya 

Psalms, 124n, 125 

qadar (freedom of the will), 36,41, 
74, 123, 141, 153, 155, 158. See 
also divine will, jabr 

qadt (judge), 118, 123 
al-Qadisiya, Battle of, 26, 90 
al-Qadlya, 107n 
Qararat al-Kudr, 105, 110-11 
Banu Qaynuqa', 85, 90, 92, 104-

105, 111 
qibla (direction of prayer), 103 
qisas, sing, qissa (stories, fables), 30, 

31, 33, 34, 35, 39, 42, 47, 52, 
95, 112, 112-13, 121, 122, 124, 
131,135,137,144,147,152,154. 
See also qissa al-anbiya, qussas, 
Wahb ibn Munabbih 

Qisas al-akhyar (Wahb ibn Munab-
bih), 127 

qisas al-anbiya ("Tales of the 
Prophets"), 28, 34, 130, 134. See 
also Isra Uiycit, prophets, qisas 

Qisas al-anbiya (Wahb ibn Munab-
bih), 127 

Qur an: and the Old Testament, 
31, 125, 128; as a historical 
topic, 25, 28, 90, 114, 156; as a 
motive for study of the past, 21; 
conception of the past in, 20; its 
relation to the Israiliyat, 31; 

study of, 55, 56, 124n. See also 
historical writing 

Quraysh, 28, 35, 49, 53, 76-114 
passim, 133, 139, 147, 155, 156 

Banu Qurayza, 85-86, 90, 91, 106 
Qurra ibn rAbd al-Rahman, 114 
qussas, sing, qass (storytellers), 23, 

30, 41. See also qisas, Wahb ibn 
Munabbih 

al-Raji, 85 
Rashidun ("righdy guided") caliphs, 

26, 28, 37, 43, 45, 63, 66, 73, 
89-90, 114-15, 157. See also Abu 
Bakr, 'Ali ibn AbI Talib, 'Umar 
ibn al-Khattab, 'Uthman ibn 
'Afifan 

ra'y (individual judgment): con­
trasted with ilm, 40-41, 73; 
weakness of, 70, 142 

Ridda ("Apostasy") wars, 26, 39, 
43, 45, 46, 89, 90, 140, 141, 
143 

rihlafi talab al-'ilm (journey in 
search of learning), 61, 149, 157 

riwaya (lecture), 76; (transmitted ac­
count), 142 

ruwat, sing, ram (narrators, trans­
mitters of accounts), 17, 23, 53, 
55, 56, 57, 60, 65, 70, 73, 138, 
139, 143, 144, 145, 146, 147; 
and the akhbariyiin, 42, 47, 139, 
140; as storytellers, 17; reliance 
upon, by early historians, 33, 93, 
137 

al-Sa'b Dhu 1-Qarnayn, 131 
Sa'd ibn Ibrahim, 98, 99 
Sa'd ibn Mu'adh, 86 
sahaba, see Companions of the 

Prophet 
Sa'id ibn al-Musayyab, 96, 97 
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al-Sakhawi, 32, 36, 91, 97, 99, 101, 
126 

sakina, 129 
Salih, 124n 
Samuel, 129 
al-Saq'ab ibn Zuhayr al-Azdl, 144 
Sasanians, 52, 65, 71, 150; paucity 

of information on their history, 
59 

Satan, 80, 84, 100, 113 
Saul, 129 
al-Sawiq, 104 
Sayf ibn 'Umar, 7, 140; attitude of, 

46, 142, 154; influence of qisas 
lore on, 144; influence of the 
ayyam on, 46; sources of, 46-47, 
140, 143, 144; works of, 46. See 
also conquests 

Seth, 124n 
Seven Sleepers, 31, 130 
al-Sha'bl, 44 
shama'U (merits) literature, 40. See 

also mafakhir, mandqib 
sht'a (faction), 155 
ShI'a, Shfism, 36, 47, 51, 66, 

150, 154, 158. See also 'Alids 
Shu'ayb, 130 
shura (deliberative committee that 

elected 'Uthman as caliph), 28, 
43, 63, 114, 154, 157 

Shurahbil ibn Sa'd, 26-27 
Shurayh ibn 'Abd Kulal, 88 
Shu'ublya, 7, 50, 55, 57, 58-60, 

146, 148, 158, 159 
Siffin (Nasr ibn Muzahim), 47, 142, 

144, 154 
Siffin, Battle of, 39, 43, 44, 47, 48, 

115, 141, 142, 143, 154 
sira, pi. siyar (biography), 29, 59; of 

the Prophet, 31, 33, 75, 99, 110, 
122, 133, 135, 140; chapters of, 
in works of al-Mada'inl, 49; char-
acter of, 41; origins of, 30; 
study of, in Medina, 73, 91, 94, 

137, 139; study of, in the prov-
inces, 40, 61, 139. See also histor-
ical school of Medina, Muham-
mad 

Sira (Ibn Hisham), 8; (Ibn Ishaq), 
7, 33, 36, 37, 121 

Sirat Mu'awiya wa-Bani Umayya 
('Awana ibn al-Hakam), 45 

Siyar al-muluk (Ibn al-Muqaffa'), 
58, 59 

Solomon, 129 
southern Arabs, see Arab tribes 
speeches, citation of: by historians, 

45, 48, 66, 114, 145; in the Kho-
day-namag, 59 

state, concept of the, 141, 153, 155 
Suhayl ibn 'Amr, 107 
Sukayna, 155 
Banu Sulaym, 105, 111 
Sulayman ibn 'Abd al-Malik, 24n 
Sulayman ibn 'All al-Hashiml, 66 
sunna, pi. sunan (customary prac-

tice, esp. of the Prophet), 22, 97, 
99, 11 In, 157 

Suraqa ibn Jasham, 103, 113 
Syria, 69, 83, 101; conquest of, 39, 

43, 89; government registers in, 
43; history of, 45, 141; study of 
sira in, 40. See also conquests 

Tabala, 108 
tabaqdt, 39n, 53, 59, 62, 72, 75, 

146 
Tabaqdt al-fuqaha' wa-l-muhaddi-

thin (al-Haytham ibn 'Adl), 53 
al-Tabari, 7, 25, 31, 33, 43, 48, 

54n, 77, 79, 99, 115, 128, 134, 
140, 149; as a hadith scholar, 69, 
150, 159; critical method of, 70, 
142, 150; education of, 69; use 
of the isnad by, 69, 70, 150; 
works of, 70, 71, 125, 127, 128, 
150, 159 

tdbi'un, sing, tabi' (descendants of 
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the Companions), 29, 41, 92, 
111 

Tabuk, 108 
Tafiir (al-Tabari), 125, 127, 128, 

150 
al-Ta if, 80, 87-88, 91 
TaIha ibn al-A'Iam, 140 
Talha ibn 'Ubayd Allah, 66n, 115, 

116 
Talmud, 125. See also IsrailiyAt^ 

Old Testament, Torah 
Tamim, 44, 46, 109, 139, 142, 143 
Ta'rikh (al-Ya'qubl), 64-67 
Ta'rikh al-asbraf al-kabir (al-Hay-

tham ibn 'Adi), 53, 148, 156-57 
Ta'rikh Baghdad, see Kitab Baghdad 
Al-Ta'rikh al-kabir (al-Waqidi), 39 
Ta'rikh al-khulafa' (Ibn Ishaq), 36-

37, 37 
Ta'rikh al-rusul wa-l-mtduk (al-Ta-

bari), 69, 127, 128 
Ta'rikh Wasit (Bahshal), 71 
Tawwabun, 54n, 141, 155 
Tayyi', 44 
al-Tha'alibl, 134 
Thaqtf, 87, 88, 139 
time, notion of: in Islam, 75; in 

tribal society, 20. See also calen­
dar, chronology, dating 

al-Tirimmah, 139 
topography, see geography 
Torah, 128, 150. See also 

Israiliyat, Old Testament, Tal­
mud 

translations: from Greek, 60, 65; 
from Hebrew, 125; from Persian, 
52, 58-60; from Syriac, 60 

'Ubayd Allah ibn 'Abd Allah ibn 
'Utba, 96, 97 

'Ubayd Allah ibn Jahsh, 80 
'Ubayd Allah ibn 'Umar, 120 
'Ubayd Allah ibn Ziyad, 54n 
'Ubayd ibn Sharya, 16, 132 

Ubayy ibn Khalaf1 105 
Uhud, Battle of, 27, 38, 91 
'Umar ibn 'Abd al-'AzIz, 78, 98, 

118, 123 
'Umar ibn al-Khattab, 54n, 89, 90, 

101, 107, 114, 116; establishes 
Hijra calendar, 21; initiates diwan 
system, 21, 114. See also Rashi-
dfln 

'Umayr ibn Wahb, 104 
Umayyads: as topic of historical 

study, 28, 37, 44, 45, 47, 49, 66, 
66n, 141, 154, 157; attitude of 
historians toward, 36, 44, 45, 46, 
47, 60, 78, 118, 119, 141, 142, 
143, 153, 154, 155; promotion 
of jabr by, 30, 46, 60, 141, 153; 
their court library in Damascus, 
119; their interest in genealogy, 
50, 113; their interest in history, 
24, 25, 29, 42, 79, 80, 82, 83, 
87, 88, 89, 91, 92, 94-95, 115, 
117-19 

Umm Qirfa, 106 
Umm Yahya, 76 
umma (the Islamic community), 13, 

26, 28, 29, 41, 61, 64, 67, 70, 
72, 73, 74, 75, 94, 100, 114, 
116, 121, 140, 141, 149, 150, 
152, 154, 156, 157, 159 

'Urwa ibn al-Zubayr, 7, 8, 10, 27, 
30, 34, 96, 97, 11 In, 120, 121, 
137; as a hadith scholar, 78, 91-
92; as founder of maghcizi stud­
ies, 25, 95; citation of Qur'an 
by, 92; critical attitude of, 92, 
93; dating of events by, 86, 90, 
91; did not support doctrine of 
jabr, 30; his maghAzi writings, 
25, 26, 79-89, 90-91; his rela­
tions with the Umayyads, 25, 78, 
80, 82, 83, 87, 88, 89, 91, 92; 
influence of qisas on, 93; life and 
career of, 76-78; not politically 
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'Urwa ibn al-Zubayr (cont.) 
active, 78; on the Rashidun, 89-
90; sources of, 92-93; style of, 
25, 94; use of documents by, 92; 
use of poetry by, 26, 93-94; use 
of the isnad by, 25, 82, 92 

Usama ibn Zayd, 78, 88, 89, 93, 
109, 110 

'Utba ibn Rabi'a, 104 
'Uthman ibn 'Affan, 28, 39, 62, 

114, 115, 116, 122, 141, 155. 
See also Rashidun 

UyAn al-athar (Ibn Sayyid al-Nas), 
7 ,8  

Wahb ibn Munabbih, 7, 8, 10, 16, 
30, 34, 150; as a storyteller, 31, 
121, 122, 124, 131, 133; attitude 
of Medinan scholars toward, 32, 
37, 124, 133, 135, 157; his inter­
est in the Isra 'iliyat, 10, 31, 122, 
125, 125-26, 128; his neglect of 
the isnad, 133; influence of the 
ayyam on, 31, 131, 133; intro­
duced folkloric element into his­
torical writing, 133, 157; life and 
career of, 122-23; not a serious 
historian, 32, 121, 122, 133; on 
the qisas al-anbiya, 130; sources 
of, 124-26; works of, 31, 126-27, 
128-34, later fabrication of, 127 

Waki', 147 
al-Walid ibn 'Abd al-Malik, 92, 

116, 126; his relations with 
'Urwa ibn al-Zubayr, 79, 89, 
with al-Zuhri, 115 

al-Walid ibn YazId (Walxd II), 50 
al-Waqidi, 7, 25, 27, 33, 40, 49, 

62, 63, 66, 68, 96, 99, 112; 
'Alid tendencies of, 39; citation 
of Qur'an by, 38; critical attitude 
of, 37, 38; dating of events by, 
37, 38; his attitude toward qisas, 
38, 39, 157; his attitude toward 

the Isnad1 38; his use of chrono­
logical sequence, 38; not reliant 
upon Ibn Ishaq, 39; sources of, 
37, 38; use of poetry by, 38; 
works of, 37, 39 

Waraqa ibn Nawfal, 79, 93, 102 

al-Yamama, 89 
al-Ya'qubi, 24, 117, 118, 134, 

149; 'Abbasid tendencies of, 66-
67; 'Alid sympathies of, 66, 150, 
158; critical method of, 65, 150; 
dispensed with the isnad, 65, 
150; sources of, 65-66; works of, 
64-67, 158-59 

al-Yarmflk, Battle of, 26, 90 
Yazdagird I, 59 
YazId ibn 'Abd al-Malik, 54n, 118 
Yazid ibn Mu'awiya, 54n, 62, 141, 

155 
Yemen, 15, 16, 37, 52, 69, 88, 

109, 122, 123, 125, 130, 138; 
study of stra in, 40 

Yunus ibn Bukayr al-Shaybanl, 33n, 
36 

Yunus ibn Habib, 55, 147 
Yunus ibn Yazid, 101 

Zanj rebellion, 67 
Zayd ibn 'All, 66 
Zayd ibn al-Haritha, 106 
Ziyad ibn AbI Sufyan, 142 
al-Zubayr ibn al-'Awwam, 26, 66n, 

76, 115, 116 
al-Zubayr ibn Bakkar, 63, 95-96 
Zubayrids, 46n, 66n, 93 
Zufar ibn al-Harith, 54n 
al-Zuhri, 7, 8, 10, 27, 32, 33, 34, 

52, 63, 76, 78, 140; as a hadith 
scholar, 98, 111, 118-19; dating 
of events by, 28, 100, 105, 1ΙΟ­
Ι 1; did not support doctrine of 
jabr, 30, 112; first to provide stra 
with definite structure, 27, 110; 
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his attitude toward poetry, 28, 
113; his attitude toward qisas, 28, 
112-13; his format for the sim, 
27-28; his interest in genealogy, 
28, 110, 113-14; his interest in 
past prophets, 28, 100, 113; his 
Maghazi, 28, 97, 99-110; his re-
lations with the Umayyads, 29, 
113, 115, 117n, 117-19; impor-
tance of, 120-21; life and career 

of, 95-99, 117-18; not affected 
by the ayyarn, 28, 113; sources 
of, 97; strong memory of, 96, 
98; style of, 112; treatment of 
the Rashidun by, 28, 114-15, 
116-17; use of chronological se-
quence by, 28, 110; use of the is-
nad by, 28-29, 102, 103, 105, 
106, 107n, 108, 110, 111 

Zur'a ibn Dhl Yazan, 88 
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